
Water Rates (Amendment) Ordinance 
(No. 3) 1982 

N o . 77 of 1982 

I, THE GOVERNOR-GENERAL of the Commonwealth of Australia, acting 
with the advice of the Federal Executive Council, hereby make the following 
Ordinance under the Seat of Government (Administration) Act 1910. 

Dated 15 September 1982. 

N . M . S T E P H E N 
Governor-General 

By His Excellency's Command, 

MICHAEL HODGMAN 
Minister of State for the Capital Territory 

An Ordinance to amend the Water Rates Ordinance 1959 

Short title 
1. This Ordinance may be cited as the Water Rates (Amendment) 

Ordinance (No. 3) 1982.1 

Principal Ordinance 
2. In this Ordinance, "Principal Ordinance" means the Water Rates 

Ordinance 1959.2 

Alteration of rates 
3. The Principal Ordinance is amended as set out in the following table: 

Provision Amendment 

PART 1 
Paragraph 6 ( 1 ) (a) . . . . Omit "$92", substitute " $ 1 1 8 " 

Paragraph 6 ( 1 ) (b) . . . . Omit "$92", substitute " $ 1 1 8 " 

Sub-section 6 (2) . . . . . Omit "$92", substitute " $ 1 1 8 " 

Sub-section 6 (3) . . . . . Omit "$92", substitute " $ 1 1 8 " 

Section 7 . . Omit "$92", substitute " $ 1 1 8 " 

Paragraph 7 A ( 1 ) (a) . . Omit "$92", substitute " $ 1 1 8 " 

Paragraph 7 B ( 1 ) (a) . . Omit "$92", substitute " $ 1 1 8 " 

Paragraph 7B ( 1 ) (b) . . Omit "$92", substitute " $ 1 1 8 " 

Sub-section 7 B (2) . . . . Omit "$92", substitute " $ 1 1 8 " 

Sub-section 7B (3) . . . . Omit "$92", substitute " $ 1 1 8 " 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



Provision Amendment 

Paragraph 7c (1) (a) . . . Omit "$92", substitute "$ 118" 
Paragraph 7c (1) (b) . . . Omit "$92", substitute "$ 118" 

Sub-section 7c (2) . . . . Omit "$92", substitute "$ 118" 
Sub-section 7c (3) . . . . Omit "$92", substitute "$ 118" 
Section 8 Omit "$92", substitute "$ 118" 

Section 9 Omit "$92", substitute "$ 118" 

Sub-paragraph 14 (1 ) (c) (i) Omit "$92", substitute "$ 118" 

PART 2 
Sub-paragraph 6 (1) (b) (i) Omit "22 cents", substitute "32 cents" 
Sub-paragraph 6 ( 1 ) (b) (ii) Omit " 11 cents", substitute " 16 cents" 
Sub-section 6 ( 3 ) (a) Omit "22 cents", substitute "32 cents" 

(b) Omit "11 cents", substitute "16 cents" 
Paragraph 7A (1) (b) . . . Omit "22 cents", substitute "32 cents" 
Sub-section 7A (3) . . . . Omit "22 cents", substitute "32 cents" 
Paragraph 7B (1) (b) . . Omit " 11 cents", substitute " 16 cents" 
Sub-section 7B (3) . . . Omit" 11 cents", substitute " 16 cents" 
Paragraph 7c (1) (b) . . Omit " 11 cents", substitute " 16 cents" 
Sub-section 7c (3) . . . . Omit" 11 cents", substitute " 16 cents" 
Sub-paragraph 14(1) (c) (ii) Omit "22 cents", substitute "32 cents" 

Application 
4. (1) The amendments of the Principal Ordinance effected by Part 1 of 

the table in section 3 apply to and in relation to rates imposed in respect of the 
rating year that commenced on 1 July 1982 and each subsequent rating year. 

(2) The amendments of the Principal Ordinance effected by Part 2 of the 
table in section 3 apply to and in relation to rates imposed in respect of water 
supplied to a parcel of land in the first meter reading period that ends after 30 
June 1983 and in each subsequent meter reading period. 

NOTES 
1. Notified in the Commonwealth of Australia Gazette on 21 September 1982. 

2. No. 19, 1959 as amended to date. For previous amendments see Note 2 to No. 25, 1982 
and see also Nos. 25 and 67, 1982. 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au


		(02)+61 2 6205 3700
	2009-11-10T13:15:16+1100
	Canberra
	ACT Parliamentary Counsel
	Document is authorised




