
Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au 

 
AUSTRALIAN CAPITAL TERRITORY 

 

Motor Traffic (Amendment) Act 1993 

No. 47 of 1993 

    

TABLE OF PROVISIONS 

 
Section 
 1. Short title 
 2. Commencement 
 3. Principal Act 
 4. Interpretation 
 5. Licences for public motor vehicles 
 6. Insertion— 
 27A. Rights to be granted licences 
 27B. Limitation on number of taxi licences 
 7. Return of certificates after cancellation or suspension 
 8. Interpretation 
 9. Parking infringement notices 
 10. Final notice—non-payment of penalty 
 11. Discharge of liability 
 12. Disputed notices—application to Court for declaration 
 13. Suspension of licences, registration etc. 
 14. Substitution— 
 162EA. Effect of suspension 
 162F. Cancellation of suspension 
 15. Reinstatement of licences, registration etc. 



ii Motor Traffic (Amendment)      No.  47, 1993 

TABLE OF PROVISIONS—continued 

Section 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au 

 16. Substitution— 
 162K. Costs of applications to Court 
 17. Traffic infringement notices 
 18. Final notice—non-payment of penalty 
 19. Discharge of liability 
 20. Disputing liability under traffic infringement notice 
 21. Disputed notices—issue of proceedings 
 22. Suspension of licences, registration etc. 
 23. Substitution— 
 180FA. Effect of suspension 
 180G. Cancellation of suspension 
 24. Reinstatement of licences, registration etc. 
 25. Repeal 
 26. Evidentiary provision 
 27. Applications—how made 
 28. Insertion— 
 180N. Power of delegation 
 29. Suspension or cancellation of driving licence 
 30. Regulations 
 31. Schedule 7 
 32. Further amendments 
 33. Transitional 

SCHEDULE 1 
FURTHER AMENDMENTS 

SCHEDULE 2 
AMENDMENTS OF THE SECOND SCHEDULE 



 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au 

 
AUSTRALIAN CAPITAL TERRITORY 

 

Motor Traffic (Amendment) Act 1993 

No. 47 of 1993 

    

An Act to amend the Motor Traffic Act 1936 and for related 
purposes 

 [Notified in ACT Gazette S165: 27 August 1993] 

 The Legislative Assembly for the Australian Capital Territory enacts as 
follows: 

Short title 

1.  This Act may be cited as the Motor Traffic (Amendment) Act 1993. 

Commencement 

2.  (1)  Section 1 and this section commence on the day on which this 
Act is notified in the Gazette. 

(2)  The remaining provisions commence on a day, or respective days, 
fixed by the Minister by notice in the Gazette. 

(3)  If a provision referred to in subsection (2) has not commenced 
before the end of the period of 6 months commencing on the day on which 
this Act is notified in the Gazette, that provision, by force of this 
subsection, commences on the first day after the end of that period. 

Principal Act 

3.  In this Act, “Principal Act” means the Motor Traffic Act 1936.1 



2 Motor Traffic (Amendment)      No.  47, 1993 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au 

Interpretation 

4.  Section 4 of the Principal Act is amended— 

 (a) by omitting from subsection (1) the definition of “Police Force”; 

 (b) by inserting in subsection (1) the following definitions: 

“ ‘chief police officer’ means the police officer who is 
responsible to the Commissioner of Police for the 
day-to-day administration and control of police services 
in the Territory; 

‘Police Force’ means the Australian Federal Police;”; and 

 (c) by adding at the end the following subsections: 

“(10)  For the purposes of Parts X and XIA, the administrative 
charge is $25 or such other charge as the Minister, by instrument, 
determines. 

“(11)  A determination under subsection (10) is a disallowable 
instrument for the purposes of section 10 of the Subordinate Laws 
Act 1989.”. 

Licences for public motor vehicles 

5.  Section 27 of the Principal Act is amended— 

 (a) by inserting after subsection (1) the following subsection: 

“(1A)  The Minister shall not determine a fee under 
paragraph (1) (a) in respect of a licence for which he or she has 
determined a reserved price under subsection 27A (2) unless the 
licence has been passed in at auction because bidding in respect of 
it did not reach that price.”; and 

 (b) by renumbering subsection (1A) (second occurring) as 
subsection (1B). 

Insertion  

6.  After section 27 of the Principal Act the following sections are 
inserted: 

Rights to be granted licences 

“27A.  (1)  The Registrar may, on behalf of the Territory, auction a 
defined right. 

“(2)  The Minister shall determine a reserved price in respect of a 
defined right. 



 Motor Traffic (Amendment)      No.  47, 1993 3 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au 

“(3)  The Registrar shall not auction a defined right in respect of a 
particular licence if the Minister has determined a fee in respect of that 
licence under paragraph 27 (1) (a). 

“(4)  A defined right exists for a period of 28 days commencing on the 
expiration of the day on which that right was auctioned. 

“(5)  Where, before the expiration of a defined right— 

 (a) its purchaser applies to the Registrar for an extension of the term 
of that right; and 

 (b) the application is accompanied by the determined fee; 

the Registrar may, by notice in writing, extend or further extend the term of 
that right for the period specified in the notice of extension. 

“(6)  Subject to subsections 27 (2) and 31 (2), where the purchaser of a 
defined right applies for a licence to use a motor vehicle as a taxi, the 
Registrar shall, on payment of the balance of the purchase money, grant 
such a licence to that person. 

Limitation on number of taxi licences 

“27B.  The Registrar shall not— 

 (a) grant a taxi licence; or 

 (b) auction a defined right; 

if the number of taxi licences or defined rights, as the case may be, would 
exceed such number of licences or defined rights as the Minister, by 
instrument published in the Gazette, determines.”. 

Return of certificates after cancellation or suspension 

7.  Section 100 of the Principal Act is amended— 

 (a) by omitting from subsection (1) “forthwith” and substituting 
“within 7 days”; and 

 (b) by omitting from subsection (1) “cancellation of the registration” 
and substituting “suspension or cancellation of the registration”. 

Interpretation 

8.  Section 149 of the Principal Act is amended— 

 (a) by omitting from subsection (1) the definition of “penalty”; 



4 Motor Traffic (Amendment)      No.  47, 1993 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au 

 (b) by inserting in subsection (1) the following definition: 

“ ‘prescribed penalty’, in relation to a parking infringement, 
means the penalty prescribed by the regulations for that 
infringement;”; and 

 (c) by omitting subsections (1A) and (1B). 

Parking infringement notices 

9.  Section 162 of the Principal Act is amended— 

 (a) by omitting paragraph (5) (a); and 

 (b) by omitting from subsection (8) “prescribed” and substituting 
“relevant”. 

Final notice—non-payment of penalty 

10.  Section 162A of the Principal Act is amended— 

 (a) by omitting subsection (2); and 

 (b) by omitting from paragraph (3) (c) all the words after “specified” 
and substituting the following: 

  “in the notice, suspend— 

 (i) the infringer’s driving licence; 

 (ii) the registration of the motor vehicle in respect of which 
the alleged parking infringement occurred; 

 (iii) the infringer’s right to drive in the Territory; or 

 (iv) the right to drive in the Territory the motor vehicle in 
respect of which the alleged parking infringement 
occurred; 

as the case requires;”. 

Discharge of liability 

11.  Section 162B of the Principal Act is amended by inserting “or if 
the relevant notice is withdrawn” after “relevant notice” (last occurring). 

Disputed notices—application to Court for declaration 

12.  Section 162D of the Principal Act is amended— 

 (a) by omitting from subsection (1) “within 60 days after the date of 
the relevant notice” and substituting “before the end of the period 
of 60 days after the furnishing of the statutory declaration or the 
lodgment of the notice under subsection 162C (1) (as the case 
requires)”; and 



 Motor Traffic (Amendment)      No.  47, 1993 5 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au 

 (b) by omitting paragraph (3) (c) and substituting the following 
paragraph: 

 “(c) the disbursements (if any) incurred by the Registrar, 
including any fee paid on the lodgment of an application 
under subsection (1).”. 

Suspension of licences, registration etc. 

13.  Section 162E of the Principal Act is amended— 

 (a) by omitting from subparagraphs (1) (e) (i) and (ii) “cancel” and 
substituting “suspend”; 

 (b) by omitting from subparagraph (1) (e) (iii) “and suspend” and 
substituting “or suspend”; 

 (c) by omitting from subparagraph (1) (f) (i) “cancel” and substituting 
“suspend”; 

 (d) by omitting from subsection (2) “cancelled” and substituting 
“suspended”; and 

 (e) by omitting subsection (3) and substituting the following 
subsection: 

“(3)  The Registrar shall not effect a suspension under 
subsection (1) unless, at least 10 days before the suspension takes 
effect, he or she notifies the person concerned, in writing, of the 
date on which the suspension is to take effect.”. 

Substitution 

14.  Section 162F of the Principal Act is repealed and the following 
sections are substituted: 

Effect of suspension 

“162EA.  The Registrar shall not— 

 (a) issue a licence to a person; or 

 (b) register a motor vehicle; 

while the person’s right to drive in the Territory or the right to drive that 
motor vehicle (as the case requires) is suspended under 
subsection 162E (1). 



6 Motor Traffic (Amendment)      No.  47, 1993 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au 

Cancellation of suspension 

“162F.  The Registrar shall cancel a suspension effected under 
subsection 162E (1) upon the payment of all amounts payable under 
section 162A or 162D (as the case requires) by the person or in respect of 
the motor vehicle concerned.”. 

Reinstatement of licences, registration etc. 

15.  Section 162H is amended— 

 (a) by omitting from paragraph (1) (a) “cancelled” and substituting 
“suspended under this Part”; 

 (b) by omitting from subsection (4) all the paragraphs and words after 
“subsection (5)” and substituting “, by notice in writing served on 
the applicant, cancel the relevant suspension”; 

 (c) by omitting from subsection (5) “paragraph (4) (c), (d) or (e)” and 
substituting “subsection (4)”; 

 (d) by omitting from subsection (5) “the licence or registration were 
in force or”; 

 (e) by omitting from paragraph (5) (a) “cancel” and substituting 
“suspend”; 

 (f) by omitting subsection (6) and substituting the following 
subsection: 

“(6)  Where the suspension of— 

 (a) a person’s licence; or 

 (b) the registration of a motor vehicle; 

is cancelled under subsection (4), the person shall be taken for all 
purposes to have been licensed or the motor vehicle to have been 
registered (as the case requires), during the period between the 
date of the suspension and the date of its cancellation.”; and 

 (g) by omitting from subsection (7) “paragraph (4) (e)” and 
substituting “subsection (4)”. 



 Motor Traffic (Amendment)      No.  47, 1993 7 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au 

Substitution  

16.  Section 162K of the Principal Act is repealed and the following 
section substituted: 

Costs of applications to Court 

“162K.  Unless the Court otherwise orders— 

 (a) if the Court makes a declaration sought under section 162D, the 
respondent shall pay the costs of the Registrar; 

 (b) if the Court refuses to make a declaration sought under 
section 162D, the Registrar shall pay the costs of the respondent; 

 (c) if the Court makes a declaration sought under section 162H, the 
Registrar shall pay the costs of the applicant; and 

 (d) if the Court refuses to make a declaration sought under 
section 162H, the applicant shall pay the costs of the Registrar.”. 

Traffic infringement notices 

17.  Section 180A of the Principal Act is amended— 

 (a) by omitting from paragraph (3) (a) “name” and substituting 
“number”; 

 (b) by omitting from subparagraphs (3) (d) (i) and (iii) 
“Commissioner of Police” and substituting “chief police officer”; 

 (c) by omitting from subparagraph (3) (d) (v) all the words after “she” 
and substituting “may be convicted and ordered to pay such 
penalty and costs, and be subject to such further orders, as the 
Court determines”; 

 (d) by omitting subsection (4) and substituting the following 
subsections: 

“(4)  The chief police officer may, at any time, withdraw a 
traffic infringement notice by notice in writing served on the 
alleged infringer. 

“(4A)  The chief police officer shall not lay an information for 
an offence arising out of the circumstances on which a traffic 
infringement notice is based unless, within 28 days after the date 
of the notice, he or she serves on the alleged infringer— 

 (a) a notice under subsection (4); and 

 (b) a notice advising that such an information will be laid.”; 



8 Motor Traffic (Amendment)      No.  47, 1993 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au 

 (e) by omitting from paragraph (5) (a) “Commissioner of Police” and 
substituting “chief police officer”; 

 (f) by omitting from subsections (6) and (11) “Commissioner of 
Police” and substituting “chief police officer”; and 

 (g) by omitting subsections (15), (16) and (17). 

Final notice—non-payment of penalty 

18.  Section 180B of the Principal Act is amended— 

 (a) by omitting subsection (2) and substituting the following 
subsection: 

“(2)  Subsection (1) does not apply where the notice is 
withdrawn.”; 

 (b) by adding at the end of subparagraph (3) (b) “and”; 

 (c) by omitting from paragraph (3) (c) all the words after “specified” 
and substituting the following: 

“in the notice, suspend— 

 (i) the infringer’s driving licence; 

 (ii) the registration of the motor vehicle in respect of which 
the alleged traffic infringement occurred; 

 (iii) the infringer’s right to drive in the Territory; or 

 (iv) the right to drive in the Territory the motor vehicle in 
respect of which the alleged traffic infringement 
occurred; 

as the case requires.”; and 

 (d) by omitting paragraphs (3) (d), (e) and (f). 

Discharge of liability 

19.  Section 180C of the Principal Act is amended by inserting “or 
where the relevant notice is withdrawn” after “relevant notice”. 

Disputing liability under traffic infringement notice 

20.  Section 180D of the Principal Act is amended by omitting 
subsection (1) and substituting the following subsection: 

“(1)  A person on whom a traffic infringement notice under 
section 180A is served may, by notice in writing lodged with the chief 
police officer within 28 days after the date of the notice, dispute liability for 
the alleged traffic infringement to which the notice relates.”. 



 Motor Traffic (Amendment)      No.  47, 1993 9 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au 

Disputed notices—issue of proceedings 

21.  Section 180E of the Principal Act is amended— 

 (a) by omitting from subsection (1) all the words after “that section,” 
and substituting “the chief police officer may, before the end of 
the period of 60 days after the lodgment of the notice, lay an 
information in the Magistrates Court in respect of the alleged 
traffic infringement”; 

 (b) by adding at the end of paragraph (2) (c) “and”; 

 (c) by omitting paragraph (2) (d); 

 (d) by omitting from paragraph (2) (e) “Commissioner of Police” and 
substituting “chief police officer”; 

 (e) by omitting from subsection (3) “Commissioner of Police” and 
substituting “chief police officer”; and 

 (f) by omitting subsection (4) and substituting the following 
subsection: 

“(4)  If the chief police officer does not lay an information 
within the period referred to in subsection (1), he or she shall— 

 (a) notify the person referred to in that subsection that no 
further action will be taken in relation to that person in 
respect of the alleged traffic infringement; and 

 (b) take no further action in respect of it.”. 

Suspension of licences, registration etc. 

22.  Section 180F of the Principal Act is amended— 

 (a) by adding at the end of subparagraph (1) (a) (ii) “or”; 

 (b) by omitting paragraph (1) (b); 

 (c) by omitting from paragraph (1) (d) “the infringer or the person 
against whom that conviction or order is made is a natural person 
and”; 

 (d) by omitting from subparagraphs (1) (d) (i) and (ii) “cancel” and 
substituting “suspend”; 

 (e) by omitting from subparagraph (1) (d) (iii) “and suspend” and 
substituting “or suspend”; 

 (f) by omitting from subparagraph (1) (d) (iv) “or”; 

 (g) by omitting paragraph (1) (e); 



10 Motor Traffic (Amendment)      No.  47, 1993 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au 

 (h) by omitting from subsection (2) “cancelled” and substituting 
“suspended”; and 

 (j) by omitting subsection (3) and substituting the following 
subsection: 

“(3)  The Registrar shall not effect a suspension under 
subsection (1) unless, at least 10 days before the suspension takes 
effect, he or she notifies the person concerned, in writing, of the 
date on which the suspension is to take effect.”. 

Substitution 

23.  Section 180G of the Principal Act is repealed and the following 
sections are substituted: 

Effect of suspension 

“180FA.  The Registrar shall not— 

 (a) issue a licence to a person; or 

 (b) register a vehicle; 

while the person’s right to drive in the Territory or the right to drive that 
motor vehicle (as the case requires) is suspended under 
subsection 180F (1). 

Cancellation of suspension 

“180G.  The Registrar shall cancel a suspension effected under 
subsection 180F (1) upon the payment of all amounts payable under 
section 180B or 180E (as the case requires) by the person or in respect of 
the motor vehicle concerned.”. 

Reinstatement of licences, registration etc. 

24.  Section 180H is amended— 

 (a) by omitting from paragraph (1) (a) “cancelled” and substituting 
“suspended under this Part”; 

 (b) by omitting from paragraph (1) (b) “or (e) (ii)”; 

 (c) by omitting from subsection (2) “Commissioner of Police” and 
substituting “chief police officer”; 

 (d) by omitting from subsection (4) all the paragraphs and words after 
“subsection (5)” and substituting “, by notice in writing served on 
the applicant, cancel the relevant suspension”; 



 Motor Traffic (Amendment)      No.  47, 1993 11 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au 

 (e) by omitting from subsection (5) “paragraph (4) (c), (d) or (e)” and 
substituting “subsection (4)”; 

 (f) by omitting from subsection (5) “the licence or registration were 
in force or”; 

 (g) by omitting subsection (6) and substituting the following 
subsection: 

“(6)  Where the suspension of— 

 (a) a person’s licence; or 

 (b) the registration of a motor vehicle; 

is cancelled under subsection (4), the person shall be taken for all 
purposes to have been licensed or the motor vehicle to have been 
registered (as the case requires), during the period between the 
date of the suspension and the date of its cancellation.”; 

 (h) by omitting from subsection (7) “paragraph (4) (e)” and 
substituting “subsection (4)”; and 

 (j) by omitting from paragraph (7) (b) “or (e) (ii)”. 

Repeal 

25.  Sections 180J and 180K of the Principal Act are repealed. 

Evidentiary provision 

26.  Section 180L of the Principal Act is amended— 

 (a) by omitting from subsection (1) “Commissioner of Police” (first 
occurring) and substituting “chief police officer or his or her 
delegate”; 

 (b) by omitting from subparagraph (1) (a) (i) “Commissioner of 
Police did not allow further time, under section 180C,” and 
substituting “chief police officer did not allow further time”; 

 (c) by omitting from subparagraph (1) (b) (i) “Commissioner of 
Police allowed, under section 180C,” and substituting “chief 
police officer allowed”; 

 (d) by omitting from subparagraph (1) (b) (ii) “Commissioner of 
Police for the purposes of section 180C” and substituting “chief 
police officer or his or her delegate”; and 

 (e) by omitting from subsection (2) “Commissioner of Police” and 
substituting “chief police officer or by his or her delegate”. 



12 Motor Traffic (Amendment)      No.  47, 1993 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au 

Applications—how made 

27.  Section 180M of the Principal Act is amended by omitting “180E 
or”. 

Insertion 

28.  After section 180M of the Principal Act the following section is 
inserted in Part XIA: 

Power of delegation 

“180N.  The chief police officer may delegate to a police officer a 
power under section 180A, 180E or 180L.”. 

Suspension or cancellation of driving licence 

29.  Section 193A of the Principal Act is amended by omitting from 
subsection (10) “cancellation” and substituting “suspension”. 

Regulations 

30.  Section 218 of the Principal Act is amended by adding at the end 
the following paragraphs: 

 “(al) the penalties applicable for parking infringements under Part X; 

 (am) the penalties applicable for offences under the Motor Traffic 
(Alcohol and Drugs) Act 1977; and 

 (an) the penalties applicable for offences under the Traffic Act 1937.”. 

Schedule 7 

31.  Schedule 7 to the Principal Act is amended— 

 (a) by omitting from the third column of item 9 of Part I “workmen” 
and substituting “workers”; 

 (b) by omitting from the second column of item 18 of Part II “(1A)” 
and substituting “(1B)”; and 

 (c) by omitting from the second column of item 20 of Part II “(4)” and 
substituting “(5)”. 

Further amendments 

32.  (1)  The Principal Act is amended as set out in Schedule 1. 

(2)  The Second Schedule to the Principal Act is amended as set out in 
Schedule 2. 



 Motor Traffic (Amendment)      No.  47, 1993 13 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au 

Transitional 

33.  Notwithstanding the amendments of the Principal Act effected by 
section 7, paragraphs 8 (c) and 9 (a) and sections 10 to 26 (inclusive) 
and 28, the Principal Act as in force immediately before the 
commencement of this section continues to apply, on and after that day, in 
relation to an alleged parking or traffic infringement in respect of which a 
notice under subsection 162 (1) or 180A (2), as the case requires, had been 
served before that commencement. 

 



14 Motor Traffic (Amendment)      No.  47, 1993 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au 

 SCHEDULE 1 Subsection 32 (1) 

FURTHER AMENDMENTS 

Section 4 (definition of “dipped”)— 

Omit “one”, substitute “1”. 

Section 4 (definition of “dipping device”)— 

Omit “one”, substitute “1”. 

Section 4 (definition of “motor cycle”)— 

Omit “four”, substitute “4”. 

Section 4 (definition of “motor omnibus”)— 

Omit “six”, substitute “6”. 

Section 4 (definition of “offence of culpable driving”)— 

Omit “Crimes Act, 1900”, substitute “Crimes Act 1900”. 

Section 4 (definition of “owner”, paragraph (d))— 

Insert “or she” after “he”. 

Section 4 (definition of “owner”, paragraph (e))— 

Omit “grated”, substitute “granted”. 

Section 4 (definition of “repealed Ordinance”)— 

Omit “two of this Act”, substitute “2”. 

Section 4 (definition of “the Crimes Act, 1900”)— 

Omit the definition. 

Section 4 (definition of “this Act”)— 

Omit “Regulations made thereunder”, substitute “regulations”. 

Section 4 (definition of “traffic lane”)— 

 (a) Omit “one”, substitute “1”. 

 (b) Omit “two”, substitute “2”. 

Section 4 (definition of “visiting motor vehicle”, subparagraph (c) 
(iii))— 

 (a) Omit “of this definition”. 

 (b) Omit “workmen”, substitute “workers”. 



 Motor Traffic (Amendment)      No.  47, 1993 15 

SCHEDULE 1—continued 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au 

Subsection 4 (4)— 

Omit “two”, substitute “2”. 

Subsections 4 (5) and (6)— 

Omit “of this Act”. 

Subsection 6 (2)— 

Omit “he”, substitute “the Minister”. 

Paragraph 7 (2) (a)— 

Omit “the Second Schedule”, substitute “Schedule 2”. 

Subsection 7A (5)— 

Omit “the date of commencement of the Motor Traffic (Amendment) 
Act (No. 3) 1990”, substitute “30 October 1990”. 

Subparagraph 9 (5) (a) (i)— 

Omit “two”, substitute “2”. 

Subsection 9 (6)— 

Omit “of this section”. 

Subsection 10 (4)— 

 (a) Insert “or her” after “his”. 

 (b) Insert “or she” after “he” (first occurring). 

 (c) Omit “he” (last occurring), substitute “the Registrar”. 

Subsection 10 (5A)— 

Insert “or she” after “he”. 

Subsection 10 (6B)— 

Insert “or her” after “him”. 

Paragraph 10 (6B) (b)— 

Insert “or she” after “he”. 

Paragraph 11 (aa)— 

Omit “he”, substitute “the person”. 

Paragraph 11 (b)— 

 (a) Omit “he”, substitute “the person”. 



16 Motor Traffic (Amendment)      No.   47, 1993 

SCHEDULE 1—continued 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au 

 (b) Omit “six”, substitute “6”. 

Paragraph 11 (c)— 

Omit “he”, substitute “the person”. 

Subsection 12 (1)— 

 (a) Insert “or herself” after “himself”. 

 (b) Insert “or she” after “he”. 

 (c) Insert “or her” after “his”. 

Subsection 12 (2)— 

 (a) Insert “or herself” after “himself”. 

 (b) Insert “or she” after “he” (wherever occurring). 

 (c) Omit “him”, substitute “the person”. 

 (d) Omit “his”, substitute “the medical testing officer’s”. 

Paragraph 13A (2A) (a)— 

 (a) Insert “or she” after “he”. 

 (b) Omit “of this Act”. 

Paragraph 13A (2A) (b)— 

 (a) Insert “or she” after “he” (wherever occurring). 

 (b) Omit “of this Act”. 

Subsection 13A (2B)— 

 (a) Omit “(a) of the last preceding subsection”, substitute “(2A) (a)”. 

 (b) Omit “(b) of that subsection”, substitute “(2A) (b)”. 

Subsection 13A (2C)— 

Insert “or she” after “he”. 

Paragraph 13A (2D) (a)— 

Insert “or her” after “his”. 

Subsection 13A (2D)— 

 (a) Insert “or her” after “his” (second and last occurring). 

 (b) Insert “or she” after “he”. 



 Motor Traffic (Amendment)      No.  47, 1993 17 

SCHEDULE 1—continued 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au 

Subsection 13A (2E)— 

 (a) Omit “of this Act”. 

 (b) Omit “that last-mentioned section”, substitute “section 11”. 

Subsection 13A (6)— 

Omit “of this Act”. 

Section 15— 

Insert “or her” after “his”. 

Section 16— 

Omit “under this Act”. 

Subsection 18 (1)— 

 (a) Insert “or her” after “him”. 

 (b) Omit “one”, substitute “1”. 

Subsection 18 (1A)— 

Insert “or her” after “him”. 

Subsection 18 (2)— 

Insert “or her” after “him”. 

Subsection 20 (2)— 

Omit “he”, substitute “the Registrar”. 

Section 21— 

Omit “of this Act”. 

Subsection 23 (1)— 

 (a) Insert “or her” after “him”. 

 (b) Omit “he”, substitute “the owner”. 

Subsection 23 (2)— 

Omit “he”, substitute “the Registrar”. 

Subsection 26 (1)— 

Omit “seven”, substitute “7”. 

Subsection 26 (2)— 

Omit “he”, substitute “the Registrar”. 



18 Motor Traffic (Amendment)      No.   47, 1993 

SCHEDULE 1—continued 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au 

Subsection 26B (3)— 

Omit “him”, substitute “the Registrar”. 

Paragraph 26C (1) (c)— 

Omit “he”, substitute “the Registrar”. 

Subsection 26C (3)— 

Omit “he”, substitute “the Registrar”. 

Subsection 26D (1)— 

Omit “he”, substitute “the Registrar”. 

Section 26F— 

Insert “or her” after “his”. 

Paragraph 27 (2) (b)— 

Omit “two”, substitute “2”. 

Subsection 28 (6)— 

 (a) Omit “of this section”. 

 (b) Omit “the next succeeding subsection”, substitute 
“subsection (7)”. 

Subsection 28 (8)— 

Omit “three”, substitute “3”. 

Paragraph 30 (c)— 

Omit “of this Act”. 

Subsections 31 (1) and (2)— 

 (a) Omit “she or he”, substitute “he or she”. 

 (b) Omit “one”, substitute “1”. 

Subsection 33 (9)— 

Insert “or her” after “his”. 

Subsection 33 (10)— 

Insert “or she” after “he”. 

Subsection 33 (11)— 

Omit “him”, substitute “the person”. 



 Motor Traffic (Amendment)      No.  47, 1993 19 

SCHEDULE 1—continued 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au 

Subsection 35 (1)— 

 (a) Insert “or her” after “his” (wherever occurring). 

 (b) Omit “he”, substitute “the driver”. 

Subsection 35 (2)— 

Insert “or her” after “his”. 

Subsection 35 (3)— 

Omit “her or his”, substitute “his or her”. 

Subsection 35 (4)— 

 (a) Omit “her or his”, substitute “his or her”. 

 (b) Omit “she or he”, substitute “he or she”. 

Subsection 40 (1)— 

 (a) Insert “or she” after “he” (first occurring). 

 (b) Omit “that he”. 

Subsection 40 (3)— 

Insert “or her” after “his”. 

Subsections 40 (4) and (5)— 

Omit “him of one”, substitute “him or her of 1”. 

Subsection 40 (6)— 

Omit “either of the last two preceding subsections”, substitute 
“subsection (4) or (5)”. 

Subsection 40 (7)— 

Omit “the thirty-first day of December”, substitute “31 December”. 

Subsection 40 (9)— 

 (a) Omit “the first day of January”, substitute “1 January”. 

 (b) Omit “twelve”, substitute “12”. 

Subsection 41 (1)— 

 (a) Omit “the Second Schedule”, substitute “Schedule 2”. 

 (b) Insert “or her” after “him”. 

 (c) Insert “or her” after “his” (wherever occurring). 



20 Motor Traffic (Amendment)      No.   47, 1993 

SCHEDULE 1—continued 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au 

Subsection 41 (2)— 

 (a) Omit “the Second Schedule”, substitute “Schedule 2”. 

 (b) Insert “or her” after “him”. 

 (c) Insert “or her” after “his” (wherever occurring). 

Subsection 41 (3)— 

Insert “or she” after “he”. 

Paragraph 42 (1) (b)— 

Insert “or her” after “his” (wherever occurring). 

Subsection 42 (2)— 

Omit “him”, substitute “the trader”. 

Subsection 43 (1)— 

 (a) Insert “or she” after “he” (first occurring). 

 (b) Omit “he” (last occurring), substitute “the trader”. 

 (c) Omit “seven”, substitute “7”. 

 (d) Insert “or her” after “him”. 

Subsection 43 (2)— 

Insert “or her” after “him”. 

Section 45— 

 (a) Insert “or her” after “his”. 

 (b) Insert “or her” after “him”. 

Paragraph 46 (a)— 

Omit “the Second Schedule”, substitute “Schedule 2”. 

Paragraph 47 (a)— 

 (a) Omit “the Third Schedule”, substitute “Schedule 3”. 

 (b) Omit “twenty-four”, substitute “24”. 

 (c) Insert “or her” after “his”. 

Paragraph 47 (b)— 

Omit “six”, substitute “6”. 



 Motor Traffic (Amendment)      No.  47, 1993 21 

SCHEDULE 1—continued 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au 

Subsection 48 (1)— 

Omit “him”, substitute “the trader”. 

Subsection 48 (2)— 

Omit “three” (wherever occurring), substitute “3”. 

Subsection 51 (2)— 

 (a) Omit “the last preceding subsection”, substitute “subsection (1)”. 

 (b) Omit “twelve”, substitute “12”. 

Subsection 51 (2A)— 

Omit “of this section”. 

Subsection 51 (3)— 

 (a) Omit “of this section”. 

 (b) Insert “or she” after “he”. 

Subsection 52 (1)— 

Insert “or her” after “him”. 

Subsection 52 (2)— 

 (a) Omit “of this section”. 

 (b) Insert “or her” after “him”. 

Paragraph 52 (5) (b)— 

Insert “or she” after “he”. 

Subsection 53 (1)— 

 (a) Insert “or she” after “he”. 

 (b) Omit “(1) of section 52 of this Act”, substitute “52 (1)”. 

Subsection 53 (2)— 

 (a) Insert “or she” after “he”. 

 (b) Omit “(2) of section 52 of this Act”, substitute “52 (2)”. 

Paragraphs 54 (2) (a) and (b)— 

Insert “or her” after “him”. 

Subsection 54 (3)— 

Omit “of this section”. 



22 Motor Traffic (Amendment)      No.   47, 1993 

SCHEDULE 1—continued 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au 

Subsection 54 (4)— 

Omit “of this section”. 

Paragraph 54 (5) (a)— 

 (a) Omit “thirty”, substitute “30”. 

 (b) Insert “or she” after “he”. 

Paragraph 54 (5) (b)— 

 (a) Omit “of this subsection”. 

 (b) Omit “fifteen”, substitute “15”. 

Paragraph 54 (5) (c)— 

Omit “fifteen”, substitute “15”. 

Subsection 54 (7)— 

Omit “(b) of subsection (6) of this section”, substitute “(6) (b)”. 

Subsection 54 (9)— 

Insert “or her” after “his” (first occurring). 

Paragraphs 54 (9) (c), (d) and (e)— 

Insert “or her” after “his”. 

Paragraph 54 (9) (e)— 

Insert “or her” after “him”. 

Subsection 54 (10)— 

Omit “the last preceding subsection”, substitute “subsection (9)”. 

Subsection 57 (4)— 

 (a) Omit “subsections (1) or (2) of this section”, substitute 
“subsection (1) or (2)”. 

 (b) Omit “thirty”, substitute “30”. 

Subsection 57 (5)— 

 (a) Omit “of this Act”. 

 (b) Insert “or her” after “him”. 

Subsection 57 (6)— 

Insert “or she” after “he”. 



 Motor Traffic (Amendment)      No.  47, 1993 23 

SCHEDULE 1—continued 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au 

Subsection 58 (2)— 

Insert “or she” after “he”. 

Subsection 59 (4)— 

 (a) Omit “fourteen”, substitute “14”. 

 (b) Insert “or she” after “he”. 

Subsection 59 (6)— 

Insert “or her” after “his”. 

Subsection 59 (7)— 

Omit “three”, substitute “3”. 

Paragraph 59 (9) (b)— 

Omit “of this subsection”. 

Subsection 59 (10)— 

 (a) Omit “(a) of the last preceding subsection”, substitute “(9) (a)”. 

 (b) Omit “(b) of the last preceding subsection”, substitute “(9) (b)”. 

 (c) Insert “or she” after “he”. 

Section 60— 

Omit “or holds himself out”, substitute “or herself, or holds himself or 
herself out,”. 

Subsection 61 (1)— 

 (a) Omit “thirty”, substitute “30” (wherever occurring). 

 (b) Omit “seven”, substitute “7”. 

Subsection 61 (3)— 

 (a) Insert “or she” after “he” (wherever occurring). 

 (b) Omit “of this subsection”. 

Paragraph 61 (4) (a)— 

Omit the paragraph, substitute the following paragraph: 

 “(a) in the case of an action for the recovery of any amount referred to 
in paragraph 76 (1) (b)—within the time prescribed by 
paragraph 76 (1) (c); and”. 



24 Motor Traffic (Amendment)      No.   47, 1993 

SCHEDULE 1—continued 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au 

Paragraph 61 (4) (b)— 

Omit “three”, substitute “3”. 

Subsection 61 (6)— 

 (a) Insert “or her” after “him” (wherever occurring). 

 (b) Omit “of this section” (wherever occurring). 

 (c) Insert “or she” after “he”. 

Subsection 61 (7)— 

 (a) Omit “of this section”. 

 (b) Insert “or she” after “he”. 

Subsection 61 (8)— 

 (a) Insert “or her” after “him”. 

 (b) Omit “of this section”. 

Subsections 61 (9), (10) and (11)— 

Omit “of this section”. 

Paragraph 61 (11) (b)— 

Insert “or her” after “his”. 

Subsection 61 (12)— 

Omit “of this section” (first occurring). 

Subparagraph 61 (12) (a) (ii)— 

Omit “(b) of subsection (3) of this section”, substitute “(3) (b)”. 

Subparagraphs 61 (12) (b) (i) and (ii)— 

Insert “or she” after “he”. 

Paragraph 61 (12) (c)— 

Insert “or she” after “he”. 

Subsection 61 (13)— 

 (a) Omit “The last preceding subsection”, substitute 
“Subsection (12)”. 

 (b) Omit “been”, substitute “be”. 



 Motor Traffic (Amendment)      No.  47, 1993 25 

SCHEDULE 1—continued 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au 

Subsection 61 (15)— 

Omit “the last preceding subsection”, substitute “subsection (14)”. 

Section 62— 

 (a) Insert “or she” after “he”. 

 (b) Omit “two”, substitute “2”. 

Paragraph 62 (b) (second occurring)— 

Omit “(ii) of paragraph (c) of this section”, substitute “(c) (ii)”. 

Section 63— 

Insert “or she” after “he”. 

Section 64— 

Omit “of this Act”. 

Subsection 65 (1)— 

Omit “of this Act”. 

Paragraph 65 (1) (a)— 

Omit “of this section”. 

Subsection 65 (2)— 

 (a) Omit “of this Act” (first occurring). 

 (b) Omit “(3) of section 61 of this Act”, substitute “61 (3)”. 

Paragraph 66 (2) (b)— 

Omit “(3) of section 61 of this Act”, substitute “61 (3)”. 

Subsection 66 (3)— 

Omit “The last preceding subsection”, substitute “Subsection (2)”. 

Section 67— 

Insert “or she” after “he”. 

Paragraph 67 (a)— 

Insert “or her” after “his”. 

Paragraphs 68 (1) (a) and (b)— 

Insert “or she” after “he”. 



26 Motor Traffic (Amendment)      No.   47, 1993 

SCHEDULE 1—continued 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au 

Subsection 68 (2)— 

 (a) Omit “of this section”. 

 (b) Insert “or her” after “his”. 

Subsection 70 (1)— 

 (a) Omit “(1) of section 51 of this Act”, substitute “51 (1)”. 

 (b) Insert “or she” after “he” (wherever occurring). 

Subsection 70 (2)— 

Omit “the last preceding subsection”, substitute “subsection (1)”. 

Subsection 70 (4)— 

Omit “of this section”. 

Paragraph 70 (6) (a)— 

Insert “or her” after “him”. 

Paragraph 70 (6) (b)— 

 (a) Insert “or she” after “he”. 

 (b) Omit “give” (first occurring), substitute “given”. 

Paragraph 70 (6) (c)— 

Insert “or she” after “he”. 

Subsection 70 (7)— 

 (a) Omit “the last preceding subsection”, substitute “subsection (6)”. 

 (b) Insert “or her” after “his”. 

Paragraph 71 (2) (a)— 

Insert “or she” after “he”. 

Paragraph 71 (3) (a)— 

Omit “three”, substitute “3”. 

Paragraph 72 (2) (b)— 

Insert “or her” after “him”. 

Subsection 73 (2)— 

Omit “two”, substitute “2”. 



 Motor Traffic (Amendment)      No.  47, 1993 27 

SCHEDULE 1—continued 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au 

Subsection 74 (1)— 

Omit “one”, substitute “1”. 

Paragraph 74 (1) (a)— 

Omit “One dollar and twenty-five cents”, substitute “$1.25”. 

Paragraph 74 (1) (b)— 

 (a) Omit “One dollar and five cents”, substitute “$1.05”. 

 (b) Omit “her”, substitute “the nurse”. 

 (c) Omit “two”, substitute “2”. 

Paragraph 75 (c)— 

Omit “one”, substitute “1”. 

Section 75— 

 (a) Omit “One hundred dollars”, substitute “$100”. 

 (b) Omit “Ten dollars”, substitute “$10”. 

 (c) Omit “one” (first and last occurring), substitute “1”. 

Paragraph 76 (1) (c)— 

Omit “one”, substitute “1”. 

Subsection 76 (1)— 

Omit “One hundred dollars”, substitute “$100”. 

Subsection 76 (2)— 

Omit “One hundred dollars” (wherever occurring), substitute “$100”. 

Section 77— 

 (a) Omit “two”, substitute “2”. 

 (b) Omit “of this Act”. 

Section 78— 

Omit “of this Act”. 

Section 80— 

Omit “of this Act” (wherever occurring). 

Subsection 83 (3)— 

Omit “of this section”. 



28 Motor Traffic (Amendment)      No.   47, 1993 

SCHEDULE 1—continued 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au 

Subsection 83 (4)— 

 (a) Insert “or she” after “he”. 

 (b) Omit “of this section”. 

Paragraph 83 (6) (a)— 

 (a) Omit “thirty”, substitute “30”. 

 (b) Insert “or she” after “he”. 

Paragraph 83 (6) (b)— 

 (a) Omit “of this subsection”. 

 (b) Omit “fifteen”, substitute “15”. 

Paragraph 83 (6) (c)— 

Omit “fifteen”, substitute “15”. 

Subsection 83 (8)— 

Omit “of this section” (wherever occurring). 

Subsection 83 (9)— 

Omit “thirty”, substitute “30”. 

Paragraph 83 (9) (b)— 

Insert “or she” after “he”. 

Subsections 84 (3) and (4)— 

Insert “or her” after “his”. 

Subsection 85 (3)— 

Insert “or she” after “he”. 

Paragraph 85 (5) (a)— 

 (a) Omit “(1) of section 76 of this Act”, substitute “76 (1)”. 

 (b) Omit “(c) of that subsection”, substitute “76 (1) (c)”. 

Subsection 86 (1)— 

Insert “or her” after “him” (wherever occurring). 



 Motor Traffic (Amendment)      No.  47, 1993 29 

SCHEDULE 1—continued 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au 

Subsection 86 (2)— 

 (a) Omit “the last preceding subsection”, substitute “subsection (1)”. 

 (b) Insert “or her” after “him”. 

Subsection 86 (3)— 

 (a) Omit “of this section”. 

 (b) Insert “or her” after “him” (wherever occurring). 

Subsection 86 (5)— 

Insert “or she” after “he”. 

Subsection 86 (7)— 

 (a) Insert “or her” after “him”. 

 (b) Insert “or she” after “he”. 

 (c) Omit “Two hundred dollars”, substitute “$200”. 

Paragraph 87 (1) (a)— 

 (a) Insert “or she” after “he”. 

 (b) Insert “or her” after “his”. 

Paragraph 87 (1) (b)— 

Insert “or she” after “he” (wherever occurring). 

Subsection 87 (3)— 

Omit “the last preceding subsection”, substitute “subsection (2)”. 

Subsection 88 (3)— 

 (a) Omit “of this Act”. 

 (b) Insert “or she” after “he”. 

Subsection 89 (3)— 

Insert “or her” after “his”. 

Section 90— 

 (a) Insert “or her” after “his”. 

 (b) Insert “or her” after “him” (first occurring). 

Paragraph 90 (a)— 

Insert “or she” after “he”. 



30 Motor Traffic (Amendment)      No.   47, 1993 

SCHEDULE 1—continued 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au 

Paragraph 90 (b)— 

 (a) Insert “or she” after “he”. 

 (b) Insert “or her” after “him”. 

 (c) Omit “three”, substitute “3”. 

Subsection 90A (1)— 

Insert “or her” after “his”. 

Subsection 90A (2)— 

 (a) Omit “the last preceding subsection”, substitute “subsection (1)”. 

 (b) Insert “or she” after “he”. 

Paragraph 94 (2) (a)— 

Omit “him to attend at his”, substitute “the applicant to attend at the 
Registrar’s”. 

Paragraph 94 (2) (b)— 

Insert “or her” after “him”. 

Subsection 98 (2)— 

 (a) Insert “or she” after “he”. 

 (b) Insert “or her” after “him”. 

Section 99— 

Omit “seven”, substitute “7”. 

Paragraph 102 (1) (a)— 

Insert “or her” after “his”. 

Paragraph 104 (2) (a)— 

Omit “of this Act”. 

Paragraph 104 (2) (b)— 

 (a) Insert “or she” after “he”. 

 (b) Insert “or her” after “his”. 

Paragraph 104 (2) (c)— 

Insert “or she” after “he” (wherever occurring). 



 Motor Traffic (Amendment)      No.  47, 1993 31 

SCHEDULE 1—continued 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au 

Paragraph 104 (2) (d)— 

Insert “or she” after “he”. 

Paragraph 104 (2) (e)— 

 (a) Insert “or she” after “he”. 

 (b) Insert “or her” after “his”. 

Subsection 104 (5)— 

Insert “or she” after “he”. 

Subsection 105 (1)— 

 (a) Omit “of this Act”. 

 (b) Omit “twelve”, substitute “12”. 

Subsection 105 (3)— 

 (a) Insert “or her” after “him”. 

 (b) Omit “twelve” (wherever occurring), substitute “12”. 

Subsection 105 (4)— 

Omit “twelve”, substitute “12”. 

Paragraphs 107 (1) (a) and (b)— 

Insert “or she” after “he”. 

Subsection 107 (2)— 

 (a) Insert “or she” after “he”. 

 (b) Omit “the last preceding subsection”, substitute “subsection (1)”. 

Subsection 107 (3)— 

Omit “of this section”. 

Section 108— 

 (a) Omit “he” (first occurring), substitute “the driver”. 

 (b) Insert “or she” after “he” (last occurring). 

 (c) Insert “or her” after “his”. 

 (d) Omit “him”, substitute “the driver”. 

Paragraph 108B (2) (c)— 

Omit “fourteen”, substitute “14”. 



32 Motor Traffic (Amendment)      No.   47, 1993 

SCHEDULE 1—continued 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au 

Paragraph 108D (d)— 

Omit “sixteen”, substitute “16”. 

Paragraph 108D (e)— 

Insert “or her” after “his”. 

Subsection 108E (3)— 

Omit “of this section”. 

Paragraph 108E (8) (b)— 

Omit “satisfies himself”, substitute “is satisfied”. 

Paragraph 108G (3) (a)— 

Insert “or she” after “he”. 

Subsection 109 (2)— 

Omit “the last preceding subsection”, substitute “subsection (1)”. 

Paragraph 112 (a)— 

 (a) Insert “or she” after “he”. 

 (b) Omit “of this Act” (last occurring). 

Paragraph 112 (b)— 

Insert “or she” after “he”. 

Paragraph 112 (c)— 

 (a) Insert “or she” after “he”. 

 (b) Omit “of this Act”. 

Paragraph 112 (d)— 

Insert “or she” after “he”. 

Section 112A— 

Omit “the next succeeding section”, substitute “subsection 112B (1)”. 

Subsection 112B (2)— 

Omit “the last preceding subsection”, substitute “subsection (1)”. 



 Motor Traffic (Amendment)      No.  47, 1993 33 

SCHEDULE 1—continued 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au 

Section 112C— 

 (a) Omit “the last preceding section”, substitute “section 112B”. 

 (b) Omit “the next succeeding section”, substitute “section 112D”. 

 (c) Insert “or her” after “his”. 

Subsection 112D (1)— 

Omit “(1)”. 

Paragraph 112D (1) (a)— 

 (a) Omit “his motor vehicle to his left”, substitute “the motor vehicle 
to the left”. 

 (b) Omit “of this Act”. 

Paragraph 112D (1) (b)— 

Omit “his motor vehicle to his right”, substitute “the motor vehicle to 
the right”. 

Paragraph 112D (1) (c)— 

 (a) Insert “or her” after “his” (first occurring). 

 (b) Omit “his”(last occurring), substitute “the”. 

Section 112E— 

Omit “of this Act”. 

Paragraph 112E (a)— 

Insert “or she” after “he” (wherever occurring). 

Paragraph 112E (b)— 

 (a) Insert “or her” after “his” (wherever occurring). 

 (b) Insert “or herself” after “himself”. 

 (c) Omit “he”, substitute “the defendant”. 

Section 112F— 

Omit “one”, substitute “1”. 

Paragraphs 112G (a), (b) and (c)— 

Omit “one”, substitute “1”. 

Paragraph 112H (f)— 

Omit “of this section”. 



34 Motor Traffic (Amendment)      No.   47, 1993 

SCHEDULE 1—continued 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au 

Paragraph 112J (a)— 

Omit “(1) of section 112B of this Act”, substitute “112B (1)”. 

Section 112J— 

Omit “of this Act” (last occurring). 

Subsection 113 (2A)— 

Omit “two”, substitute “2”. 

Subsection 113 (3)— 

Insert “or she” after “he”. 

Section 115— 

Omit “one” (wherever occurring), substitute “1”. 

Subparagraph 115C (2) (c) (iv)— 

Insert “and Water” after “Electricity”. 

Subsection 116 (1A)— 

Insert “or her” after “his”. 

Subsection 116 (3)— 

 (a) Omit “The last preceding subsection”, substitute “Subsection (2)”. 

 (b) Omit “of this Act”. 

Subsection 117 (1)— 

Insert “or her” after “his”. 

Subsection 117 (2)— 

 (a) Omit “the last preceding subsection”, substitute “subsection (1)”. 

 (b) Insert “or she” after “he”. 

 (c) Omit “of this Act”. 

Subsection 118 (1)— 

 (a) Omit “Except as provided in the succeeding provisions of this 
section”, substitute “Subject to subsections (2) to (8)”. 

 (b) Insert “or her” after “his”. 

Subsection 118 (2)— 

Omit “of this Act and to the next succeeding subsection”, substitute 
“and to subsection (3)”. 



 Motor Traffic (Amendment)      No.  47, 1993 35 

SCHEDULE 1—continued 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au 

Subsection 118 (3)— 

Insert “or her” after “his”. 

Subsection 118 (4)— 

 (a) Insert “or she” after “he”. 

 (b) Insert “or her” after “his”. 

Subsection 118 (5)— 

Insert “or she” after “he”. 

Subsection 118 (6)— 

Omit “, of this Act”. 

Subsection 118 (7)— 

Insert “or her” after “his” (wherever occurring). 

Subsection 118 (8)— 

Insert “or she” after “he”. 

Paragraph 119A (2) (b)— 

Insert “or her” after “his”. 

Subsection 120 (1)— 

Insert “or her” after “his”. 

Paragraphs 121 (1) (a) and (d)— 

Insert “or her” after “his”. 

Subsection 121 (1)— 

Insert “or her” after “his” (last occurring). 

Subsection 121 (2)— 

 (a) Insert “or her” after “ his”. 

 (b) Insert “or she” after “he”. 

Subsection 121 (2A)— 

 (a) Insert “or her” after “his” (wherever occurring). 

 (b) Omit “one”, substitute “1”. 

 (c) Omit “(3) of section 113 and section 116 of this Act and to the last 
preceding subsection”, substitute “113 (3) and section 116 and to 
subsection (2)”. 



36 Motor Traffic (Amendment)      No.   47, 1993 

SCHEDULE 1—continued 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au 

Subsection 121 (3)— 

 (a) Omit “the next two succeeding subsections and to section 123 of 
this Act”, substitute “subsections (3A) and (3B) and to 
section 123”. 

 (b) Insert “or her” after “his”. 

Paragraph 121 (3) (a)— 

Insert “or she” after “he”. 

Paragraphs 121 (3) (b) and (c)— 

Insert “or her” after “his” (wherever occurring). 

Subsection 121 (3A)— 

 (a) Omit “his right unless he”, substitute “the right unless he or she”. 

 (b) Omit “he” (last occurring), substitute “the driver”. 

Subsection 121 (3B)— 

 (a) Omit “his” (first, third, fourth and last occurring), substitute “the”. 

 (b) Insert “or her” after “his” (second occurring). 

 (c) Omit “he” (first occurring), substitute “the driver”. 

 (d) Insert “or she” after “he” (last occurring). 

Subparagraph 122 (a) (ii)— 

Omit “(1) of section 112B of this Act”, substitute “112B (1)”. 

Paragraph 122 (b)— 

Insert “or her” after “his”. 

Section 122— 

Insert “or her” after “his” (wherever  occurring). 

Section 122A— 

Insert “or her” after “him”. 

Paragraph 123 (a)— 

 (a) Omit “two” (wherever occurring), substitute “2”. 

 (b) Omit “one” (last occurring), substitute “1”. 

Subsections 124 (1) and (2)— 

Insert “or her” after “his” (wherever occurring). 



 Motor Traffic (Amendment)      No.  47, 1993 37 

SCHEDULE 1—continued 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au 

Section 124A— 

Insert “or her” after “him”. 

Subsection 125 (1)— 

 (a) Omit “his” (wherever occurring), substitute “the”. 

 (b) Omit “of this Act” (last occurring). 

Paragraph 125 (2) (a)— 

Omit “the last preceding subsection”, substitute “subsection (1)”. 

Subsection 127 (1)— 

Omit “two”, substitute “2”. 

Subsection 127 (2)— 

Insert “or her” after “him”. 

Paragraph 128 (1) (c)— 

Insert “or she” after “he”. 

Subsection 128 (1)— 

Insert “or she” after “he” (last occurring). 

Paragraph 128 (2) (c)— 

Insert “or her” after “his”. 

Subsection 128 (2)— 

Insert “or her” after “him”. 

Section 131— 

Insert “or she” after “he”. 

Paragraph 132 (a)— 

Insert “or she” after “he”. 

Paragraph 135 (a)— 

Insert “or her” after “his”. 

Paragraphs 136 (2) (a) and (b)— 

Insert “or she” after “he”. 

Subsection 136 (2)— 

Insert “or she” after “he” (last occurring). 



38 Motor Traffic (Amendment)      No.   47, 1993 

SCHEDULE 1—continued 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au 

Subsection 136 (4)— 

 (a) Omit “he” (wherever occurring), substitute “the driver”. 

 (b) Insert “or her” after “his”. 

Subsection 136 (5)— 

 (a) Omit “he” (wherever occurring), substitute “the driver”. 

 (b) Insert “or her” after “his”. 

Paragraph 136 (6) (a)— 

Insert “or her” after “his”. 

Subsections 136 (7) and (8)— 

 (a) Omit “he” (wherever occurring), substitute “the driver”. 

 (b) Insert “or her” after “his”. 

Subsection 136 (10)— 

Omit “subsection” (second and last occurring). 

Subsection 136 (11)— 

 (a) Insert “or her” after “his” (wherever occurring). 

 (b) Omit “he”, substitute “the driver”. 

 (c) Omit “one”, substitute “1”. 

Subsection 136 (12)— 

 (a) Insert “or her” after “his”. 

 (b) Insert “or she” after “he”. 

Paragraphs 136 (12) (a) and (b)— 

Insert “or her” after “his” (wherever occurring). 

Section 139— 

Insert “or her” after “his”. 

Subparagraph 139 (c) (i)— 

Omit “one”, substitute “1”. 

Paragraph 147C (1) (a)— 

Omit “six”, substitute “6”. 



 Motor Traffic (Amendment)      No.  47, 1993 39 

SCHEDULE 1—continued 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au 

Paragraph 147C (2) (a)— 

Omit “two”, substitute “2”. 

Subparagraph 147C (3) (b) (v)— 

Omit “two”, substitute “2”. 

Section 147E— 

Insert “or she” after “he”. 

Subsection 150 (5)— 

Insert “or she” after “he”. 

Subsection 150B (3)— 

Omit “him”, substitute “the Registrar”. 

Subsection 150B (4)— 

Omit “he”, substitute “the Registrar”. 

Paragraph 150C (1) (a)— 

Insert “or she” after “he”. 

Section 150D— 

Insert  “or she” after “he”. 

Paragraph 150E (b)— 

Insert “or her” after “him”. 

Subsection 152 (6)— 

Omit “a preceding subsection of”. 

Subsections 154 (2) and (3)— 

Omit “thirty”, substitute “30”. 

Subsection 155 (6)— 

Omit “a preceding subsection of”. 

Paragraph 156 (3) (a)— 

Omit “one”, substitute “1”. 

Paragraphs 158 (1) (ea) and (f)— 

Omit “two”, substitute “2”. 



40 Motor Traffic (Amendment)      No.   47, 1993 

SCHEDULE 1—continued 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au 

Paragraph 158 (1) (k)— 

 (a) Omit “two”, substitute “2”. 

 (b) Omit “of this Act”. 

Subsection 159 (1)— 

Insert “or she” after “he”. 

Subsection 159 (4)— 

 (a) Omit “fourteen”, substitute “14”. 

 (b) Omit “he” (first occurring), substitute “the owner”. 

 (c) Omit “him”, substitute “the owner”. 

Paragraph 159 (4) (b)— 

Insert “or she” after “he”. 

Subsection 159 (5)— 

 (a) Omit “fourteen”, substitute “14”. 

 (b) Insert “or her” after “him”. 

Subsection 159 (6)— 

 (a) Omit “fourteen”, substitute “14”. 

 (b) Omit “him”, substitute “the owner”. 

Paragraph 159 (6) (c)— 

Insert “or she” after “he”. 

Subsection 159 (7)— 

 (a) Omit “fourteen”, substitute “14”. 

 (b) Insert “or her” after “him”. 

Paragraph 159 (7) (b)— 

Insert “or her” after “his”. 

Paragraph 159 (7) (c)— 

Insert “or she” after “he”. 

Subsection 161 (1)— 

Insert “or her” after “his”. 

Subsection 161 (2)— 

 (a) Omit “the last preceding subsection”, substitute “subsection (1)”. 



 Motor Traffic (Amendment)      No.  47, 1993 41 

SCHEDULE 1—continued 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au 

 (b) Insert “or she” after “he”. 

Subsection 162 (1)— 

Insert “or she” after “he”. 

Paragraph 162 (2) (c)— 

 (a) Insert “or her” after “his”. 

 (b) Omit “sixteen”, substitute “16”. 

Subsection 162 (3)— 

Omit “him”, substitute “the owner”. 

Paragraph 162 (3) (a)— 

Insert “or her” after “his”. 

Paragraph 162 (3) (c)— 

Omit “(4) or (5) of section 159 of this Act”, substitute “159 (4) or (5)”. 

Subsection 162 (8)—  

 (a) Omit “one” (wherever occurring), substitute “1”. 

 (b) Insert “or her” after “him”. 

Paragraphs 163G (a), (b) and (d)— 

Insert “or she” after “he”. 

Paragraph 163G (c)— 

Insert “or her” after “his”. 

Section 163G, penalty at foot— 

Omit “Fifty dollars”, substitute “$50”. 

Subsection 163H (1), penalty at foot— 

Omit “Fifty dollars”, substitute “$50”. 

Subsection 163H (2), penalty at foot— 

Omit “One hundred dollars”, substitute “$100”. 

Section 163J, penalty at foot— 

Omit “Fifty dollars”, substitute “$50”. 

Section 163K, penalty at foot— 

Omit “Two hundred dollars”, substitute “$200”. 



42 Motor Traffic (Amendment)      No.   47, 1993 

SCHEDULE 1—continued 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au 

Section 163MB— 

Omit “one”, substitute “1”. 

Subsection 163N (1)— 

 (a) Insert “or she” after “he”. 

 (b) Omit “seven”, substitute “7”. 

Paragraphs 164 (1) (a) and (b)— 

Omit “-1964”. 

Subsection 164 (2)— 

Omit “two”, substitute “2”. 

Paragraph 164 (2) (a)— 

Omit “one”, substitute “1”. 

Section 164B— 

Insert “or her” after “him” (wherever occurring). 

Paragraph 164C (2) (a)— 

Insert “or her” after “him” (wherever occurring). 

Paragraph 164E (1) (a)— 

Insert “or she” after “he”. 

Section 167— 

 (a) Insert “or her” after “him”. 

 (b) Insert “or herself” after “himself”. 

Section 169— 

 (a) Omit “him”, substitute “the farmer”. 

 (b) Insert “or she” after “he”. 

Paragraph 169 (a)— 

Insert “or her” after “his”. 

Subsection 172 (1)— 

 (a) Insert “or her” after “his” (wherever occurring). 

 (b) Insert “or she” after “he”. 

 (c) Omit “three”, substitute “3”. 



 Motor Traffic (Amendment)      No.  47, 1993 43 

SCHEDULE 1—continued 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au 

Subsection 172 (2)— 

Insert “or her” after “his” (wherever occurring). 

Section 174— 

Insert “or her” after “his” (wherever occurring). 

Paragraph 176 (1) (a)— 

Insert “or she” after “he”. 

Subsection 176 (2)— 

Omit “(a) and (b) of the last preceding subsection”, substitute “(1) (a) 
and (b)”. 

Subsection 176 (3)— 

Omit “(i) of paragraph (c) of subsection (1) of this section”, substitute 
“(1) (c) (i)”. 

Subsection 176 (4)— 

Omit “(a) and (b) of subsection (1) of this section”, substitute “(1) (a) 
and (b)”. 

Paragraph 176 (4) (e)— 

Omit “the last preceding paragraph”, substitute “paragraph (d)”. 

Paragraph 177 (b)— 

Insert “or her” after “his”. 

Paragraph 178 (1) (a)— 

Omit “he fails to stop his”, substitute “the driver fails to stop his or 
her”. 

Subparagraph 178 (1) (b) (iii)— 

Insert “or her” after “his”. 

Paragraph 178 (1) (b)— 

Omit “he fails to give his”, substitute “the driver fails to give his or 
her”. 

Paragraph 178 (1) (c)— 

 (a) Insert “or she” after “he”. 

 (b) Omit “twenty-four”, substitute “24”. 



44 Motor Traffic (Amendment)      No.   47, 1993 

SCHEDULE 1—continued 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au 

Section 180— 

 (a) Insert “or her” after “his”. 

 (b) Insert “or she” after “he” (wherever occurring). 

Subsection 180A (2)— 

Insert “or she” after “he”. 

Paragraph 180A (7) (b)— 

Omit “him at his”, substitute “the person at his or her”. 

Subsection 180A (11)— 

Insert “or her” after “his”. 

Subsection 180A (12)— 

 (a) Omit “one” (wherever occurring), substitute “1”. 

 (b) Insert “or her” after “him”. 

Section 181— 

Omit “the Second Schedule”, substitute “Schedule 2”. 

Paragraph 182 (1) (a)— 

 (a) Omit “one”, substitute “1”. 

 (b) Omit “the next succeeding subsection”, substitute 
“subsection (1A)”. 

Paragraph 182 (1) (b)— 

Omit “seven”, “one” and “two”, substitute “7”, “1”, and “2”, 
respectively. 

Paragraph 182 (1) (ba)— 

Omit “seven”, substitute “7”. 

Paragraph 182 (1) (c)— 

Omit “two”, substitute “2”. 

Paragraph 182 (2) (b)— 

Omit “seven”, substitute “7”. 

Paragraphs 182 (2) (c) and (d)— 

Omit “of this subsection”. 



 Motor Traffic (Amendment)      No.  47, 1993 45 

SCHEDULE 1—continued 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au 

Subparagraph 183 (1) (a) (ii)— 

Omit “the last preceding subparagraph”, substitute “subparagraph (i)”. 

Paragraph 183 (2) (a)— 

Omit “the last preceding subsection”, substitute “subsection (1)”. 

Paragraph 185 (1) (a)— 

Omit “of this Act”. 

Paragraph 185 (1) (b)— 

 (a) Omit “seven”, substitute “7”. 

 (b) Omit “the next succeeding subsection”, substitute 
“subsection (2)”. 

Paragraph 185 (1) (c)— 

Omit “(b) and (ba) of subsection (1) of section 182 of this Act”, 
substitute “182 (1) (b) and (ba)”. 

Subsection 185 (2)— 

Omit “(b) of the last preceding subsection”, substitute “(1) (b)”. 

Subsection 185 (3)— 

Omit “the next succeeding subsection”, substitute “subsection (4)”. 

Paragraph 185 (3) (a)— 

Omit “(b) of subsection (2) of section 182 of this Act”, substitute “182 
(2) (b)”. 

Paragraph 185 (3) (b)— 

Omit “(c) of subsection (2) of that section”, substitute “182 (2) (c)”. 

Subsection 185 (4)— 

Omit “of this section”. 

Paragraph 186 (e)— 

Omit “of this section”. 

Section 188— 

 (a) Omit “ten B”, substitute “10B”. 

 (b) Omit “-1943”. 



46 Motor Traffic (Amendment)      No.   47, 1993 

SCHEDULE 1—continued 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au 

Paragraph 189 (1) (c)— 

Omit “one”, substitute “1”. 

Subsection 190A (1)— 

Omit “, on or after the expiration of the period of two months after the 
commencement of this section”. 

Paragraphs 190A (1) (c) and (d)— 

Insert “or she” after “he”. 

Paragraph 190A (1) (e)— 

 (a) Insert “or she” after “he”. 

 (b) Insert “or her” after “his”. 

Subsection 190A (2)— 

Omit “the last preceding subsection”, substitute “subsection (1)”. 

Subsection 190A (3)— 

Omit “of this section”. 

Paragraph 190A (3) (b)— 

Insert “or she” after “he” (wherever occurring). 

Paragraphs 190A (4) (a) and (b)— 

Omit “-1966”. 

Subsection 190A (5)— 

Omit “(d) of the last preceding subsection”, substitute “(4) (d)”. 

Paragraphs 190A (5) (a) and (b)— 

Omit “(a) of the last preceding subsection”, substitute “(4) (a)”. 

Subparagraph 191 (3) (c) (iii)— 

Omit “the last preceding paragraph”, substitute “paragraph (b)”. 

Subparagraph 191 (3) (c) (iv)— 

 (a) Insert “or her” after “his”. 

 (b) Omit “of this subsection”. 

Subsection 192A (1)— 

Insert “or she” after “he”. 



 Motor Traffic (Amendment)      No.  47, 1993 47 

SCHEDULE 1—continued 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au 

Subsection 193 (2)— 

 (a) Omit “(5) of section 13A of this Act”, substitute “13A (5)”. 

 (b) Insert “or her” after “his”. 

Subsection 193 (3)— 

 (a) Omit “of this Act”. 

 (b) Insert “or her” after “his” (wherever occurring). 

 (c) Omit “twelve”, substitute “12”. 

Subsection 193 (5)— 

Omit “of this Act”. 

Subsection 193 (10)— 

 (a) Omit “the next succeeding section”, substitute “section 193A”. 

 (b) Insert “or her” after “his” (wherever occurring). 

Subsection 193 (11)— 

 (a) Insert “or she” after “he” (wherever occurring). 

 (b) Omit “of this Act”. 

 (c) Insert “or her” after “him”. 

Subsection 193 (12)— 

Omit “of this Act”. 

Subsection 193 (13)— 

Omit “the last preceding subsection”, substitute “subsection (12)”. 

Subsection 193A (1)— 

Omit “of this Act”. 

Subsection 193A (2)— 

Insert “or she” after “he”. 

Subsection 193A (4)— 

Insert “or she” after “he”. 

Paragraph 193A (4) (a)— 

Omit “of this Act”. 



48 Motor Traffic (Amendment)      No.   47, 1993 

SCHEDULE 1—continued 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au 

Subsection 193A (5)— 

 (a) Insert “or she” after “he”. 

 (b) Insert “or her” after “him”. 

Paragraph 195 (c)— 

Omit “(5) of section 136 of this Act”, substitute “136 (5)”. 

Subsection 200 (2)— 

 (a) Insert “or her” after “his”. 

 (b) Omit “of this Act”. 

Subsection 200 (4)— 

Omit “of this Act”. 

Subsection 202 (1)— 

Insert “or her” after “his” (wherever occurring). 

Subsection 202 (2)— 

 (a) Omit “the last preceding subsection”, substitute “subsection (1)”. 

 (b) Insert “or herself” after “himself”. 

Subsection 202 (4)— 

Omit “the last preceding subsection”, substitute “subsection (3)”. 

Subsection 204 (2)— 

Insert “or she” after “he”. 

Section 207— 

 (a) Insert “or she” after “he”. 

 (b) Insert “or her” after “his”. 

Section 208— 

Insert “or her” after “his”. 

Subsection 209 (1)— 

Insert “or she” after “he”. 

Subsection 209 (2)— 

Omit “the next succeeding subsection”, substitute “subsection (3)”. 



 Motor Traffic (Amendment)      No.  47, 1993 49 

SCHEDULE 1—continued 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au 

Subsection 209 (3)— 

Omit “(b) or (d) of the last preceding subsection”, substitute “(2) (b) or 
(d)”. 

Paragraph 209 (3) (a)— 

 (a) Omit “the any” , substitute “any”. 

 (b) Omit “connexion”, substitute “connection”. 

Subsection 210 (2)— 

Omit “three”, substitute “3”. 

Section 212— 

Insert “or her” after “his”. 

Subsection 213 (1)— 

Omit “workmen”, substitute “workers”. 

Subsection 213 (2)— 

Omit “the last preceding subsection”, substitute “subsection (1)”. 

Subsection 213 (4)— 

Omit “workmen”, substitute “workers”. 

Subsection 213 (7)— 

 (a) Insert “or her” after “his”. 

 (b) Omit “workmen”, substitute “workers”. 

Subsection 213 (8)— 

Omit “ ‘workman’ ”, substitute “ ‘worker’ ”. 

Subsection 214 (1)— 

 (a) Insert “or her” after “his”. 

 (b) Omit “the last preceding section”, substitute “section 213”. 

Subsection 214 (3)— 

Omit “one” (wherever occurring), substitute “1”. 

Subsection 215 (2)— 

Omit “the last preceding subsection”, substitute “subsection (1)”. 

Subsection 216 (1)— 

 (a) Insert “or her” after “him”. 



50 Motor Traffic (Amendment)      No.   47, 1993 

SCHEDULE 1—continued 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au 

 (b) Omit “seven”, substitute “7”. 

Paragraph 216 (1) (a)— 

Omit “one”, substitute “1”. 

Subsection 217 (1)— 

 (a) Insert “or her” after “his”. 

 (b) Omit “two”, substitute “2”. 

Heading—THE SCHEDULES— 

Omit the heading. 

Heading—THE SECOND SCHEDULE— 

Omit the heading, substitute “SCHEDULE 2”. 

Heading—THE THIRD SCHEDULE— 

Omit the heading, substitute “SCHEDULE 3”. 

Further amendments— 

Each of the following provisions of the Principal Act is amended by 
inserting “prescribed” before “penalty” (wherever occurring): 

Section 160, subparagraphs 162 (5) (d) (i), (ii) and (v), 
paragraph 162 (5) (e), subsection 162 (9), subparagraph 162A (1) (b) (i), 
subsection 162A (1), paragraphs 162A (3) (a), (b), (c) and (f), 
section 162B, subsections 162D (1) and (3) and paragraphs 162D (3) (a), 
162E (1) (a), 162L (1) (a) and (b) and 162L (2) (a) and (b). 

 



 Motor Traffic (Amendment)      No.  47, 1993 51 

 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au 

 SCHEDULE 2 Subsection 32 (2) 

AMENDMENTS OF THE SECOND SCHEDULE 

Clause 6— 

Omit “of this Schedule”. 

Paragraph 7 (1) (a)— 

Omit “two”, “one” (wherever occurring) and “four”, substitute “2”, “1” 
and “4”, respectively. 

Subparagraph 7 (1) (b) (i)— 

Omit “two” and “one”, substitute “2” and “1”, respectively. 

Subparagraph 7 (1) (b) (ii)— 

Omit “two”, substitute “2”. 

Subclause 7 (2)— 

Omit “one”, substitute “1”. 

Paragraph 7 (3) (a)— 

Omit “two” and “one”, substitute “2” and “1”, respectively. 

Paragraph 7 (3) (b)— 

Omit “one” (wherever occurring) and “two”, substitute “1” and “2”, 
respectively. 

Clause 10— 

Omit “of this Act”. 

Clause 11A— 

Omit “one”, substitute “1”. 

Clause 18— 

Insert “or her” after “his”. 

Subclause 22 (1)— 

Omit “the first day of July, 1970”, substitute “1 July 1970”. 



52 Motor Traffic (Amendment)      No. 47, 1993 

SCHEDULE—continued 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au 

  

NOTE 

1. Reprinted as at 18 May 1992.  See also Acts Nos. 44 and 46, 1992. 

NOTE ABOUT SECTION HEADING 

On the day on which the Motor Traffic Act 1936 is amended by this Act, headings to 
sections of the Principal Act are altered as set out in the following table: 

Section Alteration 

122 Omit the heading, substitute the following heading: 
Give way rule at intersections 

131 Omit the heading, substitute the following heading: 
Driver to be in control of motor vehicle 

213 Omit “workmen”, substitute “workers”. 

[Presentation speech made in Assembly on 1 April 1993] 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

©  Australian Capital Territory 1993 


		(02)+61 2 6205 3700
	2013-02-26T11:26:48+1100
	Canberra
	ACT Parliamentary Counsel
	Document is authorised




