Australian Capital Teritory Gazette
No. 5205, 1 October 1993 Housing Assistance Act 1987 15

HOUSING ASSISTANCE ACT 1987
RENT RELIEF PROGRAM - o
VARIATION o L (é/ (’/ o
NO. 140 OF 1993

Under section 12 of the Housing Assistance Act 1987, 1 VARY the Rent
Relief Program as follows:

v

Title
1. This Instrument is titled Rent Relief Program Variation 1993.
Commencement

2. This Instrument commences operation on 3 October 1993 or the
date of gazettal, whichever occurs later.

Rent Relief Program

3. In this Instrument "Rent Relief Program" means the Housing
Assistance Program made by the Commissioner for Housing
published in the Australian Capital Territory Gazette ACT No. 26
on 15 November 1989 as varied pursuant to section 12 of the
Housing Assistance Act 1987 and in effect at the date this
Instrument commences operation.

Variations
4. The Rent Relief Program is amended as follows:

4.1 Clause 5(1){m) is amended by omitting “6 month period” and
substituting "12 month period”. '

4.2 Insert in Clause 5(1) after paragraph (o) the!following
paragraph: ) '

“(p) the applicant does not reside in a hall of residence or
other hostel accommodation for students administered
by a tertiary educational institution or by a church or
community organisation.”

4.3 Clause 7(1) is amended by omitting "30%" and substituting
“400/0". }

4.4 Insert after Clause 10(3)(b) the following clause:

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au

————_




Australian Coputcl Territory Gazette
16 Housing Assistance Act 1987 No. 5205, 1 Oc’fobe} 1993

"(3A) The amount of rental subsidy otherwise payable to an
applicant under subclauses (1) and (3) shall be reduced
by any amount of rent assistance paid to the applicant
under the Social Security Act 1991 or the Veterans
Entitlements Act 1986."

4.5 Clause 10(5) is amended:
4.5.1 by omitting “30%" and substituting "40%";

4.5.2 Dby deleting "plus rent assistance paid to the applicant
under the Social Security Act 1991 or the Veterans’
Entitlements Act 1986;

4.5.3 Dby inserting after the words "other than dependent
child payments" the words "and rent assistance paid
to the applicant under the Social Security Act 1991 or
the Veterans' Entitlements Act 1986:

4.5.4 by omitting "other than the applicant’s spouse. who is
‘ a resident in the houschold” and substituting "other
than the applicant”. .

4.6 After Clause 10(5) the following Clause is inserted:

"10(6) In this Clause 10 the word "applicant” includes the
co-habiting spouse of the applicant whether or not
that spouse is a party to the application”.

4.7 Clause 19(1)(a) is amended by inserting after wholly or in
part” the words "under Clause 17(3)".

4.8 Clause 19(1)(b) is amended by omitting “subclause 20(1)" and
substituting "subclause 18(3)".

4.9 Clause 19(2) is amended by omitting “subclause 20(4)" and
substituting "subclauses 17(4) and 18(4)".

Transitional

5. The amendments made by paragraphs 4.1, 4.2, 4.4and 4.5 (except
4.5.3) of this Instrument do not apply: , .

5.1 inrelation to rent subsidy granted under sub-clause 10(4)
before the commencement of this Instrument - during the
period for which assistance has been granted; and

5.2 in relation to a further application by an applicant for rent
subsidy and any subsequent grant of rent subsidy
pursuant to paragraph 10(4)(b) - where, immediately before
that further application, rent subsidy was paid under the
Rent Relief Program to that applicant in respect of the

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au

[ —




Australian Capital Teritory Gazette ,
* No’S205, 1 October 1993 Housing Assistance Act 1987 17
o

same dwelling which is the subject of the further
application.

e o
Dated this 3-&  day of&?wu— 1993.

Rodney Da emplar :
Acting Commissioner for Housing

APPROVAL '
Under section 12 of the Housing Assistance Act 1987 1 APPROVE the

variation to the Rent Relief Program made by the Acting Commissioner
for Housing by this Instrument.

-y - -
Dated this 7 day of.X/)ﬁ-'-\‘/'——\ 1993.

[S—

P ]

Terence Connolly Z/ .
Minister for Housigg and€ommunityServices

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act gov.au

—



		(02)+61 2 6205 3700
	2014-03-06T11:49:37+1100
	Canberra
	ACT Parliamentary Counsel
	Document is authorised




