307

, AUSTRALIAN CAPITAL TERRITORY
S Regulations 198¢ No. 14

Regulations to amend Regulations 1980 No, 3

I, PETER DREW DURACK, the Attorney-General of the Commonwealth of
Australia, acting for and on behalf of the Minister of State for the Capital
Territory and the Minister of State for Health, hereby make, under each
Ordinance specified in the Schedule, the Regulations set out in that Schedule
immediately following the short title of that Ordinance.

Dated this twenty-fifth day of September 1980,

P. DURACK
Attorney-General

SCHEDULE

ADOPTION OF CHILDREN ORDINANCE 1965

1. The Schedule to Regulations 1980 No. 3 is amended by inserting in the
table of amendments of the Adoption of Children Regulations—

“Part Heading . . . . . . . . Omil 'PART IV--ADOPTION LIST', .substitute '‘PART
vV ADOPTIONLIST ™

after—

“Regulation 14 . . . . . . . . Omit "Fifty dollars’, substitute "$50° ™.

2. Regulation 1 shall be deemed to have come into operation on 25 March
1980.

CANBERRA RETAIL MARKETS ORDINANCE 1971
1. The Schedule to Regulations 1980 No. 3 is amended by omitting—
“CANBERRA RETAIL MARKET TRUST ORDINANCE 1971

Regulations 1972 No. 5 and Regulations 1974 No. 26 (being the Canberra
Retail Market Trust Regulations) are repealed.”

and substituting---
“CANBERRA RETAIL MARKETS ORDINANCE 1971

Regulations 1972 No. 5 and Regulations 1974 No. 26 (being the Canberra
Retail Market Trust Regulations) are repealed.”.

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



308 1980 No. 14
SCHEDULE —continued

2. Regulation 1 shall be deemed to have come into operation on 25 March
1980.
CEMETERIES ORDINANCE 1933

1. The Schedule to Regulations 1980 No. 3 isamended—

(a) by omitting from the table of amendments of the Canberra Public
Cemeteries Regulations—

“Sub-regulation 4 (2} .. .. Omit'two’, substitute '2°
Sub-regulation 10(2) . . . . Omit ‘Commonwealth’, substitute ‘Australian’
and substituting—

“Sub-regulation 4 (1) . . . . Omitthe Schedule 1°, substitute “Schedule I’
Sub-regulation 4 (2) .. . . Omit'two', subsmute 2
Sub-regulation 6 (1) .. . . Omit'the Schedule 2, substilute 'Schedule 2'
Sub-regulation 10 (2) .o« . Omit*Commonwealth’, substitute ‘Australian’
Regulation 20 . . v+ . Omit ‘twelve’ and ‘eight’, substilute ‘12" and ‘8’

respectively” , an
(b) by omitting from that table—

“Paragraph 30 (b) -+« .« . Omit'the Cemetery’, substitute “a public cemetery’
and substituting—
“Paragraph 30 (b) .« . . Omit ‘the cemetery’, substitute ‘a public cemetery™ ™

2. Regulation 1 shall be deemed to have come into operation on 25 March
1980.

CITY AREA LEASES ORDINANCE 1936

1. The Schedule to Regulations 1980 No. 3 is amended by omitting from
the second column of the table of amendments of the City Area Leases
Regulations, insofar as those amendments relate to The Schedule to the

last-mentioned Regulations—
*Clause 1 (b): Omit 'Eight pounds per ceatum (8%) per annum’,
substitute ‘8% ™
and substituting—

“Clause | {b): Omit ‘Eight pounds per centum (8%) per annum’,
substitute ‘8% per annum’ ™

2. Regulation 1 shall be deemed to have come into operation on 25 March
1980.
MACHINERY ORDINANCE 1949

1. The Schedule to Regulations 1980 No. 3 is amended—
(a) by omitting from the table of amendments of the Boilers and Pressure

Vessels Regulations—
*Regulation 10 . v v« . . Omit'two’, substitute 2" "
and substituting—
“Regulation9 . . . . . . . Omit'two’, substilute ‘2’
Regulation 10 . .. . Omit two’, substitute *2°
Sub-paragraph 17 (c) (n) .. . Omit one and one-half times’, substitute 14 times™ ™,

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



1980 No. 14 309

SCHEDULE—continued
(b) by insertingin that table--

“Sub-regulation 36 (1} . . . . Omit seven’, substitute ‘7" "
after—

“Regulation 30 . . . . . . Omit‘fourteen’, substitute *14" "; and

(c) by omitting from that table—

“Paragraph 39 (1) {(¢) . . . . Omit ‘Tenshillings’, substitute ‘$1’ "
and substituting—

“Sub-regulation39 (1) . . . .  Omit ‘Ten shitlings’, substitute *$1°

Sub-regulation40(2) . . . .  Omit ‘seven’, substitute ‘7" ™,

2. The Schedule to Regulations 1980 No. 3 is amended —
(a) by inserting in the table of amendments of the Inspection of

Machinery Regulations—
“Sub-regulation 15(6) . . . .  Omit sixteen’, substitute ‘16’
Sub-regulation 15(7) . . . .  Omit ‘eighteen’, substitute *18° ™
after—

“Regulation 13 B

(b} by inserting in that table—

“Sub-regulation 19 (i) . . . . Omit ‘twenty-four’, substitute ‘24
after—

“Regulation 17 T

(c) by inserting in that table——

Omit ‘Fifty pounds’, substitute ‘§100° ™,

Omit ‘Fifty pounds’, substitute 'S 100" ", and

“Sub-regulation 228 (2) .. . Omit ‘sub-section’, substitute ‘sub-regulation’
Sub-regulation 228 (3) .. . Omit “sub-section’, substitute ‘sub-regulation’
after—
“Regulation 22 .+« + « . Omit Fifty pounds’, substitute ‘$100 *.

3. Regulations t and 2 shall be deemed to have come into operation on 25
March 1980.

MOTOR TRAFFIC ORDINANCE 1936

1. The Schedule to Regulations 1980 No. 3 is amended —

(a) by omitting from the table of amendments of the Motor Vehicle
(Third Party Insurance) Regulations—
“Sub-paragraph 18 (a) (i} . . .  Omit ‘fifteen’, substitute ‘I 5"

and substituting—
“Sub-paragraph 18 (a) (1) . . . Omit'Onedollar’, substitute ‘§1°
Omit “fifteen’, substitute 15" and
(b) by adding at the end of that table—

“The Second Schedule . . . .  Omit from paragraph 5 of Form J ‘One thousand
pounds’, substitute ‘82000°
Omit from paragraph 5 of Form L ‘One thousand
pounds’, substitute "$2000" . .

2. Regulation 1 shall be deemed to have come into operation on 25
March 1980.

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



310 1980 No. 14
SCHEDULE— continued

POUNDS ORDINANCE 1928

1. The Schedule to Regulations 1980 No. 3 is amended by omitting from
the table of amendments of the Pounds Regulations—

“Regulation12 . . . . . . . . Omil'six’, substitute ‘6" "

and substituting—

“Regulation® . . . . . . . . Omit'six’ (wherever occurring), substitute ‘6’
Omit "ten’” (twice occurring), substitute ‘10°
Regulation12 . . . _ . . . .  Omit’six’, substitute ‘6" "

2. Regulation | shall be deemed to have come into operation on 25 March
1980.

PUBLIC HEALTH ORDINANCE 1928

1. The Schedule to Regulations 1980 No. 3 is amended by inserting in the
second column of the table of amendments of the Public Health (Barbers’
Shops) Regulations, insofar as those amendments relate to sub-regulation
17 (7) of the last-mentioned Regulations—

“Omit ‘0.2 per cent.’, substitute ‘0.2% ™
after—

"Omit ‘three’ (wherever occurring), substitute *3* ",

2, The Schedule to Regulations 1980 No. 3 is amended—
(a) by inserting in the table of amendments of the Public Health (Dairy)

Regulations- -

“Sub-regulaticn 35 (3) . . . . Omit ‘sub-sections’, substitute ‘sub-regulations’ ™
after- -

“Sub-paragraph 50 {(d) (i) . . . Omit ‘thirty', substilute ‘30’

Omit ‘five’, substitute '3’ 7}
(b) by omitting from that table—

“Paragraph89 (2) (a) . . . . Omit‘seven’, substitute ‘T’
Omil ‘fourteen’, substitute *14’ ™

and substituting— ‘
“Paragraph 8% (2){a) . . . . Omit seven’ substitute*7

Paragraph 89 (2) (b) . . . . Omit‘fourteen’, sul_)stitute 147 and
(c) by addingat the end of that table—
“Regulation 104 . . . . . . Omit'(a)’ (second occurring), substitute ‘(d}’

Omit (b}’ (second occurring), substitute *(e)’ "

3. The Schedule to Regulations 1980 No. 3 is amended by inserting after
the table of amendments of the Public Health (anate Hospltals) Regulatlons
the following regulations: : g S

“The Public Health (Sale of Food and Drugs) Regulations are amended as
set out in the following table:

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



1980 No. 14 311

SCHEDULE —continued

Provision Amendment
Reguiation 3 .« .+ . . . . . Omi Public Health (Infectious Diseases) Regulations’ from the
definition of ‘Infectious disease’, substitute *Public Health (In-
fectious and Notifiable Discases) Regulations’
Omit ‘Government’ from the definition of ‘Owner’

Paragraph 4 (k) .. . . . . . Omit'two', substitute ‘2’
Omit ‘centum’, substitute ‘cent’

Paragraph11¢a) . . . . . . . Omit'three’, substitute ‘3’

Paragraph14(a) . . . . . . . Omit'tenpercent.’, substitute ‘10%’

Paragraph14(b) . . . . . . . Omit'ten percent.’ substitute ‘10%’

Paragraph l4(d) . . . . . . . Omit four percent.’, substitute ‘4%’

Regulation16 . . . . . . . . Omit ‘Commissioner’ (wherever occurring), substitute ‘Chair-
man

Regulationt? . . . . . . . . Omit ‘Commissioner’ (wherever accurring), substitute ‘Chair-
man

Sub-regulation t9(6) . . . . . .  Omit'three’ (twice occurring), substitute '3

Omit ‘two’, substitute 2"

Regulation2] . . . . . . . . Omit ‘Commissioner’ {wherever occurring), substitute ‘Chair-
man’

Regulation2s . . . . . . . . Omil*Commissioner’, substitute *Chairman’

Regulation30 . . . . . . . . Omit ‘City Area Leases Ordinance 1924-1929’, substitute ‘City
Area Leases Ordinance 1936

Sub-regulation32a(4) . . . . . Omit ‘Liguor Ordinance 1929-1954" (wherever occurring), sub-
stitute ‘'Liguor Ordinance 1975

Paragraph 39 (f) . .« . . . . . Omit'ten’, substitute ‘10

Paragraph39(py . . . . . . . Omit*Commissioner’ (twice occurring), substituie ‘Chairman’

Paragraph55(a) . . . . . . . Omit"two’ substitute ‘2’

Sub-regulation57(4) . . . . . . Omit*Commissioner’, substitute ‘Chairman’

Sub-regulation 58 (I) . . < . . . Omiteight’, substitute ‘&'

Regulation 65 . . . < . . . Omit ‘Commissioner’ {wherever occurring}, substitute ‘Chair-
man

Regulation 72 .. . . . . . . Omi*Commissioner’, substitute ‘Chairman’

Regulation73 . . . . . . . . Omit*Commissioner’, substitute ‘Chairman’

Paragraph83(a) . . . . . . . Omit'twelve’ substitute ‘12’

Paragraph83(b) . . . . . . . Omit'‘Commissioner’, substitute ‘Chairman’

Paragraph83¢d) . . . . . . . Omit twenty-four’, substitute ‘24’

Paragraph84(d) . . . . . . . Omit'‘Commissioner’, substitute ‘Chairman’

Paragraph 84 (i) .« . . . . . OmitDishes’, substitute *Dishers’

Paragraph 84 (k) .« .« . . . Omit thirty', substitute *30'

Sub-regulation 91 (1 ) .« .+ . . . OmitCommissioner’, substitute ‘Chairman’

Sub-regulation 954 (1) . . . . . Omit’(No. 3)' (wherever occurring)

Regulation9?7 . . . . . . . . Omit‘Commissioner’, substitute ‘Chairman’

Paragraph 106 (h) . . . . . . . Omil ‘Commissioner’ (twice occurring), substitute *Chairman’

“The Public Health (Tuberculosis) Reguiations are amended as set out in

the following table:

Provision Amendment

Regulation 2 .« « « « +« « « Omit ‘Public Health (Infectious Discases) Regulations’, substi-
tute “Public Health (Infectious and Notifiable Diseases) Regu-
lations’

Regulation & . e v+ v .+ . Omit'five’, substitute 'y

4. Regulations I, 2 and 3 shall be deemed to have come into operation on
25 March 1980.

PUBLIC HEALTH (PROHIBITED DRUGS) ORDINANCE 1957

1. The Schedule to Regulations 1980 No. 3 is amended by omitting the mat-
ter relating to the Public Health {Prohibited Drugs}) Ordinance 1957 insofar as
that matter relates to the Public Health (Sale of Food and Drugs) Regulations
and the Public Health (Tuberculosis) Regulations.

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



312 1980 No. 14
SCHEDULE—continued

2. Regulation | shall be deemed to have come into operation on 25 March
1980.
RURAL WORKERS ACCOMMODATION ORDINANCE 1938
1. The Schedule to Regulations 1980 No. 3 is amended—

(a) by inserting in the table of amendments of the Rural Workers Accom-
modation Regulations—

“Sub-regulation 10 (3) . . . .  Omit thirty’, substitute *30° "
after—
*Sub-regulation 6 (4) .. . . Omit'two’, substitute 2"

(b} by omitting from that table —

“Paragraph 15¢(2)(d) . . . . Omit‘dinches’, substitute ‘10 cms' ™
and substituting—
“Paragraph 15(2) (d) . . . .  Omit‘4inches’, substitute ‘10cm’ ~ ; and

(c) byinserting in that table—

“Paragraph 31 (1) (b) ..+« Omit twenty’, substitute ‘20" ™
after—
“Sub-regulation24 (6) . . . . Omit 'six’, substitute 6" ",

2. Regulation 1 shall be deemed to have come into operation on 25 March
1980.

WEIGHTS AND MEASURES (PACKAGED GOODS) ORDINANCE
1970
1. The Schedule to Regulations 1980 No. 3 is amended—

(a) by inserting in the table of amendments of the Weights and Measures
{Packaged Goods) Regulations—

“Paragraph 7(2)(a) . . . . . Omit'two’ (twice occurring), substitute ‘2"
after—
“Sub-paragraph 7 (1) (b) (iii) . Omit ‘one hundred and twenty’, substitute *120° ™ |

{(b) by omitting from that table—
“Paragraph 14 (1) (b) . . . . Omit‘two’, substitute*2’”

and substituting—

“Paragraph 14 (2) (b) .o . Omit'two’, substitute 277
Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



1980 No. 14 313
SCHEDULE—continued

{c) by omitting from the second column of that table the matter relating to
paragraph 18 (3) (b) and substituting-
“Omit, substitute
‘(b) the article consists of -
(i} frankfurts:
(iiy minced meat;
(i) sausage meat;
(iv) sausages;
(v) saveloys;
(vi} sliced cooked meat; or
{vii) sliced bacon, .
packed in net weights of 2 ounces, 4 ounces, b
ounces, 8 ounces, 12 ounces. one pound, 14
pounds or in muluiples of one pound. or in net
weights of 50 grammes, 100 grammes, (25
grammes, 200 grammes, 250 grammes, 375
grammes, 500 grammes or in multiples of 500
grammes;’ ",
(d) by omitting from the second column of that table the matter relating
to paragraph 18 (3) (c) and substituting—
“Omit, subslitute
*(¢y the article consists of natura! cheese pucked in
nel weights of 4 ounces, 6 ounces. 8 cunces, 12
ounces, one pound, 1§ pounds or in multiples of
one pound, or in net weights of 100 grammes.
200 grammes, 500 grammes or in multiples of
500 grammes;” ™, and
(¢) by omitting from that table

“Omil from item 9 “ten’, substitute '10°

Second Schedule . . . . . . Omitfrom lem 36 Two', substitute *2" ™
and substituting -
“"Second Schedute . . . . . . Omitlrom ltem 9 'ten’, substilute " 10

Omit [rom Item 36 *Two’, substitute 2" ™.

[ ]
2. Regulation 1 shall be deemed to have come into operation on 25 March
1980.

NOTE

1. Notified in the Commonwealth of Australia Gazerte on 9 October 1980.

Authorised by-the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



		(02)+61 2 6205 3700
	2012-05-04T14:50:41+1000
	Canberra
	ACT Parliamentary Counsel
	Document is authorised




