
Regulations 1980 No. 9 

Regulation under the Health Commission Ordinance 1975' 

I, MICHAEL JOHN RANDAL MACKELLAR, the Minister of State for 
Health, hereby make the following Regulation under the Health Commission 
Ordinance 1975. 

Dated this twenty-first day of May 1980. 

MICHAEL MACKELLAR 
Minister of State for Health 

A M E N D M E N T S OF THE HEALTH COMMISSION (CHARGES) 
REGULATIONS 2 

Amendments relating to fees 
The Health Commission (Charges) Regulations are amended as set out in 

the Schedule. 

SCHEDULE 

Provision amended Amendment 

Paragraph 3AA (1) (a) Omit "$7.85", substitute "$8.25". 
Paragraph 3AA (1) (b) Omit "$7.85", substitute "$8.25". 
Paragraph 3AA (1) (c) Omit "$9.28", substitute "$9.68". 
Paragraph 3AA (1) (d) Omit "$23.15", substitute "$23.55". 
Paragraph 3AA (1) (e) Omit "$23.15", substitute "$23.55". 
Paragraph 3AA (1) ( 0 Omit "$24.58", substitute "$24.98". 
Paragraph 3AA (1) (g) Omit "$7.85", substitute "$8.25". 
Paragraph 3AA (1) (h) Omit "$7.85", substitute "$8.25". 
Paragraph 3AA (1) (j) Omit "$9.28", substitute "$9.68". 
Paragraph 3AA (1) (k) Omit "$29.15", substitute "$29.55". 
Paragraph 3AA (1)0) Omit "$29.15", substitute "$29.55". 
Paragraph 3AA (1) (m) Omit "$30.58", substitute "$30.98". 
Paragraph 4 (1) (a) Omit "$23.15", substitute "$23.55". 
Paragraph 4 (1) (b) Omit "$23.15", substitute "$23.55". 
Paragraph 4 (1) (c) Omit "$24.58", substitute "$24.98". 
Paragraph 4 ( 1 ) (d) Omit "$26.01", substitute "$26.41". 
Paragraph 4 (1) (e) Omit "$29.15", substitute "$29.55". 
Paragraph 4 (1) (f) Omit "$29.15", substitute "$29.55". 
Paragraph 4 (1) (g) Omit "$30.58", substitute "$30.98". 
Paragraph 4 (1) (h) Omit "$32.01 ".substitute"$32.41". 
Paragraph 5A (2) (c) Omit "$5.99", substitute "$6.29". 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



NOTES 
1. Notified in the Commonwealth of Australia Gazette on 3 June 1980. 

2. Regulations 1975 No. 13 as amended by Regulations 1976 No. 18; 1977 Nos. 11, 15, 24 
and 28; 1978 Nos. 7, 8 , 1 5 , 1 7 , 1 8 and 19; 1979 Nos. 5, 14, 17 and 23; 1980 Nos. 3 and 8. 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au


		(02)+61 2 6205 3700
	2012-05-04T14:50:12+1000
	Canberra
	ACT Parliamentary Counsel
	Document is authorised




