
Regulations 1982 No. 48' 

Health Commission (Charges) Regulations2 

(Amendment) 
I, JAMES JOSEPH CARLTON, the Minister of State for Health, hereby make 
the following Regulations under the Health Commission Ordinance 1975. 

Dated 28 October 1982. 

J. J. CARLTON 
Minister of State for Health 

Commencement 
1. These Regulations shall come into operation on 4 November 1982. 

Fees for pathology services 
2. Regulation 6B of the Health Commission (Charges) Regulations is 

amended by omitting paragraph (3) (g) and substituting the following 
paragraph: 

"(g) a pathology service provided by the Commission in relation to the 
treatment, by the Commission, of addiction to alcohol or a drug.". 

Prescribed classes of persons for the purposes of sub-section 74 (3) of the 
Ordinance 

3. Regulation 9 of the Health Commission (Charges) Regulations is 
amended— 

(a) by omitting paragraphs (2) (a) and (ab) and substituting the 
following paragraph: 

"(a) persons who are conveyed to or from a hospital by means of an 
ambulance service and who are^-

(i) eligible pensioners; 
(ii) disadvantaged persons; 

(iii) persons who are students at a school for whom the 
need for an ambulance service occurred while in 
attendance at a school or while travelling to or from a 
school; 

(iv) persons who are financial members of the ambulance 
subscription scheme conducted by the Commission; or 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



(v) dependants of the persons referred to in sub
paragraphs (i), (ii) or (iv), 

other than persons who, in the opinion of the Chief Medical 
Administrator of the hospital, have, or may have, a right to 
recover from another person, by way of compensation or 
damages, the cost of the service;"; and 

(b) by omitting paragraphs (2) (d) and (e). 

Amendments relating to fees 
4. The Health Commission (Charges) Regulations are amended as set out 

in the following table: 

Provision Amendment 

Paragraph 3AA ( I ) (a) Omit "$10.25", substitute "$10.90". 
Paragraph 3AA (1) (b) Omit "$10.25",substi tute"$10.90". 
Paragraph 3AA (1) (c) Omit "$11.68", substitute "$12.33". 
Paragraph 3AA (1) (d) Omit "$33.25", substitute "$38.95". 
Paragraph 3AA (1) (e) Omit "$33.25", substitute "$38.95". 
Paragraph 3AA ( I ) (f) . . Omit "$34.65", substitute "$40.35". 
Paragraph 3AA ( I ) (g) Omit "$39.25", substitute "$44.95". 
Paragraph 3AA (1) (h) Omit "$39.25", substitute "$44.95". 
Paragraph 3AA (1) (j) • • Omit "$40.68", substitute "$46.38". 
Paragraph 4 (1) (a) . . Omit "$33.25", substitute "$38.95". 
Paragraph 4 ( 1 ) (b) . . Omit "$33.25", substitute "$38.95". 
Paragraph 4 ( I ) (c) . . Omit "$34.68", substitute "$40.38". 
Paragraph 4 (1) (d) . . Omit "$36.11", substitute "$41.81". 
Paragraph 4 ( 1 ) (e) . . Omit "$39.25", substitute "$44.95". 
Paragraph 4 ( 1 ) (f) . . Omit "$39.25", substitute "$44.95". 
Paragraph 4 (1) (g) . . Omit "$40.68". substitute "$46.38". 
Paragraph 4 (1) (h) . . Omit "$42.11", substitute "$47.81". 
Paragraph 5A (2) (c) . . Omit "$7.11 ".substitute "$7.28". 

NOTES 
1. Notified in the Commonwealth of Australia Gazette on 3 November 1982. 

2. Regulations 1975 No. 13 as amended to date. For previous amendments see Note 2 to 
Regulations 1982 No. 4 and see also Regulations 1982 Nos. 4, 5, 7 ,9 and 41. 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au


		(02)+61 2 6205 3700
	2012-04-12T12:31:23+1000
	Canberra
	ACT Parliamentary Counsel
	Document is authorised




