AUSTRALIAN CAPITAL TERRITORY 389

Regulations 1983 No. 2!

Health Commission (Charges) Regulations’
(Amendment)

I, NEAL BLEWETT, the Minister of State for Health, hereby make the
following Regulations under the Health Commission Ordinance 197 5.

Dated 2 May 1983.

NEAL BLEWETT
Minister of State for Health

Commencement
1. These Regulations shall come into operation on 5 May 1983.

Amendments relating to fees

2. The Health Commission (Charges) Regulations are amended as set out
in the following table:

Provision Amendment

Paragraph Jaa (1) (a) . . . Omit "510.90", substitute “$11.50™,
Paragraph Jaa (1) (b) . . . Omit "$10.90", substituie “$11.50".
Paragraph 3aa (1} (¢) . . . Omit"$12.33", substitute “$12.93".
Paragraph Jaa (1}{d) . . . Omit"$38.95" substitute “$39.55".
Paragraph 3aA (1} (e) . . . Omit "$38.95" substitute “$39.55".
Parageaph 3aA (1} (Fy . . . Omit "$40.35" substitute “$40.98".
Paragraph 3aa (13 {g) . . . Omit “$44.95" substilute “$45.55",
Paragraph Jaa (1) (h} . . . Omi1"344.95" substilute “$45.55".
Paragraph 3aA (1) (j} . . . Omil "$46.38", substilutc “$46.98".
Paragraph4 (1} (2} . . . . Omil“$38.95" subslitute *$39.55".
Paragraph4 (1)(b} . . . . Omit "838.95" substitute *$39.55".
Paragraph4 (1) (¢} . . . . Omit "540.38" substitute *$40.98".
Paragraph4 (1} ¢d} . . . .  Omit*“$41.81", substitute *$42,41".
Paragraphd {13 (¢} . . . . Omit"“$44.95" substitute "$45.55",
Paragraph4 (1) (D . . . . Omil "$44.95", substilute “$45.55",
Paragraphd4 {1}{(g) . . . . Omit "$46.38" substitute “5$46.98",
Paragraphd4 (13 (h) . . . . Omit"$47.81" substitute “$48.4|",
Paragraph 5a (2) (¢} o Omin t$7.28", substitute “$7.79™,

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au




390 Health Commission (Charges) 1983 No. 2
NOTES
1. Notified in the Comnuniwealth of Austrafiv Gazette on 4 May 1983,

2. Regulations 1975 No. 13 as amended by Regulations 1976 No. §8: 1977 Nes. 11, 15, 24
and 28; 1978 Nos. 7,8, 15,17, I and 19: 1979 Nos. 5,14, 17and 23; 1980 Nos. 3,8,9,13,
I6and 17: 1981 Nos. 10,71, 15, 16 and 25: 1982 Nos. 4, 5, 7,9, 41 and 48,

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au




		(02)+61 2 6205 3700
	2012-04-17T11:37:25+1000
	Canberra
	ACT Parliamentary Counsel
	Document is authorised




