
AUSTRALIAN CAPITAL TERRITORY 387 

Regulations 1984 No. I1 

Motor Omnibus Fares Regulations2 

(Amendment) 
I, THOMAS UREN, the Minister of State for Territories and Local 
Government, hereby make the following Regulations under the Motor 
Omnibus Services Ordinance 1955. 

Dated 16 January 1984. 

TOM UREN 
Minister of State for Territories 

and Local Government 

Exemptions 
1. Regulation 10 of the Motor Omnibus Fares Regulations is amended by 

omitting from sub-regulation (1) "6 or 9" and substituting "9, 11 or 11 A". 

2. After regulation 11 of the Motor Omnibus Fares Regulations the 
following regulation is inserted: 

Concession fares—Wednesdays 
"11 A. Notwithstanding the provisions of regulation 4, the fare to be 

charged in respect of a journey— 
(a) that commences between the hours of 9 o'clock in the morning and 

3 o'clock in the afternoon, or after 6 o'clock in the evening, on a 
Wednesday; and 

(b) that is undertaken by a pensioner, an unemployed person, a special 
beneficiary or a dependent spouse, 

is 10 cents.". 

Schedule 
3. The Motor Omnibus Fares Regulations are amended as set out in the 

Schedule. 

SCHEDULE 
Regulation 3 

Provision amended Amendment 

Sub-regulation 6A (1) . . . Omit "$2.30", substitute "$2.60". 

Paragraph 6A (3) (a) . . . Omit "$1.15", substitute "$1.30". 

Paragraph 6A (3) (b) . . . Omit "$1.15", substitute "$1.30". 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au 
 



388 Motor Omnibus Fares 1984 No. 1 

SCHEDULE—continued 

Provision amended Amendment 

Regulation 6AA . . 

Sub-regulation 6B (1) 

Sub-regulation 6B (3) 

Regulation 6c . . . 

Paragraph 6D (I) (a) 

Paragraph 6D (1) (b) 

Paragraph 6D (I) (c) 

Sub-paragraph 6D (3) (a) (vi) 

Sub-paragraph 6D (3) (a) (vii) 

Sub-paragraph 6D (3) (a) (viii) 

Sub-paragraph 6D (3) (b) (v) 

Sub-paragraph 6D (3) (b) (vi) 

Sub-paragraph 6D (3) (b) (vii) 

Omit "$2.80", substitute "$3.20". 

Omit "$27", substitute "$32". 

Omit "$9.90", substitute "$11.80". 

Omit "$22", substitute "$26". 

Omit "$4.60", substitute "$5.10". 

Omit "$9.20", substitute "$ 10.20". 

Omit "$23", substitute "$25.50". 

Omit "$2.10", substitute "$2.30". 

Omit "$4.20", substitute "$4.60". 

Omit "$ 10.50", substitute "$ 11.50" 

Omit "$1.80", substitute "$2.00". 

Omit "$3.60", substitute "$4.00". 

Omit "$9.00", substitute "$10". 

NOTES 

1. Notified in the Commonwealth of Australia Gazetteon 18 January 1984. 

2. Regulations 1964 No. 7 as amended by 1966 No. 5; 1967 No. 1; 1970 No. 11; 1971 No. 7; 
1973 No. 8; 1974 Nos. 1,7 and 19; 1975 Nos. 1 and 20; 1976 No. 14; 1977 Nos. 2 and 14; 
1978 No. 12; 1979 No. 26; 1980 No. 2; 1981 Nos. 1, 2 and 19; 1982 Nos. 1 and 2; 1983 
Nos. 3 and 23. 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au 
 


		(02)+61 2 6205 3700
	2012-04-23T12:45:52+1000
	Canberra
	ACT Parliamentary Counsel
	Document is authorised




