Australian Capltal Territory

Regulations Revision (Penalties) Regulations

Subordinate Law No. 8 of 19961

The Australian Capital Territory Executive makes the following
Regulations under the Acts specified in headings in the Schedule.

Dated 27 May 1996.

KATE CARNELL
Minister

GARY HUMPHRIES
Minister

Citation

1. These Regulations may be cited as the Regulations Revision
(Penalties) Regulations.

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



Regulations Revision (Penalties) No .8, 1996

Commencement

2. These Regulations commence on the day on which they are notified
in the Gazette.

Amendments of Regulations

3. The Regulations specified in the Schedule are amended as set out
in the Schedule.

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



Regulations Revision (Penalties) No. 8, 1996

SCHEDULE Section 3

AMENDMENTS OF REGULATIONS
Bushfire Regulations
(made under the Bushfire Act 1936)

Regulation 2—
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—1 penalty unit;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—5 penalty units.”.

Regulation 3—
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—5 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—25 penalty units.”.

Regulation 4—
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—2 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—10 penalty units.”.

Subregulation 5 (1)—
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—5 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—25 penalty units.”.

Fire Brigade Regulations
(made under the Fire Brigade Act 1957)

Regulation 3—
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
3

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



Regulations Revision (Penalties) No. 8, 1996
SCHEDULE—continued

(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Machinery Regulations
(made under the Machinery Act 1949)

Regulation 7 (penalty provision)—
Omit “Imprisonment for 6 months”, substitute “10 penalty units”.

Regulation 9—

Add at the foot the following penalty provision:

“Penalty:

(a) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.
Regulation 11—

Add at the foot the following penalty provision:

“Penalty:

(a) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.
Regulation 12—

Add at the foot the following penalty provision:

“Penalty:

(@) if the offender is a natural person—1 penalty unit;

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—5 penalty units.”.

Regulation 13—
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 14—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
4

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



Regulations Revision (Penalties) No. 8, 1996
SCHEDULE—continued

(@) if the offender is a natural person—5 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—25 penalty units.”.

Regulation 15—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 16—
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—5 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—25 penalty units.”.

Regulation 17—
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(a) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 19—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 20—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—5 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—25 penalty units.”.

5

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



Regulations Revision (Penalties) No. 8, 1996
SCHEDULE—continued

Regulation 22—
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(a) if the offender is a natural person—10 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Subregulation 22B (1)—
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(a) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 22C (penalty provision)—
Omit “$100”, substitute “2 penalty units”.

Regulation 25—
Repeal the regulation.

Meat Regulations
(made under the Meat Act 1931)

Regulation 4—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Subregulation 6 (1)—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 21—
Repeal the regulation.

6

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



Regulations Revision (Penalties) No. 8, 1996
SCHEDULE—continued

Regulation 22—
Repeal the regulation.

Motor Omnibus Services Regulations
(made under the Motor Omnibus Services Act 1955)

Regulation 4—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty: 1 penalty unit.”.

Regulation 5—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty: 1 penalty unit.”.

Regulation 6—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty: 5 penalty units.”.

Regulation 7—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty: 1 penalty unit.”.

Regulation 8—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty: 5 penalty units.”.

Regulation 9—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty: 2 penalty units.”.

Regulation 10—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty: 1 penalty unit.”.

Regulation 12—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty: 1 penalty unit.”.

7

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



Regulations Revision (Penalties) No. 8, 1996
SCHEDULE—continued

Subregulation 13 (1)—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty: 1 penalty unit.”.

Regulation 14—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty: 2 penalty units.”.
Regulation 25A (penalty provision)—
Omit “$100”, substitute “1 penalty unit” .
Occupational Health and Safety Regulations
(made under the Occupational Health and Safety Act 1989)
Regulation 10—
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.
Plant Diseases Regulations

(made under the Plant Diseases Act 1934)

Regulation 4—

Add at the foot the following penalty provision:

“Penalty:

(a) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.
Regulation 5—

Add at the foot the following penalty provision:

“Penalty:

(@) if the offender is a natural person—5 penalty units;

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—25 penalty units.”.

8

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



Regulations Revision (Penalties) No. 8, 1996
SCHEDULE—continued

Regulation 6—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—2 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—10 penalty units.”.

Regulation 7—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—2 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—10 penalty units.”.

Regulation 8—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—5 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—25 penalty units.”.

Regulation 9—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—5 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—25 penalty units.”.

Regulation 10—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—2 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—10 penalty units.”.

Regulation 11—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—2 penalty units;
9

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



Regulations Revision (Penalties) No. 8, 1996
SCHEDULE—continued

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—10 penalty units.”.

Subregulation 12 (1)—
Add at the foot the following penalty provisions:
“Penalty for breach of paragraph (a) or (b):
(@) if the offender is a natural person—5 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—25 penalty units.
Penalty for breach of paragraph (c):
(@) if the offender is a natural person—2 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—10 penalty units.”.

Subregulation 12 (2)—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—2 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—10 penalty units.”.

Regulation 13—

Add at the foot the following penalty provision:

“Penalty:

(@) if the offender is a natural person—5 penalty units;

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—25 penalty units.”.
Regulation 14—

Add at the foot the following penalty provision:

“Penalty:

(@) if the offender is a natural person—2 penalty units;

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—10 penalty units.”.
Regulation 15—

Add at the foot the following penalty provision:

“Penalty:

(@) if the offender is a natural person—5 penalty units;

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—25 penalty units.”.

10

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



Regulations Revision (Penalties) No. 8, 1996
SCHEDULE—continued

Regulation 16—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—2 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—10 penalty units.”.

Subregulation 17 (1)—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—5 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—25 penalty units.”.

Regulation 18—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—2 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—10 penalty units.”.

Regulation 19—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—2 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—10 penalty units.”.

Regulation 20—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—2 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—10 penalty units.”.

Regulation 23—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
11

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



Regulations Revision (Penalties) No. 8, 1996
SCHEDULE—continued

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 24—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 35—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 36—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—5 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—25 penalty units.”.

Regulation 37—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 37A—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—5 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—25 penalty units.”.

Regulation 38—
Repeal the regulation.

12

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



Regulations Revision (Penalties) No. 8, 1996
SCHEDULE—continued

Public Health (Barbers’ Shops) Regulations
(made under the Public Health Act 1928)

Regulation 5—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:

(@)
(b)

if the offender is a natural person—10 penalty units;
if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Subregulation 6 (4)—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:

“Penalty:

(@) if the offender is a natural person—5 penalty units;

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—25 penalty units.”.
Regulation 7—

Repeal the regulation.
Regulation 8—

Add at the foot the following penalty provision:

“Penalty:

(@) if the offender is a natural person—5 penalty units;

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—25 penalty units.”.
Regulation 9—

Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty: 2 penalty units.”.

Regulation 11—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:

(a)
(b)

if the offender is a natural person—2 penalty units;
if the offender is a body corporate—10 penalty units.”.

13

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



Regulations Revision (Penalties) No. 8, 1996
SCHEDULE—continued

Regulation 12—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—2 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—10 penalty units.”.

Regulation 13—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—2 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—10 penalty units.”.

Regulation 14—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—2 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—10 penalty units.”.

Regulation 15—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—2 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—10 penalty units.”.

Regulation 17—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(a) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 18—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
14

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



Regulations Revision (Penalties) No. 8, 1996
SCHEDULE—continued

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 19—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty: 10 penalty units.”.

Regulation 21—
Repeal the regulation.

Regulation 22—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty for breach of paragraph (b):
(@) if the offender is a natural person—2 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—10 penalty units.”.

Public Health (Boarding-houses) Regulations
(made under the Public Health Act 1928)

Regulation 4—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(a) if the offender is a natural person—10 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 8—

Add at the foot the following penalty provision:

“Penalty:

(@) if the offender is a natural person—2 penalty units;

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—10 penalty units.”.
Regulation 9—

Add at the foot the following penalty provision:

“Penalty:

(@) if the offender is a natural person—2 penalty units;

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—10 penalty units.”.

15

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



Regulations Revision (Penalties) No. 8, 1996
SCHEDULE—continued

Regulation 10—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(a) if the offender is a natural person—10 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 12—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—5 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—25 penalty units.”.

Regulation 13—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—5 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—25 penalty units.”.

Regulation 14—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—5 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—25 penalty units.”.

Regulation 15—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—5 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—25 penalty units.”.

Regulation 16—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—5 penalty units;
16

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



Regulations Revision (Penalties) No. 8, 1996
SCHEDULE—continued

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—25 penalty units.”.

Regulation 17—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 18—
Repeal the regulation.

Public Health (Cancer Reporting) Regulations
(made under the Public Health Act 1928)

Subregulation 11 (1)—
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.
Public Health (Cervical Cytology) Regulations

(made under the Public Health Act 1928)

Subregulation 8 (1)—
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—10 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 9—
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

17

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



Regulations Revision (Penalties) No. 8, 1996
SCHEDULE—continued

Public Health (Dairy) Regulations
(made under the Public Health Act 1928)

Regulation 5—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 14—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Subregulation 18A (2)—
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Subregulation 18A (3)—
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(a) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Subregulation 19 (7)—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—5 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—25 penalty units.”.

18

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



Regulations Revision (Penalties) No. 8, 1996
SCHEDULE—continued

Subregulation 19 (8)—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty for breach of subregulation (8):
(a) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 20—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(a) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Subregulation 21 (1)—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 23—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 24—

Add at the foot the following penalty provision:

“Penalty:

(@) if the offender is a natural person—5 penalty units;

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—25 penalty units.”.
Regulation 26—

Add at the foot the following penalty provision:

“Penalty:

(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;

19

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



Regulations Revision (Penalties) No. 8, 1996
SCHEDULE—continued

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 27—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 28—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 29—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 30—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 31—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 32—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:

20

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



Regulations Revision (Penalties) No. 8, 1996
SCHEDULE—continued

“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—5 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—25 penalty units.”.

Regulation 33—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—5 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—25 penalty units.”.

Regulation 34—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—2 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—10 penalty units.”.

Regulation 35—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 36—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 37—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(a) if the offender is a natural person—10 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

21

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



Regulations Revision (Penalties) No. 8, 1996
SCHEDULE—continued

Regulation 39—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(a) if the offender is a natural person—10 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 40—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(a) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 41—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty for breach of subregulation (1) or (3):
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 42—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—5 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—25 penalty units.”.

Regulation 43—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(a) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 44—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
22

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



Regulations Revision (Penalties) No. 8, 1996
SCHEDULE—continued

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 44A—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—5 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—25 penalty units.”.

Regulation 45—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 46—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 47—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 48—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 48A—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:

23

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



Regulations Revision (Penalties) No. 8, 1996
SCHEDULE—continued

“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 49—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(a) if the offender is a natural person—10 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 50—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(a) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 51—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 51A—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 52—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(a) if the offender is a natural person—10 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

24

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



Regulations Revision (Penalties) No. 8, 1996
SCHEDULE—continued

Regulation 53—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(a) if the offender is a natural person—10 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 54—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(a) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 55—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 56—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 57—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(a) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 58—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
25

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



Regulations Revision (Penalties) No. 8, 1996
SCHEDULE—continued

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 59—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 59A—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 60—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 61—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty for breach of paragraph (a): 5 penalty units.”.

Regulation 62—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 63—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;

26

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



Regulations Revision (Penalties) No. 8, 1996
SCHEDULE—continued

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 63A—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 64—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 67—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 68—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty: 10 penalty units.”.

Regulation 69—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty: 10 penalty units.”.

Regulation 72—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty: 5 penalty units.”.

Regulation 73—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty: 10 penalty units.”.

27

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



Regulations Revision (Penalties) No. 8, 1996
SCHEDULE—continued

Regulation 74—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(a) if the offender is a natural person—10 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 75—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—5 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—25 penalty units.”.

Regulation 76—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—2 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—10 penalty units.”.

Regulation 78—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 79—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(a) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 80—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—2 penalty units;
28

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



Regulations Revision (Penalties) No. 8, 1996
SCHEDULE—continued

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—10 penalty units.”.

Regulation 81—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 82—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 83—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 85—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 86—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—5 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—25 penalty units.”.

Regulation 88—
Add at the end the following subregulation and penalty provision:

29

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



Regulations Revision (Penalties) No. 8, 1996
SCHEDULE—continued

“(3) A person shall not, without reasonable excuse, fail to comply
with a request made under subregulation (2).

Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 98—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 99—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty for breach of paragraph (a), (c), (d) or (e):
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 104—
(@) Omit paragraphs (a) and (b);
(b) Omit paragraphs (d) and (e), substitute the following paragraphs:
“(d) if the offender is a natural person—10 penalty units; or
(e) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.
Public Health (Eating Houses) Regulations
(made under the Public Health Act 1928)
Regulation 7—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.
Regulation 8—

Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
30

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



Regulations Revision (Penalties) No. 8, 1996
SCHEDULE—continued

“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Subregulation 9 (2)—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty for breach of subregulation (2):
(a) if the offender is a natural person—10 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 10—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(a) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 11—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 12—

Add at the foot the following penalty provision:

“Penalty:

(@) if the offender is a natural person—5 penalty units;

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—25 penalty units.”.
Regulation 13—

Add at the foot the following penalty provision:

“Penalty:

(a) if the offender is a natural person—10 penalty units;

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

31

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



Regulations Revision (Penalties) No. 8, 1996
SCHEDULE—continued

Regulation 14—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(a) if the offender is a natural person—10 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 16—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(a) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 17—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty: 5 penalty units.”.

Regulation 18—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—5 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—25 penalty units.”.

Regulation 19—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 22—
Repeal the regulation.

32

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



Regulations Revision (Penalties) No. 8, 1996
SCHEDULE—continued

Public Health (General Sanitation) Regulations
(made under the Public Health Act 1928)

Regulation 5—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 6—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 7—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 8—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(a) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 9—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

33

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



Regulations Revision (Penalties) No. 8, 1996
SCHEDULE—continued

Regulation 10—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(a) if the offender is a natural person—10 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 11—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(a) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 12—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 13—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 14—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(a) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 15—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
34

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



Regulations Revision (Penalties) No. 8, 1996
SCHEDULE—continued

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 16—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 17—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 18—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 19—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 20—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 21—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:

35

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



Regulations Revision (Penalties) No. 8, 1996
SCHEDULE—continued

“Penalty: 10 penalty units.”.

Regulation 22—

Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty: 10 penalty units.”.

Regulation 23—

Add at the foot the following penalty provision:

“Penalty:

(@) if the offender is a natural person—10 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 24—

Add at the foot the following penalty provision:

“Penalty:

(@) if the offender is a natural person—10 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 25—

Add at the foot the following penalty provision:

“Penalty:

(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 26—

Add at the foot the following penalty provision:

“Penalty:

(@) if the offender is a natural person—10 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 27—

Add at the foot the following penalty provision:

“Penalty for breach of subregulation (5):

(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

36

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



Regulations Revision (Penalties) No. 8, 1996
SCHEDULE—continued

Regulation 28—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty for breach of subregulation (3) or (5):
(a) if the offender is a natural person—10 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 32—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(a) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 33—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 35—
Repeal the regulation.

Public Health (Laundries, Dry Cleaning Establishments and Dye
Works) Regulations

(made under the Public Health Act 1928)

Regulation 4—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 5—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
37

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



Regulations Revision (Penalties) No. 8, 1996
SCHEDULE—continued

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 7—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 8—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 10—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 11—
Add at the end the following subregulation and penalty provision:

“(2) A proprietor shall comply with any notice served on him or her
under subregulation (1).

Penalty:
(a) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.
Regulation 13—
Repeal the regulation.

38

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



Regulations Revision (Penalties) No. 8, 1996
SCHEDULE—continued

Public Health (Meat) Regulations
(made under the Public Health Act 1928)

Subregulation 3 (1)—

Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision:

“Penalty:

(a) if the offender is a natural person—10 penalty units;

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.
Regulation 7—

Add at the foot the following penalty provision:

“Penalty:

(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.
Regulation 9—

Add at the foot the following penalty provision:

“Penalty:

(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 10—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.
Regulation 11—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(a) if the offender is a natural person—10 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

39

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



Regulations Revision (Penalties) No. 8, 1996
SCHEDULE—continued

Regulation 12—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(a) if the offender is a natural person—10 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 13—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(a) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 14—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 15—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty: 10 penalty units.”.

Regulation 16—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty: 10 penalty units.”.

Regulation 17 (penalty provision)—
Omit “$250”, substitute “10 penalty units”.

Regulation 18—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

40

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



Regulations Revision (Penalties) No. 8, 1996
SCHEDULE—continued

Regulation 20—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(a) if the offender is a natural person—10 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 21—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Subregulation 23 (1)—
Omit the subregulation.

Regulation 24—
Repeal the regulation.

Public Health (Piggeries) Regulations
(made under the Public Health Act 1928)

Regulation 3—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(a) if the offender is a natural person—10 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 5—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(a) if the offender is a natural person—10 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 6—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:

41

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



Regulations Revision (Penalties) No. 8, 1996
SCHEDULE—continued

“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 7—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 8—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(a) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 9—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 10—

Repeal the regulation.

Public Health (Sale of Food and Drugs) Regulations
(made under the Public Health Act 1928)

Regulation 9—

Add at the foot the following penalty provision:

“Penalty:

(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

42

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



Regulations Revision (Penalties) No. 8, 1996
SCHEDULE—continued

Regulation 10—
Add at the end “punishable on conviction by a fine not exceeding—
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Subregulation 12 (4)—
Add at the end “punishable on conviction by a fine not exceeding—
(a) if the offender is a natural person—10 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Subregulation 13 (2)—

After “offence” insert “punishable on conviction by a fine not
exceeding—

(@) if the offender is a natural person—10 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 14—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—10 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.
Regulation 15—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—10 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.
Subregulation 16 (2)—
Add at the end “punishable on conviction by a fine not exceeding—
(@) if the offender is a natural person—10 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Subregulation 16 (5)—
Add at the end “punishable on conviction by a fine not exceeding—
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;

43

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



Regulations Revision (Penalties) No. 8, 1996
SCHEDULE—continued

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Subregulation 19 (5)—
Add at the end “punishable on conviction by a fine not exceeding—
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 20—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty: 10 penalty units.”.

Subregulation 21 (3)—

Add at the end “punishable on conviction by a fine not exceeding 10
penalty units”.

Regulation 22—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty: 10 penalty units.”.

Regulation 23—

After “offence” insert “punishable on conviction by a fine not
exceeding 10 penalty units”.
Regulation 24—

Add at the foot the following penalty provision:

“Penalty:

(a) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 25—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 26—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
44

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



Regulations Revision (Penalties) No. 8, 1996
SCHEDULE—continued

“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 27—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(a) if the offender is a natural person—10 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 27A—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(a) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 28—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 29—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 31—
Add at the end the following subregulation:

“(3) An offence against this regulation is punishable, on conviction,
by a fine not exceeding—

(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

45

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



Regulations Revision (Penalties) No. 8, 1996
SCHEDULE—continued

Regulation 32—
Add at the end the following subregulation:

“(2) An offence against this regulation is punishable, on conviction,
by a fine not exceeding—

(@) if the offender is a natural person—5 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—25 penalty units.”.

Regulation 32A—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 33—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(a) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 34—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 35—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 36—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(a) if the offender is a natural person—10 penalty units;
46

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



Regulations Revision (Penalties) No. 8, 1996
SCHEDULE—continued

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 37—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 38—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 39—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 40—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 41—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—5 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—25 penalty units.”.

Regulation 42—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:

47

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



Regulations Revision (Penalties) No. 8, 1996
SCHEDULE—continued

“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 43—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(a) if the offender is a natural person—10 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 44—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—5 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—25 penalty units.”.

Regulation 45—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 46—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 47—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(a) if the offender is a natural person—10 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

48

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



Regulations Revision (Penalties) No. 8, 1996
SCHEDULE—continued

Regulation 48—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(a) if the offender is a natural person—10 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 49—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(a) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 50—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 51—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 52—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty: 5 penalty units.”.

Regulation 53—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(a) if the offender is a natural person—10 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

49

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



Regulations Revision (Penalties) No. 8, 1996
SCHEDULE—continued

Regulation 54—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(a) if the offender is a natural person—10 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 55—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(a) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 56—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 57—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 59—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(a) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 60—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(a) if the offender is a natural person—10 penalty units;

50

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



(b)

Regulations Revision (Penalties) No. 8, 1996
SCHEDULE—continued

if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Subregulation 61 (1)—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:

(@)
(b)

if the offender is a natural person—10 penalty units;
if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Subregulation 61 (2)—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty: 10 penalty units.”.

Regulation 62—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty: 10 penalty units.”.

Regulation 63—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:

(@)
()

if the offender is a natural person—10 penalty units;
if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 64—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:

(@)
(b)

if the offender is a natural person—10 penalty units;
if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 66—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty: 10 penalty units.”.

Regulation 67—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:

(@)

if the offender is a natural person—10 penalty units;
51

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



Regulations Revision (Penalties) No. 8, 1996
SCHEDULE—continued

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 68—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—5 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—25 penalty units.”.

Regulation 69—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 70—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 71—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 73—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 74—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:

52

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



Regulations Revision (Penalties) No. 8, 1996
SCHEDULE—continued

“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 75—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(a) if the offender is a natural person—10 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 76—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(a) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 77—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty: 10 penalty units.”.

Regulation 78—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty for breach of paragraph (a) or (g): 10 penalty units.
Penalty for breach of any other paragraph:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 79—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(a) if the offender is a natural person—10 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

53

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



Regulations Revision (Penalties) No. 8, 1996
SCHEDULE—continued

Regulation 80—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(a) if the offender is a natural person—10 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 82—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(a) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 83—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 84—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 85—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(a) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 86—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
54

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



Regulations Revision (Penalties) No. 8, 1996
SCHEDULE—continued

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 87—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty: 10 penalty units.”.

Regulation 88—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 89—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 90—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty: 10 penalty units.”.

Regulation 91—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty for breach of subregulation (2):
(a) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.
Regulation 92—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

55

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



Regulations Revision (Penalties) No. 8, 1996
SCHEDULE—continued

Regulation 93—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—5 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—25 penalty units.”.

Regulation 95A—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty for breach of subregulation (2), (4) or (6):
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 96—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 97—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 98—

Add at the end the following subregulation:

“(3) An offence against this regulation is punishable, on conviction,
by a fine not exceeding—

(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 99—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty: 10 penalty units.”.

56

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



Regulations Revision (Penalties) No. 8, 1996
SCHEDULE—continued

Regulation 100—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(a) if the offender is a natural person—10 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 102—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(a) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 105—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—5 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—25 penalty units.”.

Regulation 106—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 107—
Repeal the regulation.

Public Parks Regulations
(made under the Public Parks Act 1928)

Regulation 16—

Add at the end “punishable on conviction by a fine not exceeding 10
penalty units”.

57

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



Regulations Revision (Penalties) No. 8, 1996
SCHEDULE—continued

Regulation 17—

Add at the end “punishable on conviction by a fine not exceeding 5
penalty units”.
Regulation 18—

Add at the end “punishable on conviction by a fine not exceeding 5
penalty units”.
Regulation 18A—

Add at the foot the following penalty provision:

“Penalty: 10 penalty units.”.

Regulation 19—

Add at the end “punishable on conviction by a fine not exceeding 5
penalty units”.
Regulation 20—

Add at the foot the following penalty provision:

“Penalty: 5 penalty units.”.

Regulation 21—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 22—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(a) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 23—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;

58

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



Regulations Revision (Penalties) No. 8, 1996
SCHEDULE—continued

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 24—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Regulation 25—
Add at the foot the following penalty provision:
“Penalty: 5 penalty units.”.

Regulation 26—
Repeal the regulation.

Rabbit Destruction Regulations
(made under the Rabbit Destruction Act 1919)

Regulation 24—
Omit the regulation, substitute the following regulation:

Penalty for keeping noxious animals
“24. A person shall not, without the permission of the Minister—
(@) have or keep in his or her possession or in captivity; or
(b)  wilfully liberate or attempt to liberate;
any noxious animal.
Penalty:
(@) if the offender is a natural person—210 penalty units;
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.”.

Weapons Regulations
(made under the Weapons Act 1991)

Subregulation 7 (3) (penalty provision)—

Omit “$1,000” and “$10,000”, substitute “10 penalty units” and “50
penalty units”, respectively.

59

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



Regulations Revision (Penalties) No. 8, 1996
SCHEDULE—continued

Subregulation 7 (4) (penalty provision)—

Omit “$1,000” and “$10,000”, substitute “10 penalty units” and “50
penalty units”, respectively.
Subregulation 16 (1) (penalty provision)—

Omit “$1,000” and “$10,000”, substitute “10 penalty units” and “50
penalty units”, respectively.

NOTES

Notification
1.  Notified in the ACT Gazette on 6 June 1996.

Penalty units

See section 33AA of the Interpretation Act 1967 and section 9 of the Subordinate Laws
Act 1989.

© Australian Capital Territory 1996

60

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



		(02)+61 2 6205 3700
	2013-07-25T13:15:20+1000
	Canberra
	ACT Parliamentary Counsel
	Document is authorised




