
No. 35 of 1976 

AN ORDINANCE 
To amend the Sewerage Rates Ordinance 1968. 

I, T H E G O V E R N O R - G E N E R A L of the C o m m o n w e a l t h of Aust ra l ia , 
acting with the advice of the Federa l Execut ive Counci l , hereby m a k e 
the following Ord inance unde r the Seat of Government (Administration) 
Act 1910 . 

Da ted this nineteenth day of Augus t , 1976 . 

J O H N R . K E R R 
Governor -Genera l . 

By His Excellency's C o m m a n d , 

A . A . S T A L E Y 
Minister of State for the Cap i ta l Terr i tory. 

S E W E R A G E R A T E S ( A M E N D M E N T ) O R D I N A N C E 1976 

1. This Ord inance may be cited as the Sewerage Rates (Amend­
ment) Ordinance 1976 .* 

2 . I n this Ord inance , " Pr incipal Ord inance " means the Sewerage 
Rates Ordinance 1968 . f 

3 . T h e Pr incipal Ord inance is amended as set ou t in the following 
t a b l e : — 

P r o v i s i o n A m e n d m e n t 

Paragraph 8 (1) (a) Omit " $36.70 ", substitute " $40.80 ". 
Paragraph 8(1) (b) Omit " $36.70 " (wherever occurring), substitute " $40.80 ". 
Paragraph 8 (1) (c) . . Omit " $36.70 ", substitute " $40.80 ". 
Sub-paragraph 8 (1) (d) (i) . . Omit " $36.70 ", substitute " $40.80 ". 
Sub-paragraph 8 (1) (d) (ii) . . (a) Omit "Twenty-five dollars", substitute " $40.80". 

(b) Omit " $18.35 ", substitute " $20.40 ". 
Sub-paragraph 8 (1) (e) (i) . . (a) Omit " $36.70 ", substitute " $40.80 ". 

(b) Omit " $34.60 ", substitute " $38.40 ". 
Sub-paragraph 8 (1) (e) (ii) . . Omit " $36.70 ", substitute " $40.80 ". 
Sub-paragraph 8 (1) (e) (iii) . . (a) Omit " $36.70 ", substitute " $40.80 ". 

(b) Omit " $34.60 ", substitute " $38.40 ". 
Sub-section 8 (2) . . Omit " $36.70 ", substitute " $40.80 ". 
Sub-section 12 (2) . . Omit " $36.70 ", substitute " $40.80 ". 
Paragraph 16 (1) (c) Omit " $36.70 ", substitute " $40.80 ". 

* N o t i f i e d in the Australian Government Gazette o n 2 4 A u g u s t 1976 . 
t O r d i n a n c e N o . 3 0 , 1968 , as a m e n d e d b y N o . 2 2 , 1 9 6 9 ; N o . 5 0 , 1 9 7 0 ; N o . 2 5 , 1 9 7 2 ; N o . 2 5 , 1 9 7 3 ; N o . 30 

1 9 7 4 ; a n d N o . 2 1 , 1 9 7 5 . 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



4. The Principal Ordinance is further amended as set out in the 
Schedule. 

5. The amendments made by section 3 apply to and in relation 
to the rating year that commenced on 1 July 1976 and to and in 
relation to each subsequent rating year. 

SCHEDULE Section 4 

P r o v i s i o n A m e n d m e n t 

Paragraph 5A (1) (b) . . Omit " Australia ", substitute " the Commonwealth ". 
Paragraph 5A (1) (c) . . Omit " Australia ", substitute " the Commonwealth ". 
Paragraph 5A (1) (d) . . Omit " Australia " (wherever occurring), substitute " the Com­

monwealth ". 
Paragraph 6 (1) (c) . . . . Omit " Australia ", substitute " the Commonwealth ". 
Paragraph 8 (1) (c) . . . . Omit " Australia ", substitute " the Commonwealth ". 
Sub-section 8 (2) . . . . Omit " Australia ", substitute " the Commonwealth ". 
Sub-section 11 (1) . . . . Omit " Australia ", substitute " the Commonwealth ". 
Paragraph 11 (1) (i) . . Omit " Australia ", substitute " the Commonwealth ". 
Sub-section 12 (1) . . . . Omit " Australia ", substitute " the Commonwealth ". 
Sub-section 12 (2) . . . . Omit " Australia ", substitute " the Commonwealth ". 
Sub-section 12 (3) . . . . Omit " Australia ", substitute " the Commonwealth ". 
Paragraph 12 (3) (b) . . Omit " Australia ", substitute " the Commonwealth ". 
Paragraph 13(1) (a) . . Omit " Australia ", substitute " the Commonwealth ". 
Sub-section 13 (2) . . . . Omit " Australia ", substitute " The Commonwealth ". 
Sub-section 13 (3A) . . Omit " Australia ", substitute " the Commonwealth ". 
Sub-section 13 (4) . . . . Omit "Austral ia" (wherever occurring), substitute "the Com­

monwealth ". 
Paragraph 14 (1) (b) . . Omit " Australia ", substitute " the Commonwealth ". 
Paragraph 14 (1) (c) . . Omit " Australia ", substitute " the Commonwealth ". 
Paragraph 14 (1) (d) . . Omit " Australia ", substitute " the Commonwealth ". 
Sub-section 14 (2) . . . . Omit " Australia ", substitute " the Commonwealth ". 
Sub-section 14 (3) . . . . Omit " Australia ", substitute " the Commonwealth ". 
Sub-section 15 (1) . . . . Omit " Australia ", substitute " the Commonwealth ". 
Sub-section 15 (2) . . . . Omit " Australia ", substitute " the Commonwealth ". 
Sub-section 15(4) . . Omit "Austral ia" (wherever occurring), substitute "the Com­

monwealth ". 
Sub-section 1 6 ( 1 ) . . Omit " Australia ", substitute " the Commonwealth ". 
Sub-section 19 (2) . . . . Omit " Australia ", substitute " the Commonwealth ". 
Paragraph 19A (1) (b) . . Omit " Australia ". substitute " the Commonwealth ". 
Paragraph 19A (1) (c) . . Omit " Australia ", substitute " the Commonwealth ". 
Section 20 . . . . Omit " Australia ", substitute " the Commonwealth ". 
Sub-section 21 (1) . . . . Omit "Austral ia" (wherever occurring), substitute "the Com­

monwealth ". 
Sub-section 21 (2) . . . . Omit " Australia ", substitute " the Commonwealth ". 
Sub-paragraph 24 (1) (b) (i) . . Omit " Australia ", substitute " the Commonwealth ". 
Sub-section 27 (3) . . . . Omit " Australia ", substitute " the Commonwealth ". 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au


		(02)+61 2 6205 3700
	2010-04-15T12:34:57+1000
	Canberra
	ACT Parliamentary Counsel
	Document is authorised




