
Sewerage Rates (Amendment) Ordinance 
1981 

No. 28 of 1981 

I, THE GOVERNOR-GENERAL of the Commonwealth of Australia, acting 
with the advice of the Federal Executive Council, hereby make the following 
Ordinance under the Seat of Government {Administration) Act 1910. 

Dated 16 September 1981. 

ZELMAN COWEN 
Governor-General 

By His Excellency's Command, 

MICHAEL HODGMAN 
Minister of State for the Capital Territory 

An Ordinance to amend the Sewerage Rates Ordinance 1968 
Short title 

1. This Ordinance may be cited as the Sewerage Rates {Amendment) 
Ordinance 1981. 1 

Principal Ordinance 
2. In this Ordinance, "Principal Ordinance" means the Sewerage Rates 

Ordinance 1968. 2 

Alteration of rates 
3. The Principal Ordinance is amended as set out in the following table: 

Provision Amendment 

Paragraph 8 (1) (a) . . . . Omit "SI 10", substitute "$120". 
Paragraph 8 (1) (b) . . . . Omit "8110" (wherever occurring), substitute "S120". 
Paragraph 8 (1) (c) . . . . Omit "$110", substitute "$120". 
Sub-paragraph 8 (1) (d) (i) . . Omit "$110", substitute "$120". 
Sub-paragraph 8 (1) (d) (ii) . . (a) Omit "8110", substitute "8120". 

(b) Omit "855", substitute "860". 
Sub-paragraph 8 (1) (e) (i) . . (a) Omit "8110", substitute "8120". 

(b) Omit "8104", substitute "8113". 
Sub-paragraph 8 (1) (e) (ii) . . Omit "8110", substitute "$120". 
Sub-paragraph 8 (1) (e) (iii) . . (a) Omit "8110", substitute "8120". 

(b) Omit "$104", substitute "$113". 
Sub-section 8 (2) Omit "8110", substitute "8120". 
Sub-section 12 (2) Omit "$110", substitute "$120". 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



Application 
4. (1) The Principal Ordinance, as amended by this Ordinance, applies to 

and in relation to sewerage rates imposed in respect of the rating year that 
commenced on 1 July 1981 and each subsequent rating year. 

(2) An expression in this section that is defined in the Principal Ordinance 
as amended by this Ordinance has the same meaning for the purposes of this 
section as it has in the Principal Ordinance as so amended. 

NOTES 

I. Notified in the Commonwealth of Australia Gazette on 18 September 1981. 

7. No . 30, 1968 as amended by No. 22, 1969; No. 50, 1970; No. 25, 1972; No. 25. 1973; 
N o . 30. 1974; N o . 21, 1975; No . 35, 1976; Nos. 9. 43 and 46, 1977; No. 27, 1978: 
N o . 27, 1979; Nos . 18, 30 and 35, 1980. 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au


		(02)+61 2 6205 3700
	2009-08-20T11:17:45+1000
	Canberra
	ACT Parliamentary Counsel
	Document is authorised




