
1993 

THE LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY 
FOR THE AUSTRALIAN CAPITAL TERRITORY 

(As presented) 

(Attorney-General) 

Statute Law Revision (Penalties) Bill 1993 

A BILL 
FOR 

An Act to revise the statute law of the Territory in 
relation to penalties and for related penalties 

The Legislative Assembly for the Australian Capital Territory enacts as 
follows: 

PART I—PRELIMINARY 

Short title 
5 1. This Act may be cited as the Statute Law Revision (Penalties) Act 

1993. 

Commencement 
2. (1) Section 1 and this section commence on the day on which this 

Act is notified in the Gazette. 

10 (2) Section 3 commences on a day fixed by the Minister by notice in 
the Gazette. 

Job No.: 1993/143 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.qov.au 



2 Statute Law Revision (Penalties) No. . 1993 

(3) If section 3 has not commenced before the end of the period of 6 
months commencing on the day on which this Act is notified in the Gazette, 
that section, by force of this subsection, commences on the first day after 
the end of that period. 

Amendments of Acts 
3. The Acts specified in the Schedule are amended as set out in that 

Schedule. 

SCHEDULE seciioo 3 

AMENDMENTS OF ACTS 

Administrative Appeals Tribunal Act 1989 

Section 52 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000" and "3 months", substitute "5a penalty units" and "6 

months, or both" respectively. 

Section 53 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000" and "3 months", substitute "50 penalty units" and "6 

months, or both" respectively. 

Section 54 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000" and "3 months", substitute "50 penalty units" and "6 

months, or both" respectively. 

Section 55 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000" and "3 months", substitute "50 penalty units" and "6 

months, or both" respectively. 

Adoption Act 1993 

Section 89 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$50,000" and "5 years", substitute "500 penalty units" and "5 

years, or both" respectively. 

Section 90 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$20,000" and "2 years", substitute "200 penalty units" and "2 

years, or both" respectively. 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov. 



Statute Law Revision (Penalties) No. , 1993 3 

SCHEDULE—continued 

Section 91 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$5,000" and "6 months", substitute "50 penalty units" and "6 

months, or both" respectively. 

Subsection 94 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$50,000" and "5 years", substitute "500 penalty units" and "5 

years, or both" respectively. 

Section 95 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$20,000" and "2 years", substitute "200 penalty units" and "2 

years, or both" respectively. 

Subsection 96 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$5,000" and "6 months", substitute "50 penalty units" and "6 

months, or both" respectively. 

Subsection 97 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$20,000" and "2 years", substitute "200 penalty units" and "2 

years, or both" respectively. 

Section 98 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$20,000" and "2 years", substitute "200 penalty units" and "2 

years, or both" respectively. 

Section 99 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$20,000" and "2 years", substitute "200 penalty units" and "2 

years, or both" respectively. 

Section 100 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$20,000" and "2 years", substitute "200 penalty units" and "2 

years, or both" respectively. 

Section 101 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$5,000" and "6 months", substitute "50 penalty units" and "6 

months, or both" respectively. 

Section 102 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$20,000" and "2 years", substitute "200 penalty units" and "2 

years, or both" respectively. 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au 



4 Statute Law Revision (Penalties) No. , 1993 

SCHEDULE—continued 

Air Pollution Act 1984 

Section 42— 
Repeal the section, substitute the following section: 

Obstruction of Authority or inspector 
"42. A person shall not, without reasonable excuse— 

(a) obstruct or hinder the Authority or an inspector in the exercise of 
his or her powers under this Act; or 

(b) fail to comply with a reasonable requirement of the Authority or an 
inspector who has entered upon or in any premises in pursuance of 
this Act 

Penalty: 

(a) for a breach of paragraph (a)— 

(i) if the offender is a natural person—50 penalty units or 
imprisonment for 6 months, or both; or 

(ii) if the offender is a body corporate—250 penalty units; or 

(b) for a breach of paragraph (b)— 

(i) if the offender is a natural person—50 penalty units; or 

(ii) if the offender is a body corporate—250 penalty units.". 

Paragraph 49 (1) (d)— 
Omit the paragraph, substitute the following paragraph: 

"(d) prescribing penalties for offences against the regulations not 
exceeding— 

(i) if the offender is a natural person—50 penalty units or 
imprisonment for 6 months, or both; or 

(ii) if the offender is a body corporate—250 penalty units.". 

Animal Nuisance Control Act 1975 

Subsection 14 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$100", substitute "SO penalty units or imprisonment for 6 

months, or both". 

Subsection 16 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$100", substitute "50 penalty units or imprisonment for 6 

months, or both". 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at vmw.legislation.xt.gov.au 



Statute Law Revision (Penalties) No. , 1993 5 

SCHEDULE—continued 

Annual Holidays Act 1973 

Subsection 15 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit 'Two hundred dollars", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Subsection 15 (2)— 
Omit 'Two hundred dollars", substitute "30 penalty units". 

Apiaries Act 1928 

Section 11 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "Forty dollars", substitute "10 penalty units". 

Subsection 12 (2) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "Forty dollars", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Subsection 14 (7) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "Forty dollars", substitute "10 penalty units". 

Section 17— 
Repeal the section, substitute the following section: 

Offences and penalties 
"17. (1) A person shall not, without reasonable excuse, obstruct an 

inspector in the exercise of his or her duties under this Act 

Penalty: 50 penalty units or imprisonment for 6 months, or both. 

"(2) A person who— 
(a) fails, without reasonable excuse, to comply with any order or 

direction given under this Act; or 
(b) commits any other breach of this Act; 

is guilty of an offence punishable, where no other penalty is provided, by a 
fine not exceeding 10 penalty units. 

"(3) Where a person fails to comply with an order or direction given 
under this Act, the inspector may carry out the necessary work at the 
expense of the person failing to comply.". 

Paragraph 19 (d)— 
Omit "Forty dollars", substitute "10 penalty units". 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at nvww.legislation.act.gov. 



6 Statute Law Revision (Penalties) No. , 1993 

SCHEDULE—continued 

Audit Act 1989 

Subsection 21 (2) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$2,000", "12 months" and "$10,000", substitute "50 penalty 

units", "6 months" and "250 penalty units" respectively. 

Subsection 29 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$5,000" and "2 years", substitute "50 penalty units" and "6 

months" respectively. 

Subsection 31 (2) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$5,000" and "2 years", substitute "50 penalty units" and "6 

months" respectively. 

Subsection 32 (4) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$5,000" and "2 years", substitute "50 penalty units" and "6 

months" respectively. 

Subsection 42 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$5,000" and "2 years", substitute "50 penalty unite" and "6 

months" respectively. 

Subsection 42 (2) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$5,000" and "2 years", substitute "50 penalty unite" and "6 

months" respectively. 

Subsection 59 (2) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$500", substitute "50 penalty unite or imprisonment for 6 

months, or both". 

Section 91 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$10,000". substitute "100 penalty unite". 

Subsection 92 (7) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000" and "$5,000", subsUtute "50 penalty unite" and "250 

penalty unite" respectively. 

Subsection 92 (8) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$2,000", "12 months" and "$10,000", substitute "50 penalty 

units", "6 months" and "250 penalty unite" respectively. 

Section 95 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$10,000", subsUtute "100 penalty unite". 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov. 



Statute Law Revision (Penalties) No. ,1993 7 
SCHEDULE—continued 

Subsection 96 (7) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000" and "$5,000", substitute "50 penalty units" and "250 

penalty unite" respectively. 

Subsection 96 (8) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$2,000", "12 months" and "$10,000", substitute "50 penalty 

unite", "6 months" and "250 penalty units" respectively. 

Subsection 102 (4) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000" and "$5,000", substitute "50 penalty units" and "250 

penalty unite" respectively. 

Subsection 108 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$20,000" and "7 years", substitute "500 penalty units" and "5 

years" respectively. 

Subsection 108 (2) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$5,000" and "2 years", substitute "50 penalty unite" and "6 

months" respectively. 

Section 109— 
Omit "$20,000", substitute "500 penalty unite". 

Section 110— 
Omit "$20,000" and "10 years", substitute "500 penalty units" and "5 

years" respectively. 

Subsection 111 (4)— 
Omit "$10,000" and "5 years", substitute "50 penalty units" and "6 

months" respectively. 

Subsection 112 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000", substitute "50 penalty unite or imprisonment for 6 

months, or both". 

Section 113 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$10,000" and "5 years", substitute "50 penalty unite" and "6 

months" respectively. 

Bail Act 1992 

Subsection 49 (1)— 
Omit "$20,000", substitute "200 penalty unite". 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov. 



8 Statute Law Revision (Penalties) No. . 1993 
SCHEDULE—continued 

Section 50— 
Omit "$20,000". substitute "200 penalty units". 

Subsection 51 (1)— 
Omit "$20,000", substitute "200 penalty units". 

Building Act 1972 

Subsection 8 (4)— 
Omit "$100", substitute "1 penalty unit". 

Paragraph 9 (8) (a)— 
Omit "$5,000", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Paragraph 9 (8) (b>— 
Omit "$25,000", substitute "250 penalty units". 

Paragraph 9A (17) (a)— 
Omit "$5,000", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Paragraph 9A (17) (b)— 
Omit "$25,000", substitute "250 penalty units". 

Paragraph 9C (10) (a)— 
Omit "$5,000", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Paragraph 9C (10) (b)— 
Omit "$25,000". substitute "250 penalty units". 

Subsection 14 (7) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$2,000" and "$10,000". substitute "50 penalty units" and "250 

penalty units" respectively. 

Subsection 14 (7A) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$5,000" and "$25,000". substitute "50 penalty units" and "250 

penalty units" respectively. 

Subsection 29 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$5,000" and "$25,000", substitute "50 penalty units" and "250 

penalty units" respectively. 

Paragraph 30 (4) (a)— 
Omit "$2,000", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov. 



Statute Law Revision (Penalties) No. , 1993 9 
SCHEDULE—continued 

Paragraph 30 (4) (b)— 
Omit "$10,000", substitute "250 penalty units". 

Paragraph 30 (4A) (a>— 
Omit "$5,000", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Paragraph 30 (4A) (b)— 
Omit "$25,000", substitute "250 penalty units". 

Subsection 36 (5) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000" and "$5,000", substitute "10 penalty units" and "50 

penalty units" respectively. 

Section 42B (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$2,000" and "$10,000", substitute "50 penalty units" and "250 

penalty units" respectively. 

Section 42E (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$500" and "$2,500", substitute "5 penalty units" and "25 penalty 

units" respectively. 

Subsection 51 (1)— 
Add at the end the following penalty provision: 

"Penalty: 

(a) if the offender is a natural person—50 penalty units; 

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—250 penalty units.". 

Subsection 51 (2)— 
Omit the subsection. 

Section 51H (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000", substitute "50 penalty units or imprisonment for 6 

months, or both". 

Subsection 51J (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$5,000" and "$25,000", substitute "50 penalty units" and "250 

penalty units" respectively. 

Paragraph 51K (2) (a)— 
Omit "$5,000", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov. 



10 Statute Law Revision (Penalties) No. . 1993 
SCHEDULE—continued 

Paragraph 51K (2) ( b ) ~ 
Omit "$25,000", substitute "250 penalty units". 

Subsection 51N (2>— 

Omit the subsection, substitute the following penalty provision: 

"Penalty: 

(a) if the offender is a natural person—50 penalty units; 
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—250 penalty units". 

Subsection 53 (4A)— 
Add at the end the following penalty provision: 

"Penalty: 

(a) if the offender is a natural person—50 penalty units; 

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—250 penalty units". 

Subsection 53 (4B>— 
Omit the subsection. 

Subsection 53A (2) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000" and "$5,000", substitute "10 penalty units" and "50 

penalty units" respectively. 

Subsection 54 (2) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000" and "$5,000", substitute "50 penalty units" and "250 

penalty units" respectively. 

Subsection 54A (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000" and "$5,000", substitute "50 penalty units" and "250 

penalty units" respectively. 

Paragraph 55 (3) (a)— 
Omit "$500", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Paragraph 55 (3) (b>— 
Omit "$2,500". substitute "250 penalty units". 

Subsection 57 (4) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000" and "$5,000", substitute "5 penalty units" and "25 

penalty units" respectively. 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at vmw.legislation.act.gov. 



Statute Law Revision (Penalties) No. .1993 11 
SCHEDULE—continued 

Section 58 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$2,000" and "$10,000", subsUtute "50 penalty units" and "250 

penalty units" respectively. 

Subsection 58G (2) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$5,000", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Paragraph 59A (c)— 
Omit "$5,000", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Paragraph 59A (d)— 
Omit "$25,000", substitute '750 penalty units". 

Buildings (Design and Siting) Act 1964 

Paragraph 6 (1) (a)— 
Omit "$20,000", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Paragraph 6 (1) (b)— 
Omit "$20,000", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Bushfire Act 1936 

Subsection 5 (3) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$100", substitute "1 penalty unit". 

Subsection 5AC (6) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000" and "3 months", substitute "50 penalty units" and "6 

months" respectively. 

Subsection SS (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000" and "3 months", substitute "50 penalty units" and "6 

months" respectively. 

Section 6 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000" and "3 months", substitute "50 penalty units" and "6 

months, or both" respectively. 

Section 7 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000" and "3 months", substitute "50 penalty units" and "6 

months, or both" respectively. 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov. 



12 Statute Law Revision (Penalties) No. . 1993 

SCHEDULE—continued 

Subsection 7A (1)— 
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision: 

"Penalty: SO penalty units or imprisonment for 6 months, or both.". 

Section 8 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$100", substitute "10 penalty units". 

Section 9— 
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision: 

"Penalty: 50 penalty units or imprisonment for 6 months, or both.". 

Section 10AB— 
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision: 

"Penalty: 50 penalty units or imprisonment for 6 months, or both.". 

Section 10A— 
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision: 

"Penalty: 50 penalty units or imprisonment for 6 months, or both.". 

Subsection 10B (2)— 
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision: 

"Penalty: 50 penalty units or imprisonment for 6 months, or both.". 

Section IOC-
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision: 

"Penalty: 50 penalty units or imprisonment for 6 months, or both.". 

Subsection 14 (2) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$500", substitute "5 penalty units". 

Section 15 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$2,000" and "6 months", substitute "50 penalty units" and "6 

months, or both" respectively. 

Paragraph 17 (d)— 
Omit the paragraph, substitute the following paragraph: 

"(d) the imposition of penalties, not exceeding— 

(i) if the offender is a natural person—10 penalty units; or 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at viww.legislation.act.gov. 



Statute Law Revision (Penalties) No. , 1993 13 

SCHEDULE—continued 

(ii) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.". 

Business Franchise (Tobacco and Petroleum Products) Act 
1984 

Paragraph 24 (1) (a)— 
Omit "$25,000", substitute "500 penalty units". 

Paragraph 24 (1) (b>— 
Omit "$5,000" and "2 years", substitute "100 penalty units" and "12 

months" respectively. 

Paragraph 24 (2) (a)— 
Omit "$ 15,000", substitute "250 penalty units". 

Paragraph 24 (2) (b>— 
Omit "$2,000" and "12 months", substitute "50 penalty units" and "6 

months" respectively. 

Paragraph 24 (3) (a)— 
Omit "$10,000", substitute "250 penalty unite". 

Paragraph 24 (3) (b)— 
Omit "$2,000" and "12 months", substitute "50 penalty units" and "6 

months" respectively. 

Paragraph 24 (4) (a)— 
Omit "$10,000", substitute "250 penalty units". 

Paragraph 24 (4) (b)— 
Omit "$2,000", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Paragraph 25 (1) (a)— 
Omit "$50,000", substitute "500 penalty units". 

Paragraph 25 (1) (b)— 
Omit "$10,000" and "5 years", substitute "100 penalty units" and "12 

months" respectively. 

Paragraph 25 (2) (a)— 
Omit "$25,000", substitute "250 penalty units". 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov. 



14 Statute Law Revision (Penalties) No. , 1993 

SCHEDULE—continued 

Paragraph 25 (2) (by— 
Omit "$5,000" and "2 years", substitute "50 penalty units" and "6 

months" respectively. 

Paragraph 25 (3) (ay-
Omit "$10,000", substitute "250 penalty units". 

Paragraph 25 (3) (by-
Omit "$2,000", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Paragraph 25 (3A) (ay -
Omit "$10,000", substitute "250 penalty units". 

Paragraph 25 (3A) (by -
Omit "$2,000" and "12 months", substitute "50 penalty units" and "6 

months" respectively. 

Paragraph 34 (4) (ay-
Omit "$500", substitute "5 penalty units". 

Paragraph 34 (4) (by-
Omit "$2,500", substitute "25 penalty units". 

Section 36K (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$2,000" and "$10,000", substitute "30 penalty units" and "150 

penalty units" respectively. 

Subsection 40 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$500", substitute "5 penalty units". 

Subsection 40 (2) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$ 1,000", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Subsection 40 (3) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$2,000", substitute "5 penalty units". 

Subsection 40 (4) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$5,000", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Business Franchise ("X" Videos) Act 1990 
Subsection 7 (2) (penalty provision)— 

Omit "$2,000", substitute "20 penalty units". 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au 



Statute Law Revision (Penalties) No. .1993 15 

SCHEDULE—continued 

Subsection 11 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$2,000", subsutute "20 penalty units". 

Section 12 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$2,000", substitute "20 penalty units". 

Section 13 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$500", substitute "20 penalty units". 

Subsection 14 (3) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$2,000", subsutute "20 penalty units". 

Section 15 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$500", subsutute "5 penalty units". 

Subsection 24 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$5,000" and "2 years", substitute "100 penalty units" and "12 

months" respectively. 

Subsection 24 (2) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$2,000 or imprisonment for 1 year, or both", substitute "50 

penalty units". 

Section 25 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$2,000 or imprisonment for 1 year, or both", substitute "50 

penalty units". 

Subsection 26 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Children's Services Act 1986 

Subsection 11 (4)— 
Omit "$100", substitute "1 penalty unit". 

Paragraph 47 (1) (e)— 
Omit "$1,000", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Section 69J— 
Omit "3 months", substitute "6 months". 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au 



16 Statute Law Revision (Penalties) No. , 1993 
SCHEDULE—continued 

Subsection 82 (6)— 
Omit "$2,000" and "12 months", substitute "50 penalty units" and "6 

months" respectively. 

Subsection 102 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$500", substitute "5 penalty units". 

Subsection 102 (2) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$500", substitute "5 penalty units". 

Subsection 102 (3) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000", substitute "5 penalty units". 

Subsection 103 (2) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Subsection 118 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$10,000" and "$2,000", substitute "250 penalty units" and "50 

penalty units" respectively. 

Subsection 118 (2) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$5,000" and "$1,000", substitute "250 penalty units" and "50 

penalty units" respectively. 

Section 127 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$10,000" and "$2,000", substitute "500 penalty units" and "100 

penalty units" respectively. 

Subsection 128 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$5,000" and "$1,000", substitute "250 penalty units" and "50 

penalty units" respectively. 

Subsection 133 (4) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$25,000" and "$5,000", substitute "1000 penalty units" and "200 

penalty units" respectively. 

Subsection 133 (5) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$10,000" and "$2,000", substitute "500 penalty units" and "100 

penalty units" respectively. 

Subsection 134 (2) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$5,000" and "$1,000", substitute "250 penalty units" and "50 

penalty units" respectively. 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov. 



Statute Law Revision (Penalties} No. , 1993 ' ' 

SCHEDULE—continued 

Subsection 134 (3) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$5,000" and "$1,000". substitute "250 penalty units" and "50 

penalty units" respectively. 

Section 135 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$10,000" and "$2,000", substitute "250 penalty units" and "50 

penalty unite" respectively. 

Subsection 139 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$5,000", substitute "200 penalty units". 

Subsection 139 (2) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$2,000", substitute "100 penalty units". 

Section 140 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000", substitute "50 penalty unite". 

Section 141 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000", substitute "50 penalty unite". 

Section 142 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Section 154 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$2,000" and "12 months", substitute "50 penalty units" and "6 

months" respectively. 

Subsection 170 (1)— 
Add at the end the following penalty provision: 

'Tenalty: 
(a) if the offender is a natural person—50 penalty units or 

imprisonment for 6 months, or both; 

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—250 penalty unite". 

Subsection 170 (2)— 
Omit the subsection. 

Subsection 172 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$2,000" and "12 months", substitute "50 penalty unite" and "6 

months" respectively. 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at viww.legislation.act.gov. 



18 Statute Law Revision (Penalties) No. . 1993 

SCHEDULE—continued 

Chiropractors Registration Act 1983 

Subsection 15 (5) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$100", substitute "5 penalty units". 

Section 17 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$100", substitute "5 penalty units". 

Subsection 27 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000", substitute "50 penalty units or imprisonment for 6 

months, or both". 

Subsection 27 (2) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$250", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Section 28 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000", substitute "30 penalty units". 

Section 29 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$2,000", substitute "250 penalty units". 

Section 62 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000" and "6 months", substitute "50 penalty uniu" and "6 

months, or both" respectively. 

Collections Act 1959 

Section 2 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$200", substitute "50 penalty units or imprisonment for 6 

months, or both". 

Subsection 6 (6) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "Forty dollars", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Subsection 7 (4) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "Forty dollars", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Subsection 8 (4) (penalty provision)— 
Omit 'Two hundred dollars", substitute "10 penalty units". 

Section 10 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "Two hundred dollars", substitute "50 penalty units or 

imprisonment for 6 months, or both". 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsekalso accessible at www.legislation,act.gov. 



Statute Law Revision (Penalties) No. , 1993 19 
SCHEDULE—continued 

Section 11— 
Omit "Forty dollars", substitute "10 penalty units". 

Consumer Affairs Act 1973 

Subsection 15B (5>— 
Add at the end the following: 

"punishable, on conviction— 

(a) if the offender is a natural person—by a fine not exceeding 50 
penalty units, or by imprisonment for a term not exceeding 6 
months, or by both; or 

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—by a fine not exceeding 250 
penalty units". 

Subsection 15C (2)— 
Add at the end the following: 

"punishable, on conviction— 

(a) if the offender is a natural person—by a fine not exceeding 50 
penalty units, or by imprisonment for a term not exceeding 6 
months, or by both; or 

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—by a fine not exceeding 250 
penalty units". 

Subsection 15E (2>— 
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision: 

"Penalty: 

(a) if the offender is a natural person—50 penalty units or 
imprisonment for 6 months, or both; 

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—250 penalty units". 

Subsection 15E (3>— 
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision:: 

"Penalty: 

(a) if the offender is a natural person—50 penalty units or 
imprisonment for 6 months, or both; 

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—250 penalty units.". 

by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.! 



20 Statute Law Revision (Penalties) No. . 1993 
SCHEDULE—continued 

Subsection 15FE (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$20,000" and "$100,000", substitute "200 penalty units" and 

"1000 penalty units" respectively. 

Subsection 15FKA (6) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$20,000" and "$100,000", substitute "200 penalty units" and 

"1000 penalty units" respectively. 

Subsection 15FKA (7) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$2,000" and "$10,000", substitute "20 penalty units" and "100 

penalty units" respectively. 

Subsection 15FKA (8) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$2,000" and "$10,000", substitute "20 penalty units" and "100 

penalty units" respectively. 

Section 15H— 
Omit the section. 

Co-operative Societies Act 1939 

Subsection SB (3)— 
Omit the subsection, substitute the following subsections: 

"(3) A person shall not refuse or fail to comply with a requirement 
made under subsection (2). 

Penalty: SO penalty units. 

"(3A) A person shall not obstruct, threaten or intimidate the Registrar 
or an inspector in the exercise of his or her powers under this section. 

Penalty: SO penalty units or imprisonment for 6 months, or both.". 

Subsection 8A (2) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$200", substitute "SO penalty units or imprisonment for 6 

months, or both". 

Subsection 22A (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000", substitute "10 penalty units". 

Subsection 22A (4) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov. 



Statute Law Revision (Penalties) No. , 1993 21 
SCHEDULE—continued 

Subsection 32 (2) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$5,000 or imprisonment for 6 months, or both" and "$25,000", 

substitute "50 penalty units" and "250 penalty units" respectively. 

Subsection 32 (8) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$5,000 or imprisonment for 6 months, or both" and "$25,000", 

substitute "50 penalty units" and "250 penalty units" respectively. 

Subsection 38AA (12) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$2,000" and "12 months", substitute "50 penalty units" and "6 

months" respectively. 

Subsection 58A (5)— 
Omit "$5,000" and "2 years", substitute "50 penalty units" and "6 

months" respectively. 

Subsection 68 (3)— 
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision: 

"Penalty: 5 penalty units.". 

Subsection 69 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "One hundred dollars", substitute "250 penalty units". 

Subsection 69 (2) (penalty provision)— 
Omit 'Twenty dollars", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Subsection 70 (1)— 
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision: 

"Penalty: 25 penalty units.". 

Subsection 71 (1)— 
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision: 

"Penalty: 250penalty units". 

Subsection 71 (2) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "One hundred dollars", substitute "5 penalty units". 

Section 72 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "One hundred dollars", substitute "5 penalty units". 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov. 



22 Statute Law Revision (Penalties) No. , 1993 
SCHEDULE—continued 

Section 73 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "One hundred dollars", substitute "30 penalty units". 

Section 74 (penalty provision)— 
Omit 'Two hundred dollars", substitute "30 penalty units". 

Section 75 (penalty provision)— 
Omit 'Two hundred dollars", substitute "SO penalty units or 

imprisonment for 6 months, or both". 

Subsection 76 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "Two hundred dollars", substitute "SO penalty units or 

imprisonment for 6 months, or both". 

Subsection 77 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit 'Two hundred dollars" and "six months", substitute "SO penalty 

units" and "6 months, or both" respectively. 

Section 78— 
Omit "be liable to a penalty not exceeding Fifty dollars", substitute the 

following: 

"be liable to a penalty— 

(a) if the offender is a natural person—not exceeding 10 penalty units; 
or 

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—not exceeding 50 penalty 
units". 

Coroners Act 1956 

Subsection 26 (10)— 
Omit 'Two hundred dollars" and "six months", substitute "SO penalty 

units" and "6 months, or both" respectively. 

Subsection 30 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit 'Two hundred dollars" and "six months", substitute "50 penalty 

units" and "6 months, or both" respectively. 

Subsection 32 (1)— 
Omit all the words after "section" (second occurring) and substitute "50 

penalty units or imprisonment for 6 months, or both". 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsekalso accessible at www.legislation.act.gov. 



Statute Law Revision (Penalties) No. , 1993 23 

SCHEDULE—continued 

Subsection 44 (1)— 
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision: 

"Penalty: 50 penalty units or imprisonment for 6 months, or both.". 

Subsection 44 (2)— 
Omit "five", substitute "5". 

Cotter River Act 1914 

Subsection 2 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit 'Twenty dollars", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Section 3— 
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision: 

"Penalty: 50 penalty units.". 

Subsection 5 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "Forty dollars", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Criminal Injuries Compensation Act 1983 

Subsection 17 (4)— 
Omit "$1,000 or imprisonment for 6 months", substitute "50 penalty 

units or imprisonment for 6 months, or both". 

Section 23 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000", substitute "50 penalty units or imprisonment for 6 

months, or both". 

Subsection 24 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000", substitute "50 penalty units or imprisonment for 6 

months, or both". 

Subsection 29 (2) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$10,000 or imprisonment for 6 months", substitute "50 penalty 

units or imprisonment for 6 months, or both". 

Dental Technicians and Dental Prosthetists Registration Act 
1988 

Subsection 33 (5) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$100", substitute "5 penalty units". 

by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at ^. legislat ion.; 



24 Statute Law Revision (Penalties) No. , 1993 
SCHEDULE—continued 

Section 35 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$100", substitute "5 penalty units". 

Subsection 37 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$2,000" and "$1,000", substitute "50 penalty units or 

imprisonment for 6 months, or both" and "30 penalty units" respectively. 

Subsection 37 (2) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$2,000" and "$1,000", substitute "50 penalty units or 

imprisonment for 6 months, or both" and "30 penalty units" respectively. 

Subsection 37 (3) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$200", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Subsection 38 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000", substitute "30 penalty units". 

Subsection 39 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$5,000", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Subsection 40 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$2,000", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Subsection 54 (3) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Subsection 62 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Subsection 62 (2) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Section 65 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$2,000", substitute "50 penalty units or imprisonment for 6 

months, or both". 

Section 68 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Dentists Registration Act 1931 
Section 23AA (penalty provision)— 

Omit "$100", substitute "5 penalty units". 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at vww.legislation.xt.gov.au 



Statute Law Revision {Penalties) No. ,1993 25 

SCHEDULE—continued 

Section 23FA (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$100", substitute "5 penalty units". 

Section 23LA (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$100", substitute "5 penalty units". 

Subsection 25 (2) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$100", substitute "5 penalty units". 

Section 33 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$250", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Section 34 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000", substitute "50 penalty units or imprisonment for 6 

months, or both". 

Section 35 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$500", substitute "30 penalty units". 

Dog Control Act 1975 

Section 7B (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$100". substitute "1 penalty unit". 

Subsection 15 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$300", substitute "5 penalty units". 

Subsection 15 (2) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$300", substitute "5 penalty units". 

Subsection 18A (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$500", substitute "50 penalty units or imprisonment for 6 

months, or both". 

Subsection 18E (3)— 
Omit "$300", substitute "5 penalty units". 

Subsection 19 (1)— 
Omit "$500", substitute "50 penalty units or imprisonment for 6 

months, or both". 

Subsection 20 (1)— 
Omit "$300", substitute "3 penalty units". 

by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.. 



26 Statute Law Revision (Penalties) No. , 1993 
SCHEDULE—continued 

Section 20A (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$500", substitute "5 penalty units". 

Subsection 21 (1)— 
Omit "$500", substitute "5 penalty units". 

Subsection 21 (4)— 
Omit "$500", substitute "5 penalty units". 

Subsection 22 (1)— 
Omit "$300", substitute "5 penalty units". 

Subsection 23 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$500", substitute "5 penalty units". 

Subsection 23 (2) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$500", substitute "5 penalty units". 

Subsection 23 (3) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$500", substitute "5 penalty units". 

Subsection 23 (4) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$500", substitute "5 penalty units". 

Subsection 24 (3)— 
Omit "$500", substitute "5 penalty units". 

Subsection 25 (1)— 
Omit "$5,000". substitute "50 penalty units". 

Section 26 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$300", substitute "5 penalty units". 

Section 27 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000", substitute "50 penalty units or imprisonment for 6 

months, or both". 

Section 28 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$500", substitute "10 penalty units". 

Authorised by the ACT Pariiamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov. 



Statute Law Revision (Penalties) No. ,1993 27 

SCHEDULE—continued 

Subsection 35 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$200", substitute "100 penalty units or imprisonment for 12 

months, or both". 

Section 35D (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$500", substitute "10 penalty units". 

Section 35E (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$500", substitute "10 penalty units". 

Domestic Violence Act 1986 

Subsection 27 (1)— 
Omit "$1,000", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Paragraph 30 (2) (a)— 
Omit "$25,000", substitute "250 penalty units". 

Paragraph 30 (2) (b>— 
Omit "$5,000" and "2 years", substitute "50 penalty units" and "6 

months" respectively. 

Electricity Act 1971 

Section 9— 
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision: 

"Penalty: 

(a) if the offender is a natural person—50 penalty units or 
imprisonment for 6 months, or both; 

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—250 penalty units". 

Section 10— 
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision: 

"Penalty: 50 penalty units or imprisonment for 6 months, or both.". 

Subsection 11 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit 'Two hundred dollars", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Subsection 12 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit 'Two hundred dollars", substitute "50 penalty units". 

by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.tegislation, 



28 Statute Law Revision (Penalties) No. , 1993 

SCHEDULE—continued 

Subsection 13 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit 'Two hundred dollars", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Section 14 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "Two hundred dollars", substitute "50 penalty units or 

imprisonment for 6 months, or both". 

Section 21 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "Four hundred dollars", substitute "50 penalty uniu or 

imprisonment for 6 months, or both". 

Paragraph 32C (3) (d)— 
Omit "$100,000", substitute "1,000 penalty units". 

Paragraph 32C (3) (e)— 
Omit "$20,000", substitute "200 penalty units". 

Paragraph 32E (3) (a)— 
Omit "$100,000", substitute "1,000 penalty units". 

Paragraph 32E (3) (b)— 
Omit "$20,000", substitute "200 penalty units". 

Paragraph 32F (f)— 
Omit "$100,000", substitute "1,000 penalty units". 

Paragraph 32F (g)— 
Omit "$20,000", substitute "200 penalty units". 

Paragraph 32G (6) (a)— 
Omit "$10,000", substitute "100 penalty units". 

Paragraph 32G (6) (b>— 
Omit "$2,000", substitute "20 penalty units". 

Paragraph 32M (2) (d)— 
Omit "$100,000", substitute "1,000 penalty units". 

Paragraph 32M (2) (e)— 
Omit "$20,000", substitute "200 penalty units". 

Authorised by the ACT Pariiamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au 



Statute Law Revision (Penalties) No. ,1993 29 

SCHEDULE—continued 

Paragraph 32Q (3) (a)— 
Omit "$100,000", substitute "1.000 penalty units". 

Paragraph 32Q (3) (b>— 
Omit "$20,000", substitute "200 penalty units". 

Paragraph 32R (3) (a)— 
Omit "$100,000", substitute "1,000 penalty units". 

Paragraph 32R (3) (b>— 
Omit "$20,000", substitute "200 penalty units". 

Section 32U (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$500", substitute "1 penalty unit". 

Paragraph 32V (3) (a>— 
Omit "$20,000", substitute "250 penalty units". 

Paragraph 32V (3) (b)— 
Omit "$4,000", substitute "50 penalty uniu or imprisonment for 6 

months, or both". 

Paragraph 32ZB (a)— 
Omit "$10,000", substitute "250 penalty units". 

Paragraph 32ZB (b>— 
Omit "$2,000" and "12 months", substitute "50 penalty units" and "6 

months, or both" respectively. 

Paragraph 32ZF (ay-
Omit "$100,000", substitute "1,000 penalty units". 

Paragraph 32ZF (by -
Omit "$20,000". substitute "200 penalty units". 

Subsection 33 (3C>— 
Omit "$200". substitute "50 penalty units or imprisonment for 6 

months, or both". 

Subsection 34 (3) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "Two hundred dollars", substitute "50 penalty units or 

imprisonment for 6 months, or both". 

by the ACT Parliamentary Counset-also accessible at www.legislation., 



30 Statute Law Revision (Penalties) No. . 1993 

SCHEDULE—continued 

Section 35 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "Four hundred dollars", substitute "50 penalty unite". 

Section 36 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "Two hundred dollars", substitute "50 penalty units or 

imprisonment for 6 months, or both". 

Section 37 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "One hundred dollars", substitute "2 penalty units". 

Subsection 38 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "One hundred dollars", substitute "1 penalty unit". 

Section 40 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "One hundred dollars", substitute "1 penalty unit". 

Electricity and Water Act 1988 

Subsection 54 (3)— 
Omit "$100", substitute "1 penalty unit". 

Section 59 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Section 65 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$5,000" and "$25,000", substitute "50 penalty units or 

imprisonment for 6 months, or both" and "250 penalty units" respectively. 

Section 74B (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$50,000" and "$10,000", substitute "500 penalty units" and "100 

penalty units" respectively. 

Section 76 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$2,000" and "$10,000". substitute "50 penalty units or 

imprisonment for 6 months, or both" and "250 penalty units" respectively. 

Paragraph 82 (c)— 
Omit "$2,500", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Paragraph 82 (d>— 
Omit "$500", substitute "10 penalty units". 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov. 



Statute Law Revision (Penalties) No. ,1993 31 
SCHEDULE—continued 

Enclosed Lands Protection Act 1943 

Subsection 4 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit 'Ten dollars", substitute "5 penalty units". 

Subsection 5 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit 'Twenty dollars", substitute "5 penalty units". 

Subsection 5 (2) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "Twenty dollars", substitute "5 penalty units". 

Section 6 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$20", substitute "5 penalty units". 

Evidence Act 1971 

Section 76E (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Subsection 84 (1)— 
Omit "$1,000", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Section 85 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Financial Institutions Duty Act 1987 

Section 25— 
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision: 

"Penalty: 

(a) in the case of a natural person—50 penalty units or imprisonment 
for 6 months, or both; 

(b) in the case of a body corporate—250 penalty units". 

Fire Brigade Act 1957 

Subsection 12 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$500" and "six months", substitute "50 penalty units" and "6 

months, or both" respectively. 

Section 14— 
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision: 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsekalso accessible at www.legislation.act.gov. 



32 Statute Law Revision (Penalties) No. , 1993 
SCHEDULE—continued 

"Penalty: 

(a) if the offender is a natural person—10 penalty units; 

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.". 

Paragraph 16 (f)— 
Omit "penalties not exceeding a fine of $500 or imprisonment for a term 

of six months", substitute the following: 

"penalties— 

(a) if the offender is a natural person—of 10 penalty units; or 

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—of 50 penalty units;". 

Fishing Act 1967 

Section 7 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "One hundred dollars", substitute "50 penalty units or 

imprisonment for 6 months, or both". 

Section 8 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "Fifty dollars", substitute "20 penalty units". 

Section 10 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "Fifty dollars", substitute "10 penalty units". 

Section 11 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "Fifty dollars", substitute "30 penalty units". 

Section 12 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "Fifty dollars", substitute "30 penalty units". 

Subsection 13 (2) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "Fifty dollars", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Section 14 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "Fifty dollars", substitute "30 penalty units". 

Section 15 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "Fifty dollars", substitute "30 penalty units". 

Section 16 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "Fifty dollars", substitute "30 penalty units". 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov. 



Statute Law Revision (Penalties) No. , 1993 33 
SCHEDULE—continued 

Section 17 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "Fifty dollars", substitute "30 penalty units". 

Section 18 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "Fifty dollars", substitute "30 penalty units". 

Section 19 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "One hundred dollars", substitute "50 penalty units or 

imprisonment for 6 months, or both". 

Section 20 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "One hundred dollars", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Section 21 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "One hundred dollars", subsUtute "50 penalty units or 

imprisonment for 6 months, or both". 

Subsection 24 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "Fifty dollars", substitute "20 penalty units". 

Subsection 24 (2)— 
Omit the penalty provision. 

Subsection 24 (3)— 
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision: 

"Penalty for contravention of subsection (2) or (3): 50 penalty units.". 

Section 25 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "One hundred dollars", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Subsection 26 (1)— 
Omit "the prescribed amount", substitute "30 penalty units". 

Subsection 26 (2)— 
Omit the subsection. 

Section 27 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "Fifty dollars", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Section 28 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "Fifty dollars", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov. 



34 Statute Law Revision (Penalties) No. . 1993 
SCHEDULE—continued 

Section 29 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "Fifty dollars", substitute "30 penalty units". 

Section 30 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "Fifty dollars", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Section 31 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "Fifty dollars", substitute "10 penalty units". 

Section 32 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "Fifty dollars", substitute "10 penalty units". 

Subsection 33 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "One hundred dollars", substitute "50 penalty units or 

imprisonment for 6 months, or both". 

Section 40— 
Omit all the words after "penalties", substitute the following: 

"for offences against the regulations— 

(a) if the offender is a natural person—not exceeding 10 penalty units; 
or 

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—not exceeding 50 penalty 
units.". 

Gaming Machine Act 1987 

Subsection 13 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Subsection 13 (2) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Section 30 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$500" and "$2,500", substitute "5 penalty units" and "25 penalty 

units" respectively. 

Subsection 30A (5)— 
Omit "$10,000", substitute "100 penalty units". 

Subsection 30E (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$2,000", substitute "20 penalty units". 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.actgov.au 



Statute Law Revision (Penalties) No. . 1993 35 
SCHEDULE—continued 

Subsection 34 (7)— 
Omit "$500", substitute "5 penalty units". 

Section 40 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000" and "$5,000", substitute "50 penalty units" and "250 

penalty units" respectively. 

Subsection 41 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$500" and "$2,500", substitute "50 penalty units" and "250 

penalty units" respectively. 

Section 42 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$500" and "$2,500", substitute "5 penalty units" and "25 penalty 

units" respectively. 

Section 44 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$5,000" and "$25,000", substitute "50 penalty units or 

imprisonment for 6 months, or both" and "250 penalty units" respectively. 

Subsection 45 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$5,000", "2 years" and "$25,000", substitute "50 penalty units", 

"6 months" and "250 penalty units" respectively. 

Subsection 46 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000", substitute "10 penalty units". 

Subsection 46 (2) (penalty provisions-
Omit "$1,000", substitute "50 penalty units or imprisonment for 6 

months, or both". 

Subsection 47 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$10,000", "5 years" and "$50,000", substitute "100 penalty 

units", "12 months" and "500 penalty units" respectively. 

Section 48 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$5,000", "2 years" and "$25,000", substitute "50 penalty units", 

"6 months" and "250 penalty units" respectively. 

Section 49 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$500" and "$2,500", substitute "5 penalty units" and "25 penalty 

units" respectively. 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov. 



36 Siatuie Law Revision (Penalties) No. , 1993 

SCHEDULE—continued 

Subsection 51 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000" and "$5,000", subsUtute "50 penalty units" and "250 

penalty units" respectively. 

Section 54 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$10,000". "5 years" and "$50,000", subsUtute "100 penalty 

units", "12 months" and "500 penalty units" respectively. 

Subsection 55 (2) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$10,000", "5 years" and "$50,000", substitute "100 penalty 

units", "12 months" and "500 penalty units" respectively. 

Gas Levy Act 1991 

Subsection 5 (2) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$2,000", substitute "20 penalty units". 

Section 9 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$2,000", substitute "20 penalty units". 

Hawkers Act 1936 

Subsection 6 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "Forty dollars", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Subsection 6 (1A) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "Forty dollars", substitute "30 penalty units". 

Subsection 6A (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "Forty dollars", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Subsection 6A (3)— 
Omit "Forty dollars", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Section 15 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "Forty dollars", substitute "2 penalty units". 

Section 16 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "Forty dollars", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Section 17 (penalty provision)—• 
Omit 'Twenty dollars", substitute "2 penalty units". 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov. 



Statute Law Revision (Penalties) No. ,1993 37 
SCHEDULE—continued 

Section 18— 
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision: 

"Penalty: 50 penalty units.". 

Subsection 21 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "Two hundred dollars", substitute "100 penalty units or 

imprisonment for 12 months, or both". 

Section 22 (penalty provision)—<• 
Omit "Eighty dollars", substitute "50 penalty units or imprisonment for 

6 months, or both". 

Section 25 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "Forty dollars", substitute "1 penalty unit". 

Section 28— 
Omit "One hundred dollars", substitute "10 penalty units". 

Heritage Objects Act 1991 

Section 20— 
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision: 

"Penalty: 

(a) in the case of a natural person—50 penalty units; 

(b) in the case of a body corporate—250 penalty units.". 

Subsection 39 (1)— 
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision: 

"Penalty: 

(a) in the case of a natural person—50 penalty units; 

(b) in the case of a body corporate—250 penalty units.". 

Subsection 46 (1)— 
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision: 

"Penalty: 

(a) in the case of a natural person—50 penalty units; 

(b) in the case of a body corporate—250 penalty units". 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov. 



38 Statute Law Revision (Penalties) No. , 1993 

SCHEDULE—continued 

Section 53— 
Repeal the section. 

Subparagraph 55 (c) (i)— 
Omit "$1,000", substitute "10 penalty units". 

Subparagraph 55 (c) (ii)— 
Omit "$5,000", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Juries Act 1967 

Section 41— 
Omit "$200", substitute "5 penalty units". 

Section 43— 
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision: 

"Penalty: 50 penalty units or imprisonment for 6 months, or both". 

Section 44— 
Omit all the words after "conviction", substitute "by a fine not 

exceeding 500 penalty units, or by imprisonment for a terra not exceeding 5 
years, or by both". 

Subsection 44AA (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$3,000" and "$15,000", substitute "50 penalty units or 

imprisonment for 6 months, or both" and "250 penalty units" respectively. 

Subsection 44AA (5) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$3,000" and "$15,000", substitute "50 penalty units or 

imprisonment for 6 months, or both" and "250 penalty units" respectively. 

Lakes Act 1976 

Section 10 
Repeal the section, substitute the following section: 

Obstruction of inspectors 
"10. (1) A person shall not, without lawful excuse, obstruct, molest or 

hinder an inspector in the exercise of his or her powers under this Act. 

Penalty: 

(a) in the case of a natural person—50 penalty units or imprisonment 
for 6 months, or both; 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.xt.gov. 



Statute Law Revision (Penalties) No. ,1993 39 
SCHEDULE—continued 

(b) in the case of a body corporate—250 penalty units. 

"(2) A person shall not, without lawful excuse, refuse or fail to comply 
with a direction given by an inspector in pursuance of this Act. 

Penalty: 

(a) in the case of a natural person—50 penalty units; 

(b) in the case of a body corporate—250 penalty units". 

Subsection 12 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$500" and "$2,500", substitute "50 penalty units" and "250 

penalty units" respectively. 

Subsection 12 (2) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$500" and "$2,500", substitute "50 penalty units" and "250 

penalty unite" respectively. 

Section 16 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$500" and "$2,500". substitute "30 penalty unite" and "150 

penalty units" respectively. 

Section 17 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$500", substitute "5 penalty unite". 

Section 18 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$500" and "$2,500", substitute "5 penalty unite" and "25 penalty 

units" respectively. 

Subsection 19 (2) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$500" and "$2,500", substitute "5 penalty units" and '75 penalty 

unite" respectively. 

Subsection 19 (3) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$500" and "$2,500", substitute "5 penalty unite" and "25 penalty 

units" respectively. 

Section 20 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$500" and "$2,500", substitute "5 penalty unite" and "25 penalty 

unite" respectively. 

Subsection 21 (5) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$500" and "$2,500", substitute "50 penalty units" and "250 

penalty units" respectively. 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at wvm.legislation.act.gov. 



40 Statute Law Revision (Penalties) No. . 1993 

SCHEDULE—continued 

Subsection 21 (6) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$500" and "$2,500", substitute "50 penalty units" and "250 

penalty units" respectively. 

Subsection 23 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$500" and "$2,500", substitute "50 penalty units" and "250 

penalty units" respectively. 

Subsection 24 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$500" and "$2,500", substitute "50 penalty units" and "250 

penalty units" respectively. 

Subsection 25 (2) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$500" and "$2,500", substitute "50 penalty units" and "250 

penalty units" respectively. 

Subsection 27 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000" and "$5,000", substitute "50 penalty units" and '750 

penalty units" respectively. 

Subsection 27 (1A) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000", substitute "10 penalty units". 

Subsection 29 (2) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000" and "$5,000", substitute "50 penalty units" and "250 

penalty units" respectively. 

Section 31 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$500" and "$2,500", substitute "30 penalty units" and "150 

penalty units" respectively. 

Section 32 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$500" and "$2,500", substitute "30 penalty units" and "150 

penalty units" respectively. 

Section 34 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$500" and "$2,500", substitute "30 penalty units" and "150 

penalty units" respectively. 

Paragraph 40 (c)— 
Omit "$500", substitute "30 penalty units". 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov. 



Statute Law Revision (Penalties) No. , 1993 41 

SCHEDULE—continued 

Paragraph 40 (d)— 
Omit "$2,500", substitute "150 penalty units". 

Subsection 48 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000" and "$5,000", substitute "50 penalty units" and "250 

penalty units" respectively. 

Section 49 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$500" and "$2,500", substitute "30 penalty units" and "150 

penalty units" respectively. 

Subsection SO (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$500", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Paragraph 54 (d)— 
Omit "not exceeding $40 for breaches of the Regulations", substitute the 

following: 

"for breaches of the regulations— 

(a) if the offender is a natural person—not exceeding 10 penalty units; 
or 

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—not exceeding 50 penalty 
units". 

Land (Planning and Environment) Act 1991 

Subsection 67 (3)— 
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision: 

"Penalty: 

(a) if the offender is a natural person—5 penalty units; 

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—25 penalty units". 

Section 70— 
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision: 

"Penalty: 

(a) if the offender is a natural person—50 penalty units; 

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—250 penalty units.". 

Subsection 84 (1)— 
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision: 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov. 



42 Statute Law Revision (Penalties) No. . 1993 

SCHEDULE—continued 

"Penalty: 

(a) if the offender is a natural person—50 penalty units or 
imprisonment for 6 months, or both; 

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—250 penalty units.". 

Subsection 149 ( 2 )~ 
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision: 

"Penalty: 

(a) if the offender is a natural person—50 penalty units or 
imprisonment for 6 months, or both; 

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—250 penalty units.". 

Subsection 150 (1)— 
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision: 

'Tenalty: 

(a) if the offender is a natural person—50 penalty units or 
imprisonment for 6 months, or both; 

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—250 penalty units.". 

Subsection 150 (2)— 
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision: 

"Penalty: 

(a) if the offender is a natural person—50 penalty units or 
imprisonment for 6 months, or both; 

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—250 penalty units.". 

Subsection 154 (2)— 

Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision: 

"Penalty: 

(a) if the offender is a natural person—50 penalty units; 
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—250 penalty units.". 

Section 155— 
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision: 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov. 



Statute Law Revision (Penalties) No. , 1993 43 

SCHEDULE—continued 

"Penalty: 

(a) if the offender is a natural person—50 penalty units or 
imprisonment for 6 months, or both; 

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—250 penalty units.". 

Section 156— 
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision: 

"Penalty: 

(a) if the offender is a natural person—50 penalty units or 
imprisonment for 6 months, or both; 

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—250 penalty units.". 

Section 221— 

Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision: 

"Penalty: 

(a) if the offender is a natural person—50 penalty units; 
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—250 penalty units.". 

Section 2(5 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$100", substitute "1 penalty unit". 

Subsection 269 (2) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Section 274— 
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision: 

"Penalty: 

(a) if the offender is a natural person—50 penalty units or 
imprisonment for 6 months, or both; 

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—250 penalty units.". 

Subparagraph 288 (c) (i)— 
Omit "$1,000", substitute "10 penalty units". 

Subparagraph 288 (c) (ii)— 
Omit "$5,000", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov. 



44 Statute Law Revision (Penalties) No. , 1993 

SCHEDULE—continued 

Land (Planning and Environment) (Consequential Provisions) 
Act 1991 

Paragraph 29 (3) (a)— 
Omit "$20,000", substitute "200 penalty units". 

Paragraph 29 (3) (b>— 
Omit "$100,000", substitute "1,000 penalty units". 

Law Reform (Manufacturers Warranties) Act 1977 

Subsection 7 (4)— 
Omit "fine not exceeding $1,000", substitute the following: 

"fine— 

(a) if the offender is a natural person—not exceeding 200 penalty 
units; or 

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—not exceeding 1,000 penalty 
units". 

Law Reform (Misrepresentation) Act 1977 

Subsection 7 (1)— 
Omit "by a fine not exceeding $1,000", substitute the following: 

"by a fine— 

(a) if the offender is a natural person—not exceeding 200 penalty 
units; or 

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—not exceeding 1,000 penalty 
units". 

Subsection 8 (1)— 
Omit "by a fine not exceeding $1,000", substitute the following: 

"by a fine— 

(a) if the offender is a natural person—not exceeding 200 penalty 
units; or 

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—not exceeding 1,000 penalty 
units". 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au 



Statute Law Revision (Penalties) No. . 1993 45 

SCHEDULE—continued 

Lay-by Sales Agreements Act 1963 

Subsection 4 (1)— 
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision: 

"Penalty: 

(a) if the offender is a natural person—SO penalty units; 

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—250 penalty units.". 

Subsection 4 (3)— 
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision: 

'Tenalty: 

(a) if the offender is a natural person—50 penalty units; 

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—250 penalty units.". 

Subsection 5 (1)— 

Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision: 

"Penalty: 

(a) if the offender is a natural person—50 penalty units; 
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—250 penalty units.". 

Subsection 6 C D -
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision: 

"Penalty: 

(a) if the offender is a natural person—50 penalty units; 

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—-250 penalty units.". 

Section 7— 
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision: 

"Penalty: 

(a) if the offender is a natural person—20 penalty units; 

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—100 penalty units.". 

Section 9— 
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision: 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov. 



46 Statute Law Revision (Penalties) No. , 1993 

SCHEDULE—continued 

"Penalty: 

(a) if the offender is a natural person—SO penalty units; 

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—250 penalty units.". 

Subsection 12 (1)— 

Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision: 

"Penalty: 

(a) if the offender is a natural person—SO penalty units; 
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—250 penalty units.". 

Subsection 12 (3)— 

Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision: 

"Penalty: 

(a) if the offender is a natural person—50 penalty units; 
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—250 penalty units". 

Section 15— 

Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision: 

"Penalty: 

(a) if the offender is a natural person—50 penalty units; 

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—250 penalty units.". 

Subsection 16 (2)— 

Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision: 

"Penalty: 

(a) if the offender is a natural person—20 penalty units; 

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—100 penalty units.". 

Section 18— 

Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision: 

"Penalty: 

(a) if the offender is a natural person—50 penalty units; 
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—250 penalty units.". 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov. 



Statute Law Revision (Penalties) No. , 1993 47 

SCHEDULE—continued 

Legal Aid Act 1977 

Subsection 92 (2)— 
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision: 

"Penalty: 50 penalty units or imprisonment for 6 months, or both.". 

Subsection 95 (1)— 
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision: 

"Penalty: 50 penalty units or imprisonment for 6 months, or both.". 

Legal Practitioners Act 1970 

Subsection 30 (3B)— 
Omit "$1,000", substitute "20 penalty units". 

Subsection 32 (2) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$5,000", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Subsection 35 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$5,000", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Paragraph 40A (1) (g)— 
Omit "$10,000", substitute "250 penalty units". 

Paragraph 40A (1) (h)— 
Omit "12 months" and "$2,000", substitute "6 months" and "50 penalty 

units" respectively. 

Paragraph 41 (1) (b)— 
Omit "$10,000", substitute "100 penalty units". 

Subsection 42M (2) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$5,000", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Subsection 58 (1AA) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$5,000", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Subsection 58 (IB) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$2,000", substitute "20 penalty units". 

Subsection 62 (1A) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$5,000", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov. 



48 Statute Law Revision (Penalties) No. , 1993 

SCHEDULE—continued 

Subsection 65 (2) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$5,000", substitute "SO penalty units". 

Section 67 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$5,000", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Section 68 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$5,000", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Section 94 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$5,000", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Section 107 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$5,000", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Section 122 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$5,000", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Subsection 123 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$5,000", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Subsection 124 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$5,000", substitute "SO penalty units". 

Subsection 125 (1)— 
Omit "$25,000", substitute "250 penalty units". 

Listening Devices Act 1992 

Subsection 4 (1)— 

Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision: 

"Penalty: 

(a) if the offender is a natural person—50 penalty units; 
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—250 penalty units". 

Subsection 5 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision: 

"Penalty. 

(a) if the offender is a natural person—SO penalty units or 
imprisonment for 6 months; 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov. 



Staiute Law Revision (Penalties) No. , 1993 49 

SCHEDULE—continued 

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—250 penalty units.". 

Subsection 6 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision: 

"Penalty: 

(a) if the offender is a natural person—50 penalty units or 
imprisonment for 6 months; 

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—250 penalty units". 

Subsection 7 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision: 

"Penalty: 

(a) if the offender is a natural person—50 penalty units or 
imprisonment for 6 months; 

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—250 penalty units.". 

Section 8 (penalty provision)— 
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision: 

•Tenalty: 

(a) if the offender is a natural person—50 penalty units or 
imprisonment for 6 months; 

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—250 penalty units.". 

Subsection 10 (6) (penalty provision)— 
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision: 

'Tenalty: 

(a) if the offender is a natural person—50 penalty units or 
.- imprisonment for 6 months; 

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—250 penalty units.". 

Long Service Leave Act 1976 
Subsection 6 (1) (penalty provision)— 

Omit "$2,000", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Subsection 6 (2) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$2,000", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov 



50 Statute Law Revision (Penalties) No. . 1993 

SCHEDULE—continued 

Subsection 8 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$2,000", substitute "50 penalty unite". 

Subsection 12 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$500", substitute "20 penalty units". 

Subsection 12 (2) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$500", substitute "20 penalty units". 

Subsection 12 (3) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$500", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Long Service Leave (Building and Construction Industry) Act 
1981 

Subsection 19 (5)— 
Omit all the words after "conviction,", substitute the following: 

"by a fine— 

(a) if the offender is a natural person—not exceeding 50 penalty units; 
or 

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—not exceeding 250 penalty 
unite". 

Subsection 27 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000", substitute "50 penalty unite". 

Section 30 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$500", substitute "5 penalty unite". 

Subsection 37 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$500", substitute "20 penalty unite". 

Subsection 38 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$2,000", substitute "20 penalty unite". 

Subsection 39 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000", substitute "20 penalty unite". 

Subsection 39 (2) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000", substitute "20 penalty unite". 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.xt.gov. 



Statute Law Revision (Penalties) No. .1993 51 

SCHEDULE—continued 

Subsection 52 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$2,000", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Subsection 52 (4) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$2,000", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Machinery Act 1949 

Paragraph 5 (2) (g)— 
Omit all the words after "regulations", substitute the following: 

"of penalties— 

(a) if the offender is a natural person—not exceeding 10 penalty units; 
and 

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—not exceeding 50 penalty 
units". 

Magistrates Court Act 1930 
Subsection 162 (4) (penalty provision)— 

Omit 'Ten dollars", substitute "10 penalty units". 

Subsection 162 (5)— 
Omit "Forty dollars;", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Subsection 166 (2) (penalty provision)— 
Omit 'Twenty dollars", substitute "5 penalty unite". 

Subsection 188 (2)— 
Omit "$5,000", substitute "50 penalty unite". 

Section 191 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "Four dollars for every default", substitute "1 penalty unit". 

Subsection 206L (1)— 
Omit "$1,000", substitute "50 penalty unite". 

Paragraph 206P (2) (a)— 
Omit "$25,000", substitute "250 penalty unite". 

Paragraph 206P (2) (b)— 
Omit "$5,000", substitute "50 penalty unite". 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov. 



52 Statute Law Revision (Penalties) No. , 1993 

SCHEDULE—continued 

Subsection 255 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$5,000", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Magistrates Court (Civil Jurisdiction) Act 1982 

Subsection 8 (2) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$500", substitute "50 penalty units or imprisonment for 6 

months, or both". 

Subsection 185 (7)— 
(a) Omit "and is punishable, on conviction, by a fine not exceeding 

$500". 

(b) Add at the end the following penalty provision: 

"Penalty: 50 penalty units or imprisonment for 6 months, or 
both.". 

Subsection 196 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$500", substitute "50 penalty units or imprisonment for 6 

months, or both". 

Maintenance Act 1968 

Subsection 47 (3) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "Two hundred dollars", substitute "50 penalty units or 

imprisonment for 6 months, or both". 

Subsection 60 (1)— 
(a) Omit "punishable, upon conviction, by a fine not exceeding Two 

hundred dollars". 

( b ) Add at the end the following penalty provision: 

"Penalty: 50 penalty units or imprisonment for 6 months, or 
both.". 

Subsection 61 (1)— 
(a) Omit "punishable, upon conviction, by a fine not exceeding Two 

hundred dollars". 

( b ) Add at the end the following penalty provision: 

"Penalty: 50 penalty units or imprisonment for 6 months, or 
both.". 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov. 



Statute Law Revision {Penalties) No. . 1993 53 

SCHEDULE—continued 

Subsection 64 (5)— 
(a) Omit "punishable, upon conviction, by a fine not exceeding Two 

hundred dollars". 

(b ) Add at the end the following penalty provision: 
"Penalty: 50 penalty units or imprisonment for 6 months, or 

both.". 

Subsection 117 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "Five hundred dollars", substitute "50 penalty units or 

imprisonment for 6 months, or both". 

Section 119 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "Two hundred dollars", substitute "50 penalty units or 

imprisonment for 6 months, or both". 

Meat Act 1931 
Subsection 6 (1) (penalty provision)— 

Omit "$500", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Section 7A (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$500", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Section 8 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$500". substitute "50 penalty units". 

Section 11 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$500", substitute the following paragraphs: 

"(a) if the offender is a natural person—50 penalty units; 

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—250 penalty unite". 

Subsection 15 (3) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$500", substitute the following paragraphs: 

"(a) if the offender is a natural person—50 penalty units or 
imprisonment for 6 months, or both; 

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—250 penalty unite". 

Paragraph 20 (d)— 

Omit the paragraph, substitute the following paragraph: 

"(d) the imposition of penalties for breaches of the regulations-

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at vvww.legislation.act.gov. 



54 Statute Law Revision (Penalties) No. , 1993 

SCHEDULE—continued 

(i) if the offender is a natural person—not exceeding 10 
penalty units; or 

(ii) if the offender is a body corporate—not exceeding 50 
penalty units.". 

Medical Practitioners Act 1930 

Section 27 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$500", substitute "5 penalty units". 

Section 45 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$5,000", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Section 46 (penalty provision)— 
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision 

"Penalty: 
(a) for a breach of paragraph (1) (a) or subsection (2)—50 penalty 

units or imprisonment for 6 months, or both; 

(b) for a breach of paragraph (1) (b) or (c>—30 penalty units.". 

Section 47— 
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision: 

"Penalty: 30penalty units". 

Subsection 48 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$25,000", substitute "250 penalty units". 

Subsection 48 (2) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$25,000", substitute "150 penalty units". 

Section 59— 
(a) Omit "and punishable, on conviction, by a fine not exceeding 

$100". 

( b ) Add at the end the following penalty provision: 

"Penalty: 

(a) if the offender is a natural person—10 penalty units; 

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.". 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov. 



Statute Law Revision (Penalties) No. .1993 55 

SCHEDULE—continued 

Mining Act 1930 

Subsection 16 (4) (penalty provision)— 
Omit 'Twenty dollars", substitute "10 penalty units". 

Subsection 48 (4) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "Forty dollars for every day during which the disobedience 

continues", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Subsection 51 (3) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "One hundred dollars, and, in addition. Ten dollars for every day 

after the expiration of the period of twenty-eight days during which he fails 
to furnish the return", substitute "10 penalty units". 

Subsection 54 (3) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "One hundred dollars", substitute "50 penalty uniu or 

imprisonment for 6 months, or both". 

Section 55 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "One hundred dollars", substitute "50 penalty uniu or 

imprisonment for 6 months, or both". 

Section 56 (penalty provision)— 
Omit 'Twenty dollars", substitute "50 penalty units or imprisonment for 

6 months, or both". 

Section 57 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "One hundred dollars", substitute "50 penalty units or 

imprisonment for 6 months, or both". 

Section 58 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "Imprisonment for twelve months", substitute "50 penalty units or 

imprisonment for 6 months, or both". 

Section 59 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "One hundred dollars", substitute "50 penalty uniu or 

imprisonment for 6 months, or both". 

Motor Omnibus Services Act 1955 

Subsection 4C (1)— 
Omit the penalty provision. 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.qov. 



56 Statute Law Revision (Penalties) No. . 1993 
SCHEDULE—continued 

Subsection 4C (2) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$50", substitute "5 penalty units". 

Motor Traffic Act 1936 

Section 20A (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$500", substitute "5 penalty units". 

Subsection 22 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$200", substitute "5 penalty units". 

Subsection 43 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$100", substitute "5 penalty units". 

Section 45 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$100", substitute "5 penalty units". 

Subsection 51 (1) (penalty provisions-
Omit "$500" and "$1,000 or imprisonment for 6 months, or both", 

substitute "5 penalty units" and "10 penalty units" respectively. 

Subsection 52 (5)— 
Omit "$200", substitute "5 penalty units". 

Subsection 54 (4) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000", substitute "10 penalty units". 

Section 60 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$5,000" and "$1,000 or imprisonment for 6 months, or both", 

substitute "150 penalty units" and "30 penalty units" respectively. 

Subsection 86 (7)— 
Omit "$200", substitute "5 penalty units". 

Subsection 89 (1>— 
Omit "$500", substitute "5 penalty units". 

Section 90 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$200", substitute "2 penalty units". 

Section 100 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$80", substitute "1 penalty unit". 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au 



Statute Law Revision (Penalties) No. , 1993 57 

SCHEDULE—continued 

Subsection 129 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$2,000", substitute "100 penalty units". 

Subsection 133B (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000", substitute "30 penalty units". 

Subsection 147A (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$2,000", substitute "30 penalty units". 

Section 147D (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000", substitute "30 penalty units". 

Subsection 150 (2)— 
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision: 

"Penalty: 

(a) for a breach of paragraph (a) or (b>—30 penalty units; 
(b) for a breach of paragraph (c)—50 penalty units or imprisonment 

for 6 months, or both.". 

Subsection 150 (3) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$200", substitute "2 penalty units". 

Section 163G (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$50", substitute "1 penalty unir. 

Subsection 163H (1)— 
Omit the penalty provision. 

Subsection 163H (2) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$100", substitute "5 penalty units". 

Section 163J (penalty provision}— 
Omit "$50", substitute "5 penalty units". 

Section 163K (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$200", substitute "30 penalty units". 

Section 163MA (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$50", substitute "5 penalty units". 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov. 



58 Statute Law Revision (Penalties) No. , 1993 

SCHEDULE—continued 

Section 164G (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$2,000", substitute "20 penalty units". 

Section 1641 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$2,000", substitute "20 penalty units'*. 

Section 168— 
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision: 

"Penalty: 50 penalty units". 

Section 169— 
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision: 

"Penalty: 50 penalty units.". 

Section 186A (penalty p rov i s ions -
Omit "$ 100", substitute "5 penalty units". 

Subsection 189 (3)— 
Omit "$2,000", substitute "20 penalty units". 

Subsection 190A (2>— 
Omit "$80", substitute "1 penalty unit". 

Subsection 192 (2)— 
Omit "$2,000". substitute "20 penalty units". 

Subsection 193A (4) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$10,000", substitute "100 penalty units". 

Subsection 193A (5) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$10,000", substitute "100 penalty units". 

Motor Traffic (Alcohol and Drugs) Act 1977 

Subsection 19 (1)— 
Add at the end "punishable, on conviction, by a fine not exceeding 30 

penalty units". 

Section 22— 
Insert "punishable, on conviction, by a fine not exceeding 30 penalty 

units" after "offence". 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au 



Statute Law Revision (Penalties) No. . 1993 59 

SCHEDULE—continued 

Subsection 23 (1)— 
Insert "punishable, on conviction, by a fine not exceeding 30 penalty 

units" after "offence". 

Subsection 23 (2)— 
Insert "punishable, on conviction, by a fine not exceeding 30 penalty 

units" after "offence". 

Subsection 24 (1)— 
Add at the end "punishable, on conviction, by a fine not exceeding 30 

penalty units". 

Section 26— 
Omit the section. 

Section 27— 
Omit the section. 

Subsection 34 (3)— 
Omit "$2,000", substitute "100 penalty units". 

Subsection 38 (4)— 
Omit "$200,\ substitute "50 penalty units". 

Subsection 40 (7)— 
Omit "$200", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Subsection 46 (1)— 
Add at the end the following penalty provision: 

"Penalty: 50 penalty units or imprisonment for 6 months, or both.". 

Subsection 46 (2)— 
Omit the subsection. 

National Crime Authority (Territory Provisions) Act 1991 

Section 15 (penalty provision)— 
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision: 

"Penalty: 

(a) if the offender is a natural person—50 penalty units or 
imprisonment for 6 months, or both; 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov. 



60 Statutt Law Revision (Penalties) No. . 1993 
SCHEDULE—continued 

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—250 penalty units.". 

Subsection 17 (3) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000" and "6 months", substitute "50 penalty units" and "6 

months, or both" respectively. 

Section 18 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000" and "6 months", substitute "SO penalty units" and "6 

months, or both" respectively. 

Section 22— 
(a) Omit subsections (2), (3) and (4). 

(b ) Add at the end the following penalty provision: 

"Penalty: SO penalty units or imprisonment for 6 months, or 
both.". 

Section 24 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$2,000" and "12 months", substitute "50 penalty units" and "6 

months, or both" respectively. 

Subsection 29 (2) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$5,000" and "12 months", substitute "50 penalty units" and "6 

months, or both" respectively. 

Nature Conservation Act 1980 
Section 12 (penalty provision)— 

Omit "$100", substitute "1 penalty unit". 

Subsection 24 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$10,000", "5 years", "$5,000" and "2 years", substitute "100 

penalty units", "12 months", "50 penalty units" and "6 months" 
respectively. 

Subsection 24 (2) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$2,000" and "$1,000". substitute "30 penalty units" and "20 

penalty units" respectively. 

Subsection 25 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$10,000", "5 years", "$5,000" and "2 years", substitute "100 

penalty units", "12 months", "50 penalty units" and "6 months" 
respectively. 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislafon.act.gov. 



Statute Law Revision (Penalties) No. , 1993 61 
SCHEDULE—continued 

Subsection 26 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$10,000", "5 years", "$5,000" and "2 years", substitute "100 

penalty units", "12 months", "50 penalty units" and "6 months" 
respectively. 

Subsection 27 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$10,000", "5 years", "$5,000" and "2 years", substitute "100 

penalty units", "12 months", "50 penalty units" and "6 months" 
respectively. 

Subsection 28 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$10,000", "5 years", "$5,000" and "2 years", substitute "100 

penalty units", "12 months", "50 penalty units" and "6 months" 
respectively. 

Subsection 29 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$10,000", "5 years", "$5,000" and "2 years", substitute "100 

penalty units", "12 months", "50 penalty units" and "6 months" 
respectively. 

Subsection 30 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$10,000", "5 years", "$5,000" and "2 years", substitute "100 

penalty units", "12 months", "50 penalty units" and "6 months" 
respectively. 

Subsection 36 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$2,000", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Subsection 37 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$2,000", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Subsection 39 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$10,000", "5 years", "$5,000" and "2 years", substitute "100 

penalty units", "12 months", "50 penalty units" and "6 months" 
respectively. 

Subsection 39 (1A) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$2,000", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Subsection 39 (IB) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000", substitute "50 penalty unite". 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au 



62 Statute Law Revision (Penalties) No. , 1993 
SCHEDULE—continued 

Subsection 42 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$10,000", "5 years", "$5,000". "2 years" and "$2,500 or 

imprisonment for 1 year, or both", substitute "100 penalty units", "12 
months", "50 penalty units", "6 months" and "50 penalty units" 
respectively. 

Subsection 43 (2) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000", substitute "50 penalty units or imprisonment for 6 

months, or both". 

Subsection 44 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$10,000", "5 years", "$5,000" and "2 years", substitute "100 

penalty units", "12 months", "50 penalty uniu" and "6 months" 
respectively. 

Subsection 45 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$5,000" and "$2,500", substitute "50 penalty units" and "25 

penalty units" respectively. 

Subsection 48 (2) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$5,000" and "$2,500", substitute "100 penalty units" and "50 

penalty units" respectively. 

Subsection 53 (3) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$2,000", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Subsection 54 (2) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$500", substitute "10 penalty units". 

Subsection 55 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$500", substitute "10 penalty units". 

Subsection 55 (2) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Subsection 56 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$500", substitute "30 penalty units". 

Subsection 56 (2) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$500", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Subsection 56 (3) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov. 



Statute Law Revision (Penalties) No. ,1993 63 
SCHEDULE—continued 

Subsection 57 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$500", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Subsection 58 (3) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$500", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Section 59 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Section 70 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000" and "$500", substitute "10 penalty units" and "5 penalty 

units" respectively. 

Section 71 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000" and "$500", substitute "20 penalty units" and "10 

penalty units" respectively. 

Subsection 72 (3) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000" and "$500", substitute "20 penalty units" and "10 

penalty units" respectively. 

Section 73— 
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision: 

"Penalty: 50 penalty units." 

Section 77 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$2,000" and "12 months", substitute "50 penalty units" and "6 

months" respectively. 

Subsection 78 (3) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$500", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Paragraph 84 (1) (b>— 
Omit "not exceeding $500 for offences against the regulations", 

substitute the following: 

"for offences against the regulations— 

(a) if the offender is a natural person—not exceeding 10 penalty units; 
or 

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—not exceeding 50 penalty 
units.". 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov. 



64 Statute Law Revision (Penalties) No. ,1993 
SCHEDULE—continued 

Noise Control Act 1988 

Paragraph 11 (2) (a)— 
Omit "$2,500", substitute "250 penalty units". 

Paragraph 11 (2) (b)— 
Omit "$500", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Section 15 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$5,000" and "$1,000", substitute "250 penalty units" and "50 

penalty units" respectively. 

Paragraph 42 (2) (a)— 
Omit "$5,000", substitute "250 penalty units". 

Paragraph 42 (2) (b)— 
Omit "$1,000", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Paragraph 50 (b>— 
Omit "not exceeding $500 for breaches of the regulations", substitute 

the following: 

"for offences against the regulations— 

(a) if the offender is a natural person—not exceeding 10 penalty units; 
or 

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—not exceeding 50 penalty 
units.". 

Notaries Public Act 1984 

Section 10 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$100", substitute "5 penalty units". 

Subsection 14 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$2,000", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Nurses Act 1988 

Subsection 18 (5) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$100", substitute "5 penalty units". 

Section 25 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$100", substitute "5 penalty units". 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.xt.gov. 



Statute Law Revision (Penalties) No. , 1993 65 

SCHEDULE—continued 

Subsection 31 (4) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$100", substitute "5 penalty units". 

Section 36 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$100", substitute "5 penalty units". 

Subsection 43 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$2,000", substitute "50 penalty units or imprisonment for 6 

months, or both". 

Subsection 43 (2) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$200", substitute "50 penalty unite". 

Subsection 44 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000", substitute "30 penalty units". 

Subsection 44 (2) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000", substitute "30 penalty units". 

Subsection 45 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$2,000", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Subsection 45 (2) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000", substitute "30 penalty units". 

Section 46 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$500" and "$2,500", substitute "50 penalty units" and "250 

penalty unite" respectively. 

Section 47 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$500", substitute "50 penalty unite". 

Section 51 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$500", substitute "50 penalty unite". 

Section 53 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000", substitute "50 penalty unite". 

Oaths and Affirmations Act 1984 

Subsection 25 (2)— 
Omit "$1,000", substitute "50 penalty unite". 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov. 



66 Statute Law Revision (Penalties) No. . 1993 
SCHEDULE—continued 

Occupational Health and Safety Act 1989 

Subsection 27 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$20,000" and "$100,000", substitute "250 penalty units" and 

"1,250 penalty units" respectively. 

Section 28 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$20,000" and "$100,000". substitute "250 penalty units" and 

"1,250 penalty units" respectively. 

Section 29 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$20,000" and "$100,000". substitute "250 penalty units" and 

"1,250 penalty units" respectively. 

Subsection 30 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$20,000", substitute "250 penalty units". 

Section 31 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$20,000", substitute "250 penalty units". 

Subsection 32 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$20,000" and "$100,000", substitute "250 penalty units" and 

"1,250 penalty units" respectively. 

Subsection 32 (2) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$20,000" and "$100,000", substitute "250 penalty units" and 

"1,250 penalty units" respectively. 

Subsection 33 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$20,000" and "$100,000", substitute "250 penalty units" and 

"1,250 penalty units" respectively. 

Section 34 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$20,000" and "$100,000", substitute "250 penalty units" and 

"1,250 penalty units" respectively. 

Subsection 37 (3) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000" and "$5,000", substitute "10 penalty units" and "50 

penalty units" respectively. 

Subsection 38 (7)— 
Omit "$100", substitute "1 penalty unit". 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.goy. 



Statute Law Revision (Penalties) No. . 1993 67 

SCHEDULE—continued 

Subsection 40 (7)— 
Omit "$100", substitute "1 penalty unit". 

Subsection 41 (6)— 
Omit "$100", substitute "1 penalty unit". 

Subsection 42 (2)— 
Omit "$100", substitute "1 penalty unit". 

Subsection 45 (1)— 
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision: 

"Penalty: 

(a) if the offender is a natural person—50 penalty unite; 

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—250 penalty unite.". 

Subsection 45 (2) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000" and "$5,000", substitute "50 penalty units or 

imprisonment for 6 months, or both" and "250 penalty unite" respectively. 

Subsection 45 (3) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000" and "$5,000", substitute "10 penalty units" and "50 

penalty unite" respectively. 

Subsection 51 (8) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$100", substitute "1 penalty unit". 

Subsection 52 (2) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000" and "$5,000", substitute "10 penalty units" and "50 

penalty unite" respectively. 

Section 53 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$10,000" and "$50,000", substitute "100 penalty units" and "500 

penalty unite" respectively. 

Subsection 59 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000" and "$5,000", substitute "10 penalty units" and "50 

penalty unite" respectively. 

Subsection 59 (2) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000" and "$5,000", substitute "50 penalty units or 

imprisonment for 6 months, or both" and "250 penalty unite" respectively. 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov 



68 Statute Law Revision (Penalties) No. . 1993 
SCHEDULE—continued 

Subsection 59 (4) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000" and "$5,000", substitute "10 penalty units" and "50 

penalty units" respectively. 

Section 67 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$10,000", "2 years" and "$50,000", substitute "100 penalty 

units", "12 months" and "500 penalty units" respectively. 

Section 68 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$10,000", "2 years" and "$50,000", substitute "100 penalty 

units", "12 months" and "500 penalty units" respectively. 

Subsection 69 (6)— 
Omit "$100", substitute "1 penalty unit". 

Section 73 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$100", substitute "1 penalty unit". 

Subsection 76 (5) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000" and "$5,000", substitute "10 penalty units" and "50 

penalty units" respectively. 

Subsection 78 (5) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000" and "$5,000". substitute "10 penalty units" and "50 

penalty units" respectively. 

Section 79 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$10,000" and "$50,000", substitute "100 penalty units" and "500 

penalty units" respectively. 

Section 84E (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$5,000" and "$25,000", substitute "50 penalty units" and '750 

penalty units" respectively. 

Subsection 84K (1)— 
Omit the penalty provision. 

Subsection 84K (2) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$5,000", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Section 84M (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$5,000", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov. 



Statute Law Revision (Penalties) No. ,1993 69 

SCHEDULE—continued 

Section 84N (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$5,000" and "$25,000", substitute "50 penalty units" and "250 

penalty units" respectively. 

Paragraph 85 (2) (a)— 
Omit "$10,000" and "2 years", substitute "100 penalty units" and "12 

months" respectively. 

Paragraph 85 (2) (b)— 
Omit "$50,000", substitute "500 penalty units". 

Paragraph 86 (2) (a)— 
Omit "$1,000". substitute "10 penalty units". 

Paragraph 86 (2) (b)— 
Omit "$5,000", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Subsection 88 (1)— 
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision: 

"Penalty: 50 penalty units or imprisonment for 6 months, or both.". 

Subsection 89 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$5,000", "one year" and "$25,000", substitute "50 penalty 

units", "6 months" and "250 penalty units" respectively. 

Section 90 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$5,000", "one year" and "$25,000", substitute "50 penalty 

units", "6 months" and "250 penalty units" respectively. 

Section 91 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$5,000", "one year" and "$25,000", substitute "50 penalty 

units", "6 months" and "250 penalty units" respectively. 

Section 92 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$5,000", "one year" and "$25,000", substitute "50 penalty 

units", "6 months" and "250 penalty units" respectively. 

Paragraph 97 (2) (w)— 
Omit "not exceeding $1,000 for offences against the regulations", 

substitute the following: 

"for offences against the regulations— 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.leqislation.act.gov. 



70 Statute Law Revision (Penalties) No. , 1993 
SCHEDULE—continued 

(a) if the offender is a natural person—not exceeding 10 penalty units; 
or 

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—not exceeding 50 penalty 
units". 

Ombudsman Act 1989 

Subsection 33 (2) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$500", substitute "50 penalty units or imprisonment for 6 

months, or both". 

Subsection 33 (5) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "Imprisonment for 2 years", substitute "50 penalty units or 

imprisonment for 6 months, or both". 

Subsection 35 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000" and "3 months", substitute "50 penalty units" and "6 

months, or both" respectively. 

Subsection 35 (2) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000" and "3 months", substitute "50 penalty units" and "6 

months, or both" respectively. 

Optometrists Act 1956 

Section 19 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$100", substitute "5 penalty unite". 

Subsection 27A (2) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$100", substitute "5 penalty unite". 

Subsection 29 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000", substitute "50 penalty unite or imprisonment for 6 

months, or both". 

Subsection 30 (1)— 
Add at the end the following penalty provision: 

"Penalty: 250penalty unite". 

Subsection 30 (2) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$500", substitute "150 penalty units". 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov. 



Statute Law Revision (Penalties) No. .1993 71 

SCHEDULE—continued 

Subsection 33A (3)— 
Omit all the words after "punishable", substitute the following: 

"on conviction— 

(a) in the case of a natural person—by a fine not exceeding 50 penalty 
units or imprisonment for 6 months, or both; and 

(b) in the case of a body corporate—by a fine not exceeding 250 
penalty units". 

Section 46 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$500", substitute the following paragraphs: 

"(a) for a breach of paragraph (a)—50 penalty units or imprisonment 
for 6 months, or both; or 

(b) for a breach of paragraph (b)—50 penalty units.". 

Paragraph 47AD (2) (a)— 
Omit "$1,000", substitute "25 penalty units". 

Paragraph 47AD (2) (b>— 
Omit "$500", substitute "5 penalty units". 

Ozone Protection Act 1991 

Subsection 16 (5)— 
Omit all the words after "punishable", substitute the following: 

"on conviction— 

(a) if the offender is a natural person—by a fine not exceeding 50 
penalty units; and 

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—by a fine not exceeding 250 
penalty units". 

Section 34— 
Repeal the section, substitute the following section: 

Obstructing inspectors 
"34. (1) A person shall not, without reasonable excuse, obstruct or 

hinder the Authority or an inspector in the exercise of powers under this Act 
or the regulations. 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at wvm.legislation.act.gov. 



72 Statute Law Revision (Penalties) No. . 1993 

SCHEDULE—continued 

Penalty: 

(a) if the offender is a natural person—50 penalty units or 
imprisonment for 6 months, or both; 

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—250 penalty units. 

"(2) A person shall not, without reasonable excuse, contravene a 
requirement made by the Authority or an inspector under the Act 

Penalty: 

(a) if the offender is a natural person—50 penalty units; 

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—250 penalty units." 

Section 35— 
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision: 

"Penalty: 

(a) if the offender is a natural person—50 penalty units or 
imprisonment for 6 months, or both; 

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—250 penalty units.". 

Paragraph 48 (2) (b>— 
Omit "exceeding $1,000", substitute "exceeding— 

(a) if the offender is a natural person—10 penalty units; or 

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units". 

Pawnbrokers Act 1902 of the State of New South Wales in its 
application in the Territory 

Section 5 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000", substitute "50 penalty units or imprisonment for 6 

months, or both". 

Section 9 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000", substitute "50 penalty units or imprisonment for 6 

months, or both". 

Section 11 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$500", substitute "5 penalty units". 

Section 12 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$500", substitute "5 penalty units". 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.xt.gov.au 



Statute Law Revision (Penalties) No. , 1993 73 

SCHEDULE—continued 

Subsection 13 (3)— 
Omit "$500", substitute "20 penalty units". 

Section 14 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$500", substitute "5 penalty units". 

Section 15 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$500", substitute "5 penalty units". 

Section 16 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$500", substitute "5 penalty units". 

Subsection 18 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$500", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Subsection 19 (3)— 
Omit "$500", substitute "5 penalty units". 

Subsection 21 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$500", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Subsection 22 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$500", substitute "20 penalty units". 

Subsection 22 (2) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$500", substitute "50 penalty units or imprisonment for 6 

months, or both". 

Section 23 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$500", substitute "5 penalty units". 

Section 24 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000", substitute "30 penalty units". 

Section 26 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$500", substitute "5 penalty units". 

Section 33 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$500". substitute "30 penalty units". 

Section 34 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000", substitute "30 penalty units". 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at vww.legislation.act.gov. 



74 Statute Law Revision (Penalties) No. , 1993 

SCHEDULE—continued 

Section 35 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$5,000" and "2 years", substitute "50 penalty units" and "6 

months" respectively. 

Section 36— 
Omit "$5,000" and "2 years", substitute "50 penalty units" and "6 

months" respectively. 

Section 37 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Pesticides Act 1989 

Section 52 (penalty provision)— 

Omit "$2,000", substitute the following paragraphs: 

"(a) if the offender is a natural person—50 penalty units; 

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—250 penalty units". 

Subsection 60 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$2,000", substitute the following paragraphs: 

"(a) if the offender is a natural person—50 penalty units or 
imprisonment for 6 months, or both; 

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—250 penalty units". 

Subsection 71 (4) (penalty provision)— 

Omit "$1,000", substitute the following paragraphs: 

"(a) if the offender is a natural person—50 penalty units; 

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—250 penalty units". 

Pharmacy Act 1931 

Subsection 25 (4)— 
Omit "$ 100", substitute "5 penalty units". 

Section 27 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$100", substitute "5 penalty units". 

Subsection 35 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000", substitute "30 penalty units". 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov. 



Statute Law Revision (Penalties) No. . 1993 75 

SCHEDULE—continued 

Subsection 35 (2) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000", substitute "50 penalty units or imprisonment for 6 

months, or both". 

Paragraph 37 (2) (a)— 
Omit "$1,000", substitute "25 penalty units". 

Paragraph 37 (2) (b)— 
Omit "$500", substitute "5 penalty units'*. 

Subsection 44 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$250", substitute "5 penalty units". 

Subsection 45 (1)— 
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision: 

"Penalty: 50 penalty units or imprisonment for 6 months, or both". 

Subsection 46 (4) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$500", substitute "30 penalty units". 

Section 47 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Section 51— 
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision: 

"Penalty: 50 penalty units or imprisonment for 6 months, or both.". 

Section 52— 
Omit "$250", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Physiotherapists Registration Act 1977 

Section 19 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$100", substitute "5 penalty units". 

Subsection 31 (1)— 
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision: 

"Penalty: 50 penalty units or imprisonment for 6 months, or both.". 

Subsection 31 (2) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$250", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov. 



76 Statute Law Revision (Penalties) No. . 1993 
SCHEDULE—continued 

Subsection 32 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000", substitute "30 penalty units". 

Plant Diseases Act 1934 

Section 8 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "Forty dollars", substitute "5 penalty units". 

Section 11 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "One hundred dollars", substitute the following paragraphs: 

"(a) for a breach of paragraph (a)—50 penalty units or imprisonment 
for 6 months, or both; 

(b) for a breach of paragraph (b)—50 penalty units; 

(c) for a breach of paragraph (c>—20 penalty units." 

Section 12— 
Repeal the section. 

Paragraph 14 (g)— 

Omit all the words after "penalties", substitute the following: 

"in respect of breaches of the regulations not exceeding— 

(a) if the offender is a natural person—10 penalty units; or 
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units". 

Police Act 1927 

Section 13 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "One hundred dollars or imprisonment for three months", 

substitute "50 penalty units or imprisonment for 6 months, or both". 

Section 17 (penalty provision)— 
Omit 'Two dollars", substitute "2 penalty units". 

Police Offences Act 1930 

Section 34 (penalty provision)— 
Omit 'Ten dollars", substitute "1 penalty unit". 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov. 



Statute Law Revision (Penalties) No. . 1993 77 

SCHEDULE—continued 

Pounds Act 1928 

Section 35 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "One hundred dollars or imprisonment for six months, or both", 

substitute "10 penalty units". 

Section 37 (penalty provision)— 
Omit 'Twenty dollars", substitute "50 penalty units or imprisonment for 

6 months, or both". 

Proceeds of Crime Act 1991 

Paragraph 56 (1) (a)— 
Omit "$20,000", substitute "200 penalty units". 

Paragraph 56 (1) (b)— 
Omit "$100,000", substitute "1,000 penalty units". 

Paragraph 66 (2) (a)— 
Omit "$20,000" and "2 years", substitute "100 penalty units" and "12 

months" respectively. 

Paragraph 66 (2) (b)— 
Omit "$100,000", substitute "500 penalty units". 

Subsection 69 (7)— 
Omit "$100,000", substitute "1,000 penalty units". 

Paragraph 70 (5) (a)— 
Omit "$20,000", substitute "200 penalty units". 

Paragraph 70 (5) (b)— 
Omit "$100,000", substitute "1,000 penalty units". 

Subsection 72 (6)— 
Omit "$10,000", substitute "100 penalty units". 

Subsection 73 (3)— 
Omit "$10,000", substitute "100 penalty units". 

Paragraph 74 (2) (a)— 
Omit "$100,000", substitute "1,000 penalty units". 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov. 



78 Statute Law Revision (Penalties) No. . 1993 
SCHEDULE—continued 

Paragraph 74 (2) (b>— 
Omit "$500,000", substitute "5,000 penalty units". 

Paragraph 75 (1) (a)— 
Omit "$10,000" and "2 years", substitute "100 penalty units" and "12 

months" respectively. 

Paragraph 75 (1) (b>— 
Omit "$50,000", substitute "500 penalty units". 

Paragraph 76 (1) (a)— 
Omit "$150,000", substitute "1,500 penalty units". 

Paragraph 76 (1) (b>— 
Omit "$750,000", substitute "7,500 penalty units". 

Paragraph 89 (2) ( a y -
Omit "$20,000", substitute "200 penalty units". 

Paragraph 89 (2) (by -
Omit "$100,000", substitute "1,000 penalty units". 

Protection of Lands Act 1937 

Subsection 3 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit 'Twenty dollars", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Subsection 7 (1)— 
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision: 

"Penalty: 30 penalty units". 

Section 8 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "Forty dollars", substitute "30 penalty unite". 

Public Health Act 1928 

Paragraph 12 (p)— 
Omit the paragraph, substitute the following paragraph: 

"(p) the imposition of penalties for offences against the regulations not 
exceeding— 

(i) if the offender is a natural person—10 penalty units; or 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au 



Statute Law Revision (Penalties) No. , 1993 '» 

SCHEDULE—continued 

(ii) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.". 

Public Parks Act 1928 
Section 9 (penalty provision)— 

Omit 'Twenty dollars", substitute "5 penalty units". 

Subsection 10 (3) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "Forty dollars", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Paragraph 12 (f)— 
Omit the paragraph, substitute the following paragraph: 

"(f) the imposition of penalties for offences against the regulations not 
exceeding— 

(i) if the offender is a natural person—10 penalty units; or 
(ii) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units". 

Public Trustee Act 1985 

Subsection 67 (2) (penalty provision)— 

Omit "$500", substitute "2 penalty units". 

Rabbit Destruction Act 1919 

Section 15— 
Omit "One hundred dollars", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Section 28 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "One hundred dollars", substitute "5 penalty units". 

Subsection 37 (1)— 
Omit 'Two hundred dollars", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Section 38— 
Omit 'Two hundred dollars", substitute "10 penalty units". 

Section 39— 
Omit "Forty dollars", substitute "10 penalty units". 

Subsection 40 (1)— 
Omit Twenty dollars" and "two months", substitute "50 penalty units" 

and "6 months, or both" respectively. 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov. 



80 Siatuu Law Revision (Penalties) No. . 1993 
SCHEDULE—continued 

Subsection 40 (2)— 
Omit 'Two hundred dollars" and "six months", substitute "50 penalty 

units" and "6 months" respectively. 

Rates and Land Rent (Relief) Act 1970 

Subsection 21BA (3)— 
Omit "$500", substitute "5 penalty units". 

Rous and Land Tax Act 1926 

Subsection 22AAA (8)— 
Omit "$1,000", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Section 22GB— 
Omit all the words after "offence", substitute the following penalty 

provision: 

"Penalty: 

(a) if the offender is a natural person—50 penalty units or 
imprisonment for 6 months, or both; 

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—250 penalty units.". 

Section 22GC— 
Omit all the words after "offence", substitute the following penalty 

provision: 

"Penalty: 

(a) if the offender is a natural person—50 penalty units or 
imprisonment for 6 months, or both; 

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—250 penalty units.". 

Section 22GD— 
Omit all the words after "offence", substitute the following penalty 

provision: 

"Penalty: 

(a) if the offender is a natural person—50 penalty units or 
imprisonment for 6 months, or both; 

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—250 penalty units". 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counset-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au 



Statute Law Revision (Penalties) No. . 1993 81 

SCHEDULE—continued 

Registration of Interests in Goods Act 1990 

Paragraph 11 (2) (ay-
Omit "$5,000", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Paragraph 11 (2) (b)— 
Omit "$25,000", substitute "250 penalty units". 

Roads and Public Places Act 1937 

Subsection 4 (3)— 
Add at the end ", punishable on conviction by a fine not exceeding 5 

penalty units". 

Subsection 5 (3)— 
Add at the end ". punishable on conviction by a fine not exceeding 50 

penalty units, or imprisonment for a term not exceeding 6 months, or both 
fine and imprisonment". 

Section 7— 
Add at the end ", punishable on conviction by a fine not exceeding 50 

penalty units, or imprisonment for a term not exceeding 6 months, or both 
fine and imprisonment". 

Section 8— 
Add at the end ", punishable on conviction by a fine not exceeding 30 

penalty units". 

Section 10 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "Forty dollars", substitute "30 penalty units". 

Section 11— 
Add at the end ", punishable on conviction by a fine not exceeding 30 

penalty units". 

Section 12— 
Add at the end ", punishable on conviction by a fine not exceeding 10 

penalty units". 

Subsection 13 (3)— 
Add at the end ", punishable on conviction— 

(a) for a contravention of subsection (1)—by a fine not exceeding 5 
penalty units; or 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov. 



82 Statute Law Revision (Penalties) No. . 1993 

SCHEDULE—continued 

(b) for a contravention of subsection (2)—by a fine not exceeding 50 
penalty units". 

Section 15 
Repeal the section. 

Subsection 15R (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$20", substitute "1 penalty unit". 

Scaffolding and Lifts Act 1912-1948 of the State of New South 
Wales in its application in the Territory 

Subsection 6 (1)— 
Add at the end the following penalty provision: 

"Penalty: 

(a) if the offender is a natural person—20 penalty units; 

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—100 penalty units.". 

Subsection 6 (2)— 
Omit the subsection 

Subsection 10 C D -
Add at the end the following penalty provision: 

"Penalty: 10 penalty units.". 

Subsection 10 (2)— 
Omit the subsection 

Section 11— 
Omit 'Twenty dollars", substitute "1 penalty unit". 

Section 12— 
Omit "ten pounds", substitute "1 penalty unit". 

Subsection 12A (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$100", substitute "5 penalty units". 

Subsection 12A (2) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$25", substitute "1 penalty unit". 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au 



Statute Law Revision (Penalties) No. . 1993 83 

SCHEDULE—continued 

Section 14— 
Omit "penalty not exceeding Twenty dollars", substitute the following: 

"penalty— 
(a) in the case of a natural person—not exceeding 50 penalty units; or 

(b) in the case of a body corporate—not exceeding 250 penalty units". 

Subsection 15 (5)— 
Omit "penalty not exceeding Two hundred dollars", substitute the 

following: 

"penalty— 
(a) in the case of a natural person—not exceeding 50 penalty units; or 

(b) in the case of a body corporate—not exceeding 250 penalty units". 

Section 16— 
Omit "Forty dollars", substitute "50 penalty units or imprisonment for 6 

months, or both". 

Subsection 18 (3)— 
Omit "penalty not exceeding fifty pounds", substitute the following: 

"penalty— 

(a) in the case of a natural person—not exceeding 20 penalty units; or 

(b) in the case of a body corporate—not exceeding 100 penalty units". 

Section 21— 
Omit "penalty not exceeding One hundred dollars", substitute the 

following: 

"penalty— 
(a) in the case of a natural person—not exceeding 10 penalty units; or 

(b) in the case of a body corporate—not exceeding 50 penalty units". 

Second-hand Dealers and Collectors Act 1906 of the State of 
New South Wales in its application in the Territory 

Section 3 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000", substitute "50 penalty units or imprisonment for 6 

months, or both". 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at viww.legislation.act.gov. 



84 Statute Law Revision (Penalties} No. .1993 
SCHEDULE—continued 

Section 8— 
Omit "$500", substitute "20 penalty units". 

Section 8A (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$500", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Paragraph 9 (5) (a)— 
Omit "$1,000", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Paragraph 9 (5) (b)— 
Omit "$500", substitute "5 penalty units". 

Section 11— 
Omit "fine not exceeding $500", substitute the following: 

"penalty— 

(a) for a breach of paragraph (2) or (3)—not exceeding 5 penalty 
units; or 

(b) for a breach of paragraph (4)—not exceeding 50 penalty units". 

Section 12 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000", substitute "30 penalty units". 

Section 12A (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$500", substitute "5 penalty units". 

Section 13 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000", substitute "50 penalty units or imprisonment for 6 

months, or both". 

Sewerage Rates Act 1968 

Section 25 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "One hundred dollars", substitute the following paragraphs: 

"(a) for a breach of paragraph (2) (a)—5 penalty units; or 

(b) for a breach of paragraph (2) (b)—50 penalty units or 
imprisonment for 6 months, or both". 

Subsection 28 (2) (penalty provision)— 
Omit 'Twenty-five dollars", substitute "50 penalty units or 

imprisonment for 6 months, or both". 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov. 



Statute Law Revision (Penalties) No. , 1993 85 

SCHEDULE—continued 

Small Claims Act 1974 

Subsection 5 (2)— 
Omit "$500", substitute "50 penalty units or by imprisonment for a term 

not exceeding 6 months, or by both". 

Subsection 13 (4)— 
Omit "$500", substitute "50 penalty units or by imprisonment for a term 

not exceeding 6 months, or by both". 

Section 18 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000", substitute "50 penalty units or imprisonment for 6 

months, or both". 

Section 21 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$500", substitute "50 penalty units or imprisonment for 6 

months, or both". 

Soil Conservation Act I960 

Subsection 4 (6) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "Four hundred dollars", substitute the following paragraphs: 

"(a) if the of fender is a natural person—50 penalty units; or 

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—250 penalty units". 

Subsection 9 (2) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "Four hundred dollars", substitute the following paragraphs: 

"(a) if the offender is a natural person—50 penalty units or 
imprisonment for 6 months, or both; 

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—250 penalty units". 

Section 11 (penalty provision)— 
Omit 'Two hundred dollars or imprisonment for six months", substitute 

"50 penalty units or imprisonment for 6 months, or both". 

Stamp Duties and Taxes Act 1987 

Section 14 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$10,000" and "2 years", substitute "100 penalty units" and "12 

months" respectively. 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov 



86 Statute Law Revision (Penalties) No. , 1993 
SCHEDULE—continued 

Subsection 15 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$10,000" and "2 years", substitute "100 penalty units" and "12 

months" respectively. 

Section 16 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$10,000" and "2 years", substitute "100 penalty units" and "12 

months" respectively. 

Subsection 37 (1)— 
(a) Omit all the words after "subsection 33 (2)", substitute "is guilty 

of an offence". 
( b) Add at the end the following penalty provision: 

"Penalty: SO penalty units or imprisonment for 6 months, or 
both.". 

Section 40 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$2,000", substitute "20 penalty units". 

Section 41 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$10,000", substitute "100 penalty units or imprisonment for 12 

months, or both". 

Section 56C (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$2,000", substitute "20 penalty units". 

Subsection 56E (3)— 
Omit "$2,000", substitute "20 penalty units". 

Stock Act 1991 

Section 12 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$100", substitute "1 penalty unit". 

Subsection 16 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$500", substitute "10 penalty units". 

Paragraph 17 (5) (a)— 
Omit "$1,000", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Paragraph 17 (5) (b)— 
Omit "$5,000", substitute "250 penalty units". 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov. 



Statute Law Revision (Penalties) No. . 1993 87 

SCHEDULE—continued 

Subsection 21 (2) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$500" and "$2,500", substitute "50 penalty units or 

imprisonment for 6 months, or both" and "250 penalty units" respecuvely. 

Paragraph 22 (2) (ay-
Omit "$500". substitute "10 penalty units". 

Paragraph 22 (2) (by-
Omit "$2,500", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Paragraph 30 (3) (ay-
Omit "$500", substitute "10 penalty units". 

Paragraph 30 (3) (by -
Omit "$2,500,\ substitute "50 penalty units". 

Section 32 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000" and "$5,000", substitute "50 penalty units or 

imprisonment for 6 months, or both" and "250 penalty units" respectively. 

Paragraph 33 (5) (ay-
Omit "$1,000", substitute "50 penalty units or imprisonment for 6 

months, or both". 

Paragraph 33 (5) ( b y -
Omit "$5,000", substitute "250 penalty units". 

Section 34 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000" and "$5,000", substitute "50 penalty units or 

imprisonment for 6 months, or both" and "250 penalty units" respecuvely. 

Subsection 35 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$500", substitute "5 penalty units". 

Section 36 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000" and "$5,000", substitute "10 penalty units" and "50 

penalty units" respectively. 

Section 37 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov. 



88 Statute Law Revision (Penalties) No. , 1993 
SCHEDULE—continued 

Section 44— 
Omit "penalties not exceeding $1,000 for offences against the 

regulations", substitute the following: 

"penalties for offences against the regulations— 

(a) if the offender is a natural person—not exceeding 10 penalty units; 
or 

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—not exceeding 50 penalty 
units". 

Stock Diseases Act 1933 

Section SB (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$100", substitute "1 penalty unit". 

Section 7 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$5,000" and "$25,000". substitute "50 penalty units" and "250 

penalty units" respectively. 

Section 9A (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$5,000" and "$25,000", substitute "50 penalty units" and "250 

penalty units" respectively. 

Section 9B— 
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision: 

"Penalty: 

(a) if the offender is a natural person—50 penalty units or 
imprisonment for 6 months, or both; 

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—250 penalty units". 

Section 11 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$5,000" and "$25,000", substitute "50 penalty units" and "250 

penalty units" respectively. 

Subsection 11A (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000" and "$5,000", substitute "50 penalty units" and "250 

penalty units" respectively. 

Section 11G (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000" and "$5,000", substitute "50 penalty units or 

imprisonment for 6 months, or both" and "250 penalty units" respectively. 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au 



Statute Law Revision (Penalties) No. , 1993 »9 

SCHEDULE—continued 

Subsection 11H (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000" and "$5,000", substitute "50 penalty unite" and "250 

penalty units" respectively. 

Section 11J (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Subsection UK (2)— 
Omit "$1,000", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Subsection 11L (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000", substitute "10 penalty units". 

Subparagraph 12 (m) (i)— 
Omit "$1,000", substitute "10 penalty units". 

Subparagraph 12 (m) (ii>— 
Omit "$5,000", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Surveyors Act 1967 

Section 22 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$200", substitute "50 penalty units or imprisonment for 6 

months, or both". 

Section 23 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$10", substitute "5 penalty units". 

Subsection 29 (2) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$10 for every day after the period of 14 days during which the 

certificate is not delivered to the Board", substitute "5 penalty units". 

Section 35 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$200", substitute "50 penalty units or imprisonment for 6 

months, or both". 

Subsection 41 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$100", substitute "50 penalty units or imprisonment for 6 

months, or both". 

Subsection 42 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$100", substitute "50 penalty units or imprisonment for 6 

months, or both". 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.iegislation.act.gov. 



90 Statute Law Revision (Penalties) No. , 1993 

SCHEDULE—continued 

Subsection 47 (3) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$200", substitute "50 penalty units or imprisonment for 6 

months, or both". 

Subsection 48 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$200", substitute "20 penalty units". 

Subsection 51A (2) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "One hundred dollars", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Section 53— 
Omit all the words after "imposition or, substitute the following: 

"penalties for offences against the regulations— 

(a) if the offender is a natural person—not exceeding 10 penalty units; 
or 

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—not exceeding 50 penalty 
units". 

Taxation (Administration) Act 1987 

Subsection 43 (8)— 
Omit "$1,000", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Subsection 46 (1)— 
Omit "conviction, by a fine not exceeding $2,000", substitute the 

following: 

"conviction— 
(a) for a breach of paragraph (a), (b) or (c)—by a fine not exceeding 

50 penalty units; or 
(b) for a breach of paragraph (d), (e) or (f)—by a fine not exceeding 

50 penalty units or by imprisonment for a term not exceeding 6 
months, or both". 

Subsection 46 (2)— 
Omit "$2,000", substitute "50 penalty units or by imprisonment for a 

term not exceeding 6 months, or both". 

Subsection 46 (3)— 
Omit "$2,000", substitute "50 penalty units or by imprisonment for a 

term not exceeding 6 months, or both". 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.xt.gov. 



Statute Law Revision (Penalties) No. , 1993 91 

SCHEDULE—continued 

Subsection 47 (3)— 
Omit "$5,000", substitute "100 penalty unite". 

Subsection 48 (1)— 
Omit "$4,000", substitute "50 penalty unite or sentence the person to a 

term of imprisonment not exceeding 6 months, or both". 

Subsection 48 (2)— 
Omit "$5,000", substitute "100 penalty unite". 

Subsection 50 (1)— 
Omit "$2,000", substitute "30 penalty unite". 

Subsection 50 (3)— 
Omit "$3,000", substitute "50 penalty unite or by imprisonment for a 

term not exceeding 6 months, or both". 

Subsection 51 (1)— 
Omit "$2,000", substitute "30 penalty unite". 

Subsection 51 (4)— 
Omit "$3,000", substitute "50 penalty unite or by imprisonment for a 

term not exceeding 6 months, or bom". 

Subsection 51 (5)— 
Omit "$5,000" and "12 months", substitute "50 penalty unite" and "6 

months" respectively. 

Section 52— 
Omit "$5,000" and "12 months", substitute "50 penalty unite" and "6 

months" respectively. 

Subsection 53 C D -
Omit "$4,000", substitute "50 penalty unite". 

Subsection 53 (2)— 
Omit "$5,000", substitute "100 penalty unite". 

Subsection 53 (3)— 
Omit "$10,000" and "2 years", substitute "100 penalty unite" and "12 

months" respectively. 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au 



92 Statute Law Revision (Penalties) No. , 1993 
SCHEDULE—continued 

Section 55— 
Omit "$2,000", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Subsection 57 (1)— 
Omit "$1,000", substitute "100 penalty units or by imprisonment for a 

term not exceeding 12 months, or both". 

Subsection 57 (2)— 
Omit "$1,000", substitute "50 penalty units or by imprisonment for a 

term not exceeding 6 months, or bom". 

Subsection 96 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$2,000", substitute "20 penalty units". 

Subsection 97 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$5,000" and "12 months", substitute "50 penalty units" and "6 

months" respectively. 

Trade Measurement Act 1991 

Subsection 7 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$10,000" and "$5,000", substitute "100 penalty units" and "50 

penalty units" respectively. 

Subsection 7 (2) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$10,000", substitute "100 penalty units". 

Subsection 8 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$20,000", substitute "200 penalty units". 

Subsection 8 (2) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$20,000", substitute "200 penalty units". 

Subsection 8 (3) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$20,000", substitute "200 penalty units". 

Subsection 9 (2) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$20,000", substitute "200 penalty units". 

Section 16 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$5,000", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au 



Statute Law Revision (Penalties) No. . 1993 
SCHEDULE—continued 

Subsection 18 (2) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$20,000", substitute "200 penalty units". 

Subsection 20 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$20,000", substitute "200 penalty units". 

Section 21 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$20,000", substitute "200 penalty units". 

Subsection 22 (3) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$5,000", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Section 23 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$20,000", substitute "200 penalty units". 

Section 24 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$20,000", substitute "200 penalty units". 

Subsection 25 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$5.000M, substitute "50 penalty units". 

Subsection 25 (3) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$5,000", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Subsection 26 (2) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$5,000", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Subsection 28 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$10,000", substitute "100 penalty units". 

Subsection 28 (2) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$10,000", substitute "100 penalty units". 

Subsection 30 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$5,000", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Subsection 31 (1) (penalty provisions-
Omit "$20,000", substitute "200 penalty units". 

Subsection 32 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$20,000", substitute "200 penalty units". 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.xt.gov. 



94 Statute Law Revision (Penalties) No. . 1993 
SCHEDULE—continued 

Subsection 42 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$20,000", substitute "200 penalty units". 

Subsection 43 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$20,000", substitute "200 penalty units". 

Section 65 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$10,000". substitute "100 penalty units". 

Subsection 73 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$2,000", substitute "20 penalty units". 

Trading Stamps Act 1972 
Subsection 4 (1) (penalty provision)— 

Omit "One thousand dollars", substitute the following paragraphs: 

"(a) if the offender is a natural person—200 penalty units; 

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—1,000 penalty units". 

Section 5 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "One thousand dollars", substitute the following paragraphs: 

"(a) if the offender is a natural person—200 penalty units; 

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—1,000 penalty units". 

Section 6 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "One thousand dollars", substitute the following paragraphs: 

"(a) if the offender is a natural person—200 penalty units; 

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—1,000 penalty unite". 

Section 7 (penalty provision)— 

Omit "One thousand dollars", substitute the following paragraphs: 

"(a) if the offender is a natural person—200 penalty units; 

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—1,000 penalty units". 

Section 8 (penalty provision)— 

Omit "Five hundred dollars", substitute the following paragraphs: 

"(a) if the offender is a natural person—200 penalty units; 

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—1,000 penalty units". 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www 



Statute Law Revision (Penalties) No. , 1993 

SCHEDULE—continued 

Trespass on Territory Land Act 1932 

Section 4 (penalty provision)— 
Omit 'Twenty dollars", substitute "5 penalty units". 

Subsection 4A (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit'Twenty dollars", substitute "5 penalty units". 

Section 4B (penalty provision)— 
Omit 'Twenty dollars", substitute "5 penalty units". 

Section 5 (penalty provision)— 
Omit 'Twenty dollars", substitute "10 penalty units". 

Section 6 (penalty provision)— 
Omit 'Twenty dollars", substitute "5 penalty units". 

Section 7 (penalty provision)— 
Omit 'Twenty dollars", substitute "20 penalty units". 

Subsection 8A (2) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "Fifty dollars", substitute "5 penalty units". 

Subsection 8A (3) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "Fifty dollars", substitute "5 penalty units". 

Section 9 (penalty provision)— 
Omit 'Twenty dollars", substitute "5 penalty units". 

Unit Titles Act 1970 

Subsection 39 (4)— 
Omit "Four hundred dollars", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Subsection 41 (2)— 
Omit "Four hundred dollars", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Subsection 58 (3)— 
Omit 'Tour hundred dollars", substitute "20 penalty units". 

Section 106 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "Fifty dollars", substitute "5 penalty units". 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov. 



96 Statute Law Revision (Penalties) No. . 1993 

SCHEDULE—continued 

Veterinary Surgeons Registration Act 1965 

Section 17A (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$100", substitute "5 penalty units". 

Subsection 27A (2) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$100", substitute "5 penalty units". 

Section 29 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000", substitute "50 penalty units or imprisonment for 6 

months, or both". 

Section 30 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$250", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Section 31 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$500", substitute "30 penalty units". 

Water Pollution Act 1984 

Section 37— 
(a) Omit "punishable, on conviction, by a fine not exceeding $1,000 

or imprisonment for a period not exceeding 6 months". 
(b) Add at the end the following penalty provision: 

"Penalty. 

(a) if die offender is a natural person in breach of paragraph 
(a)—50 penalty units or imprisonment for 6 months, or 
both; 

(b) if the offender is a natural person in breach of paragraph 
(b)—50 penalty units; 

(c) if the offender is a body corporate—250 penalty units.". 

Paragraph 47 (c)— 
Omit "not exceeding $500 for offences against the regulations", 

substitute the following: 

"for offences against the regulations— 

(d) if the offender is a natural person—not exceeding 10 penalty units; 
or 

(e) if the offender is a body corporate—not exceeding 50 penalty 
units". 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov. 



Statute Law Revision (Penalties) No. , 1993 97 

SCHEDULE—continued 

Water Rates Act 1959 

Section 33 (penalty provision)— 
Omit 'Twenty dollars", substitute "50 penalty units or imprisonment for 

6 months, or both". 

Weapons Act 1991 

Section 14 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$2,000", substitute the following paragraphs: 

"(a) if the offender is a natural person—20 penalty units; 

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—100 penalty units". 

Section 16 (penalty provision)— 
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision: 

"Penalty: 
(a) if the offender is a natural person—200 penalty units or 

imprisonment for 2 years, or both; 

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—1,000 penalty units.". 

Section 17 (penalty provision)— 
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision: 

"Penalty: 
(a) if the offender is a natural person—50 penalty units or 

imprisonment for 6 months, or both; 
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—250 penalty units.". 

Section 18 (penalty provision)— 
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision: 

'Tenalty: 
(a) if the offender is a natural person—100 penalty unite or 

imprisonment for 12 months, or both; 
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—500 penalty units.". 

Section 19 (penalty provision)— 
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision: 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov. 



98 Statute Law Revision (Penalties) No. . 1993 
SCHEDULE—continued 

"Penalty: 

(a) if the offender is a natural person—100 penalty units or 
imprisonment for 12 months, or both; 

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—500 penalty units.". 

Section 32 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000", substitute "10 penalty units". 

Subsection 39 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$2,000", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Subsection 40 (3) (penalty provision)— 
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision: 

'Penalty: 

(a) if the offender is a natural person—50 penalty units or 
imprisonment for 6 months, or both; 

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—250 penalty units.". 

Subsection 40 (6)— 
Omit all the words after "punishable,", substitute the following: 

"on conviction— 

(a) if the offender is a natural person—by a fine not exceeding 20 
penalty units or by imprisonment for a term not exceeding 6 
months, or by both; or 

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—by a fine not exceeding 1,000 
penalty units". 

Section 41 (penalty provision)— 
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision: 

•Tenalty: 

(a) if the offender is a natural person—50 penalty units or 
imprisonment for 6 months, or both; 

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—250 penalty units." 

Subsection 42 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision: 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at vrow.legislation.act.gov.au 



Statute Law Revision (Penalties) No. . 1993 " 

SCHEDULE—continued 

"Penalty: 

(a) if the offender is a natural person—10 penalty units; 

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.". 

Section 43 (penalty provision)— 
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision: 

"Penalty: 
(a) if the offender is a natural person—50 penalty units or 

imprisonment for 6 months, or both; 

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—250 penalty units.". 

Subsection 44 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision: 

"Penalty: 

(a) if the offender is a natural person—50 penalty units or 
imprisonment for 6 months, or both; 

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—250 penalty units." 

Section 46 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000", substitute "10 penalty units". 

Subsection 47 (6)— 
Omit all the words after "punishable", substitute the following: 

"on conviction— 

(a) if the offender is a natural person—by a fine not exceeding 50 
penalty units or by imprisonment for a term not exceeding 6 
months, or both; or 

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—by a fine not exceeding 250 
penalty units". 

Subsection 50 (3)— 
Omit "$1,000", substitute "10 penalty units". 

Section 52 (penalty provision)— 
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision: 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov 



100 Statute Law Revision (Penalties) No. . 1993 

SCHEDULE—continued 

"Penalty: 

(a) if the offender is a natural person—50 penalty units or 
imprisonment for 6 months, or both; 

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—250 penalty units.". 

Subsection 53 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision: 

"Penalty: 

(a) if the offender is a natural person—50 penalty units or 
imprisonment for 6 months, or both; 

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—250 penalty units.". 

Subsection 53 (2) (penalty provision)— 
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision: 

"Penalty: 

(a) if the offender is a natural person—50 penalty units or 
imprisonment for 6 months, or both; 

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—250 penalty units.". 

Subsection 53 (3) (penalty provision)— 
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision: 

"Penalty: 

(a) if the offender is a natural person—50 penalty units or 
imprisonment for 6 months, or both; 

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—250 penalty units.". 

Subsection 53 (4) (penalty provision)— 
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision: 

"Penalty: 

(a) if the offender is a natural person—50 penalty units or 
imprisonment for 6 months, or both; 

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—250 penalty units.". 

Subsection 54 (4)— 
Omit all the words after "punishable,", substitute the following: 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov. 



Statute Law Revision (Penalties) No. . 1993 101 

SCHEDULE—continued 

"on conviction— 
(a) if the offender is a natural person—by a fine not exceeding 20 

penalty units; or 
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—by a fine not exceeding 100 

penalty units". 

Subsection 55 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision: 

"Penalty: 
(a) if the offender is a natural person—10 penalty units; 

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units". 

Subsection 58 (5)— 
Omit "$2,000" and "12 months", substitute "50 penalty units" and "6 

months" respectively. 

Subsection 66 (2) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000", substitute "10 penalty units". 

Subsection 67 (3)— 
Omit all the words after "punishable", substitute the following: 

"on conviction— 
(a) if the offender is a natural person—by a fine not exceeding 10 

penalty units; or 
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—by a fine not exceeding 50 

penalty units". 

Subsection 69 (4) (penalty provision)— 
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision: 

"Penalty: 
(a) if the offender is a natural person—50 penalty units or 

imprisonment for 6 months, or both; 

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—250 penalty units". 

Section 74— 
Omit the section. 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov. 



102 Statute Law Revision (Penalties) No. , 1993 

SCHEDULE—continued 

Section 75 (penalty provision)— 
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision: 

"Penalty: 

(a) if the offender is a natural person—50 penalty units or 
imprisonment for 6 months, or both; 

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—250 penalty units.". 

Section 76 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$5,000" and "2 years", substitute "100 penalty units" and "12 

months" respectively. 

Section 77 (penalty provision)— 
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision: 

"Penalty: 

(a) if the offender is a natural person—100 penalty units or 
imprisonment for 12 months, or both; 

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—500 penalty units". 

Section 78 (penalty provision)— 
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision: 

"Penalty: 

(a) if the offender is a natural person—50 penalty units or 
imprisonment for 6 months, or both; 

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—250 penalty units". 

Subsection 79 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000", substitute "10 penalty units". 

Subsection 79 (2) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$2,000", substitute "20 penalty units". 

Subsection 80 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit the penally provision, substitute die following penalty provision: 

'Penalty. 

(a) if the offender is a natural person—50 penalty units or 
imprisonment for 6 months, or both; 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au. 



Statute Law Revision (Penalties) No. . 1993 103 

SCHEDULE—continued 

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—250 penalty units". 

Subsection 80 (4) (penalty provision)— 
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision: 

"Penalty: 

(a) if the offender is a natural person—10 penalty units; 

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.". 

Section 81 (penalty provision)— 
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision: 

"Penalty: 

(a) if the offender is a natural person—100 penalty units or 
imprisonment for 12 months, or both; 

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—500 penalty units". 

Subsection 82 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision: 

"Penalty: 
(a) if the offender is a natural person—20 penalty units; 

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—100 penalty units.". 

Subsection 82 (2) (penalty provision)— 
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision: 

"Penalty: 

(a) if the offender is a natural person—20 penalty units; 

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—100 penalty units.". 

Subsection 83 (1)— 
Add at the end the following penalty provision: 

'Penalty: 

(a) if the offender is a natural person—50 penalty units or 
imprisonment for 6 months, or both; 

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—250 penalty units.". 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov. 



104 Statute Law Revision (Penalties) No. . 1993 

SCHEDULE—continued 

Subsection 83 (2)— 
Omit the subsection. 

Subsection 84 C D -
Add at the end the following penalty provision: 

"Penalty: 

(a) if the offender is a natural person—100 penalty units or 
imprisonment for 12 months, or both; 

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—500 penalty units.". 

Subsection 84 (2)— 
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision: 

"Penalty: 

(a) if the offender is a natural person—50 penalty units or 
imprisonment for 6 months, or both; 

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—250 penalty units.". 

Subsection 85 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$2,000" and "12 months", substitute "50 penalty units" and "6 

months" respectively. 

Section 86 (penalty provision)— 
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision: 

"Penalty: 

(a) if the offender is a natural person—50 penalty units or 
imprisonment for 6 months, or both; 

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—250 penalty units". 

Subsection 87 (2) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$5,000" and "2 years", substitute "50 penalty units" and "6 

months" respectively. 

Subsection 88 (2)— 
Omit all the words after "punishable,", substitute the following: 

"on conviction— 

(a) if the offender is a natural person—by a fine not exceeding 10 
penalty units; or 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov. 



Statute Law Revision (Penalties) No. , 1993 10: 
SCHEDULE—continued 

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—by a fine not exceeding 5 
penalty units". 

Section 89 (penalty provision)— 
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision: 

"Penalty: 
(a) if the offender is a natural person—50 penalty units < 

imprisonment for 6 months, or both; 

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—250 penalty units.". 

Subsection 90 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision: 

"Penalty: 

(a) if the offender is a natural person—10 penalty units; 

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—50 penalty units.". 

Subsection 91 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit the penalty provision, substitute the following penalty provision: 

"Penalty: 
(a) if the offender is a natural person—50 penalty units 

imprisonment for 6 months, or both; 

(b) if the offender is a body corporate—250 penalty units". 

Subsection 91 (4)— 
Omit all the words after "punishable,", substitute the following: 

"on conviction— 
(a) if the offender is a natural person—by a fine not exceeding 

penalty units; or 
(b) if the offender is a body corporate—by a fine not exceeding 2 

penalty units". 

Subparagraph 102 (2) (b) (i>— 
Omit "$1,000", substitute "10 penalty units". 

Subparagraph 102 (2) (b) ( I D -
Omit "$10,000", substitute "50 penalty units". 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.aov. 



106 Statute Law Revision (Penalties} No. , 1993 

SCHEDULE—continued 

Weights and Measures (Sale of Bread) Act 1929 

Section 21 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$5,000" and "$25,000", substitute "50 penalty units" and "250 

penalty units" respectively. 

Subsection 22 (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$5,000" and "$25,000". substitute "50 penalty units" and "250 

penalty units" respectively. 

Subsection 22 (4) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$5,000" and "$25,000", substitute "50 penalty units" and "250 

penalty units" respectively. 

Section 24 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$5,000" and "$25,000", substitute "50 penalty units" and "250 

penalty units" respectively. 

Section 34B (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$1,000" and "$5,000", substitute "10 penalty units" and "50 

penalty units" respectively. 

Subsection 34C (1) (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$5,000" and "$25,000", substitute "50 penalty units" and "250 

penalty units" respectively. 

Section 34D (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$5,000" and "$25,000", substitute "50 penalty units" and "250 

penalty units" respectively. 

Workers' Compensation Supplementation Fund Act 1980 

Section 24 (penalty provision)— 
Omit "$500", substitute "50 penalty units or imprisonment for 6 

months, or both". 

Printed by Authority of Lix Haley, ACT Government Printer 

O Australian Capital Territory 1993 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au 


		(02)+61 2 6205 3700
	2014-02-21T14:59:48+1100
	Canberra
	ACT Parliamentary Counsel
	Document is authorised




