1992

THE LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY
FOR THE AUSTRALIAN CAPITAL TERRITORY

(As presented)

(Attorney-General)

Statute Law Revision (Miscellaneous
Provisions) Bill (Neo. 2) 1992

A BILL
FOR

An Act to revise the statute law of the Territory

The Legislative Assembly for the Australian Capital Territory enacts as
follows: _ v . :

Short title

1. This Act may be cited as the Statute Law Revision (Miscellaneous
5 . Provisions) Act (No. 2) 1992.

Amendments of Acts

2. The Acts specified in Schedule 1 are amended as set out in that
Schedule.

Repeals .
10 3. The Acts specified in Schedule 2 are repealed.

82090 1992/54 (T90/92)

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au




2 Statute Law Revision (Miscellaneous Provisions) (No.2) No. , 1992
SCHEDULE 1 . Sectien 2

AMENDMENTS OF ACTS
Agents Act 1968

Subsection 5 (1) (definition of “trade union’)—
Omit the definition, substitute the following definition:

@ «

trade union’ has the same meaning as in the Industrial Relations Act
1988 of the Commonwealth;”. : :

Subsection § (1A)— : ‘
Ommit “the next succeeding subsection”, substitute “subsection (1B)”.

Paragraph 5D (1) (b)—
Omit “one”, substitute “1”.

Subse-ction 5F (2)—

Omit “Crimes Act, 1900 of the State of New South Wales in its
application to the Territory”, substitute “Crimes Act 1900”.

Subsection 6 (3)—
Omit “one”, substitute “1”,
Subsection 6 (4)—
~ Omit “of this section”.
Paragraph 9 (1) (b)—
Omit “one”, substitute “1”,
Subsection 9 (3)—
(a) Omit “three”, substitute “3”.
(b) Omit “his”.
Subsections 10 (2) and (3)—
(a) Omit “Chairman” (wherever occurring), substitute “Chairperson”.
" (b) Omit“one”, substitute “1”, '

Paragraph 13 (c)—
Omit “one”, substitute “1”.

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www legislation.act.gov.au




Statute Law Revision (Miscellaneous Provisions) (No.2)  No. , 1992 3
SCHEDULE 1—continued
Paragraph 13 (d)—
(a) Omit “Chairman”, substitute “Chairperson”.
(b) Omit “three”, substitute “3”. '
Section 14—
Repeal the section, substitute the following section:

Resignation of member

“14. A member may resign office in writing s1gned by the member
addressed to the Minister.”.

Section 15—
Add at the end the following subsection:

“(3) Anything done by, or in relation to, a person purporting to act
under this section is not invalid on the ground that—

(a) the occasion for the person’s appointment had not arisen;

(b) there is a defect or irregularity in conncctlon with the person’s
appointment; or

(c) the person’s appointment has ceased to have effect.”.
Subsection 16 (1)—

(a) Omit “six”, substitute “6”.

(b) Omit “two”, substitute “2”.
Subsection 16 (3)—

(a) Omit “Chairman”, substitute “Chairperson”. '

(b) Insert “or she” after “he”. ;
Subsection 16 (5)—

(a) Omit “Chairman” (wherever occurring), substitute “Chairperson”.

(b) Omit “two”, substitute “2”.
Section 21—

Omit “three”, substitute “3”,
Section 22—

Omit “the last preceding section”, substitute “section 21”.

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au




4 Statute Law Revision (Miscellaneous Provisions) (No.2)  No. , 1992
SCHEDULE 1—continued
Subsection 26 (1)—
" Omit the subsection, substitute the following subsection:
“(1) A person who applies, after the prescribed date, for registration as

a real estate agent has the required qualifications for registration as a real
estate agent if the person— .

(a) has attained the age of 18 years;
(b) is of good fame and character;

~ (c) holds the educational qualifications required by the regulations to
be held by an applicant for registration as a real estate agent;

(d) has been employed by a person, partnership, firm or company
carrying on business either within or outside the Territory as a real
estate agent for a period of, or for periods that aggregate, not less
than 3 years; and

(¢) has—

(i) an adequate knowledge of the duties, obligations and rights
of a real estate agent; and

(i) gained, in the employment referred to in paragraph (d),
adequate pracncal experience relevant to the busmcss of a
real estate agent.”.

‘Subsection 27 (1)—

Onmnit “of this subsection”.

Paragraph 27 (2) (a)—
Ornit “three”, substitute “3”.
Paragraph 27 (2) (b)—
(a) Insert “or she” after “he”.
(b) Omit “three”, substitute “3”.

~Subsection 27 (2)—

Omnit “three” (last occurring), substitute “3”.

Subsection 27 (4)—
Omnit “one”, substitute “1”.

Subsection 30 (1)—
Omit the subsection, substitute the following subsection:

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel~also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au




Statute Law Revision (Miscellaneous Provisions) (No. 2 ) No. , 1992 5

SCHEDULE 1—continued
“(1) A person who applies, after the prescribed date, for registration as

a stock and station agent has the required quahﬁcanons for rcglstrauon asa
stock and station agent if the person—

(a) has attained the age of 18 years;
(b) is of good fame and character;

(¢) holds the educational quahﬁcatlons required by the regulauons to
be held by an applicant for registration as a stock and station agent;

(d) has been employed by a person, partnership, firm or company
carrying on business either within or outside the Territory as a
stock and station agent for a period of, or for periods that
aggregate, not less than 3 years; and

() has—

(i) an adequate knowledge of the duties, obligations and rights
of a stock and station agent; and :

(ii) gained, in the employmént referred to in paragraph (d),
adequate practical experience relevant to the business of a
stock and station agent.”.

Subsection 31 (1)—

(a) Omit “application”, substitute “applicant”.
(b) Omit “of this subsection”.

Paragraph 31 (2) (a)—

Omit “three”, substitute “3”.

Paragraph 31 (2) (b)—

(a) Insert “or she” after “he”.
(b) Omit “three”, substitute “3”.

Subsection 31 (2)—

Omit “three” (last occurring), substitute “3”,

Subsection 31 (4)—

Omit “one”, substitute “1”.

| Subsection 34 (1)—

Omit the subsection, substitute the following subsection:

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-alsa accessible at www.legislation.act gov.au




6 Statute Law Revision (Miscellaneous Provisions) (No.2)  No. 1992

SCHEDULE 1—continued

(1) A person who applies, after the prescribed date, for registration as
a business agent has the required qualifications for registration as a business
agent if the person— .

(a) has attained the age of 18 years;
(b) is of good fame and character;

(¢) holds the educational qualifications required by the regulations to
be held by an applicant for registration as a business agent;

(d) has been employed by a person, partnership, firm or company
carrying on business either within or outside the Territory as a
business agent for a period of, or for periods that aggregate, not
less than 3 years; and

(¢) has—

() an adequate knowledge of the duties, obligations and rights
of a business agent; and

. (ii) gained, in the employment referred to in paragraph (d),
adequate practical experience relevant to the business of a
business agent.”. :

Subsection 35 (1)—
Omit “of this subsection”.

Paragraphs 35 (2) (a) and (b)—

Omit “three”, substitute “3”.
Subsection 35 (2)—

Omit “three” (last occurring), substitute “3”.
Paragraph 36 (b)— '

(a) Omit “seven”, substitute “7”.

(b) Omit “fourteen”, substitute “14”.
Subparagraph 36 (b) (i)—

(a) Insert “or she” after “he”.

(b) Omit “his”, substitute “the applicant’s”.
Subparagraph 36 (b) (ii)—

(a) Insert “or she” after “he” (wherever occurring).

(b) Omit “his full name, the date and place of his birth, his”, substitute
“the applicant’s full name, date and place of birth,”.

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legistation.act.gov.au




Statute Law Revision (Miscellaneous Provisions) (No.2)  No. 1992 7
SCHEDULE 1—continued
= (e) Omit “three”, substitute “3”.
Paragraph 36 (c)— '
Omit “the last preceding paragraph”, substitute “paragraph (b)”.
Paragraph 36 (f)— ‘ ’
Omit “two”, substitute “2”. B
Subsection 37 (1)— |
(a) Omit “twenty-one”, substitute “21”.
(b) Insert “or her” after “him”.
Subsection 37 (2)—
Omit “fourteen”, substitute “14”.

Subsection 38 (1)—
Omit “, subject to section 23 of this Act,”.

Paragraph 38 (1) (b)—
Omit “, subject to this section,”.
Subsection 38 (2)—
Omit “him”, substitute “the applicant”.
Subsection 38 (3)— _
Omit “the next succeeding subsection”, substitute “subsection (4)”.

Paragraph 38 (3) (a)—
Omit “the last preceding subsection”, substitute “subsection (2)”.

Paragraph 38 (3) (¢)—
Omit “of this Act”.
Subsection 38 (4)—

Omit “(c) of subsection (3) of section 37 of this Act”, substitute “37 (3)
( c)n. .

Section 39—
Omit *“‘of this Act”.

Paragraph 40 (b)—
Omit “seven”, substitute “7”.

80

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au




8 Statute Law Revision (Miscellaneous Provisions) (No.2)  No. , 1992
. SCHEDULE 1—continued
Paragraph 42 (a)— :
Omit “he”, substitute “the person”.
Paragraph 42 (b)—
(a) Omit “his” (first and second occurring), substitute “the person’s”.
(b) Insert “or she” after “he”. |
(c¢) Insert “or her” after “his” (last occurring). a
Paragraph 43 (1) (b)—
(a) Omit*“one”, subsntute “1”.
(b) Omit “his” (first occurrmg) substitute “that director’s”.
(¢) Insert “or she” after “he”.
(d) Insert “or her” after “his” (last occurring).
Paragraph 44 (a)—
Omit “he”, substitute “the person”.
Paragraph 44 (b)—
(a) Omit “his” (first and second occurring), substitute “the person’s”.
(b) Insert “or she” after “he”.
(c¢) Insert “or her” after “his” (last occurring).
Paragraph 45 (1) (b)—
(a) Omit “one”, substitute “1”.
(b) Omit “his” (first occurring), substitute “that director’s”.
(c) Insert “or she” after “he”.
(d) Insert “or her” after “his” (last occurring).
Paragraph 47 (1) (b)—
(a) Omit “one”, substitute “1”.
(b) Omit “his” (first occurring), substitute “that director’s”.
(c) Insert “or she” after “he”.
(d) ‘Insert “or her” after “his” (last occurring).

Section 47D—
Omit “one”, substitute “1”.

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au




Statute Law Revision (Miscellaneous Provisions) (No. 2) - No. . , 1992 9

SCHEDULE l—con_tinued

Subsections 47E (1) and (3)—

Omit “one”, substitute “1”.
Subsection 47E (4)— o

Omit “, (3) or (4)”, substitute “or (3)”.
Section 47F— '

Omit “one”, substitute “1”.
Paragraph 47G (1) (a)—

Omit “one”, substitute “1”.

Subsection 47G (2)—

Omit “Crimes Act, 1900 of the State of New South Wales in its
application to the Territory”, substitute “Crimes Act I 900.

Section 47H—
Omit “one”, substitute “1”.

Paragraph 48 (1) (d)—
~ Omit “one”, substitute “1”.
Paragraph 49 (1) (e)—
(a) Omit “seven”, substitute “7”.
(b) Omit “fourteen”, substitute “14”,
Subparagraph 49 (1) (e) (ii)—
Omit “three”, substitute “3”.

Paragraph 49 (1) (H—
Omit “the last preceding paragraph”, subsututc “paragraph (e)

Paragraph 49 (1) (g)—
Omit “two”, substitute “2”.

Paragraph 49 (1) (h)—
Omit “one”, substitute “1”.

Subsection 49 (2)—
(a) Omit “the last preceding subsection”, substitute “subsection (1)”.

(b) Omit “not one”, substitute “none”.

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legisiation.act.gov.au




10  Statute Law Revision (Miscellaneous Provisions) (No.2) No. . , 1992

SCHEDULE 1—continued
(c) Omit “one” (last occurring), substitute “1”,

Subsection 50 (1)—

(a) Omit “fourteen”, substitute “14”.

(b) Insert “or her” after “him”

(¢) Omit “under his hand”, substitute “signed by him or her”.
Paragraph 51 (3) (b)—

Insert “, she” after “he”.
Paragraph 51 (3) (¢)—

Omit *, of this Act”.

Paragraph 51 (4) (b)—
Omit “seven”, substitute “7”.

Section 52—
Omit “of this Act”.
Subsection 54 (1)— ‘
(a) Omit “two”, substitute “2”.
(b) Omit “of this Act™.
(¢) Omit “under his hand”, substitute “signed by him or her”.
(d) Omit “one”, substitute “1”.

(e) Omit “on his own behalf busmcss substitute “busmess, on his or
- her own behalf,”. :

Subsection 54 (4)—
(a) Omit “fourteen”, substitute “14”.
(b) Insert “or her” after “him”.
(¢) Omit “under his hand”, substitute “mgncd by him or her”
(d) Insert “or her” after “his” (last occurring).
Subsection 55 (1)—
(a) Insert “or her” after “his”.
(b) Insert “or she” after “he”.

Paragraph 56 (1) (a)—
(a) Insert “or she” after “he” (first occurring).

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au




Statute Law Revision (Miscellaneous Provisions) (No.2) No. , 1992 11
SCHEDULE 1—continued
(b) Omit “he” (last occurring), substitute “the agent”
Subsection 56 (2)— :
(a) Omit “The last preceding subsection”, substitute “Subsection (1)”.
- (b) Omit “two”, substitute “2”, ‘
(¢) Omit “(a) and (b) of that subsection”, substitute “(1) (a) and (b)”.
Subsection 56 (3)—
(a) Omit “forty-eight” (wherever occurring), substitute “48”.
(b) Omit “him”, substitute “the licensed agent”.
(¢) Insert “or she” after “he”.

(d) Omit “in pursuance of the last preceding subsection”, substitute
“under subsection (1)”.

Subsection 58 (1)—
Omit “the next succeeding subsection”, substitute “subsection (2)”.

Subsection 58 (2)—
Omit “the last preceding subsection”, substitute “subsection (1)”.

Subsection 59 (2)—
(a) Omit “the last preceding subsection”, substitute “subsection (1)”.
(b) Omit “(2) of section 57 of this Act”, substitute “57 (2)”.
Subsection 60 (1)—
(a) Omit “him” (wherever occurnng), substltutc “the licensed agent”.
(b) Insert “or she” after “he” (wherever occurring).
Subparagraph 60 (2) (a) (iH)—
(a) Insert “or she” after “he”.
(b) Omit “one”, substitute “1”.
(¢) Insert “or her” after “his”.

Paragraph 60 (2) (c)—

Omit “six years that commences on the thlmeth day of”, substitute “6
years commencing on 30”. A

Subsection 60 (3)—
. (a) Omit “of this section”.

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au




12 Statute Law Revision (Miscellaneous Provisions) (No. 2) No. ,1992

SCHEDULE 1——continued
(b) Omit “seven”, substitute “7”. S

(c) Omit “him”, substitute “the licensed agent”.
(d) Insert “or she” after “he”. -

Subsection 61 (2)—
Omit “the last preceding subsection”, substitute “subsection (1)”.

Subsection 61 (3)—
Omit “fifty”, substitute “50”.

Subsection 61 (5)—

Omit “The last three preceding subsections”, substitute “Subsections
(2), (3) and (4)™.

Section 62—
(a) Omit “twelve” (wherever occurring), substitute “12”.
(b) Omit “the thirtieth day of June”, substitute “30 June”.
Subsection 63 (1)—
(a) Omit “three”, substitute “3”.
(b) Insert “or her” after “his”.
(c¢) Insert “or her” after “him”.
Subsection 64 (1)—
Insert “or her” after “his” (wherever occurring).
Paragraph 64 (1) (e)—
Omit “himself”.
Subsection 66 (2)—
Insert “or her” after “his” (first occurring).
Paragraph 66 (2) (a)—
(a) Omit “his”, substitute “the auditor’s”.
(b) Insert “or her” after “him”.
Subsection 67 (1)—
Omit the subsection, substitute the following subsection:

“(1) In this section—

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au




Statute Law Revision (Miscellaneous Provisions) (No.2)  No. , 1992 13

SCHEDULE 1—continued

‘quarter’, in relation to a licensed agent, means each period of 3 months
ending on 30 September, 31 December, 31 March and 30 June,
or, if the prescribed period applicable in relation to the agent ends
on a day other than 30 June, each successive period of 3 months
after the commencement of that prescribed period.”.

Subsection 67 (2)—
Omit “ twenty-one”, substitute “21”.

Subsection 67 (3)—
Omit “thc last precedmg subsectlon substitute “subsccuon 2).

Subsection 67 (4)—

Omit “three”, substitute “3”.

Section 68— :
(a) Omit “he” (second occurring), substitute “the auditor”.
(b) Omit “twenty-one”, substitute “21”.

(¢) Insert “or her” after “his”.

Subsection 70 (1)—

(a) Omit “him” (first occurring), substitute “the agent”.
(b) Insert “or her” after “his”.
(¢) Insert “or her” after “him” (last occurring).

Subsection 70 (2)—

Omit “the last preceding subsection”, substitute “subscctlon (1)”.

Subsection 70 (3)—-
Omit “the last preceding subsection”, substitute “subsection (2)”.

Subsection 70 (4)—
Omit “of this section”.
Subsection 70 (6)—
(a) Insert “or she” after “he”.
(b) Omit “of this section”.
Subsection 71 (2)—
(a) Insert “or she” after “he”.
(b) Insert “or her” after “his”.

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au




14 Siatute Law Revision (Miscellaneous Provisions) (No.2)  No.  , 1992

SCHEDULE l—continued
Subsection 71 (3)— S _
Omiit “the last preceding subsection”, substitute “subsection (2)”. -

Paragraph 71L (3) (e)—
Omiit “one”, substitute “1”.

Paragraph 72 (1) (a)—
Omiit “of this Act”.

Paragraph 72 (1) (d)— :
(a) Omit “his” (first occurring), substitute “the licensed agent’s”.
(b) Insert “or her” after “his” (second and last occurring).

Paragraph 72 (1) (f)—

(a) Insert “or her” after “his”.
(b) Insert “or she” after “he”.
Paragraph 72 (1) (g)—
(a) Insert “or her” after “his”.
(b) Omit “him”, substitute “the licensed agent™. .
(c) Insert “or she” after “he”.
Paragraph 72 (1) (i)—
(a) Insert “or she” after “he”.
(b) Insert “or her” after “him”.

Paragraph 72 (1) (D)—

(a) Insert “or her” after “his” (wherever occurring).
(b) Omit “him”, substitute “the licensed agent”.
(c) Omit “he”, substitute “the licensed agent”.

Paragraph 73 (2) (a)— S
(a) Insert “or her” after “his” (first and second occurring).
(b) Onmit “his” (last occurring), substitute “that”.

Paragraph 73 (2) (¢)—

(a) Insert “or her” after “his” (wherever occurring).
(b) Insert “or she” after “he”.

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au




Statute Law Revision (Miscellaneous Provisions) (No.2) No. ,1992 15

SCHEDULE 1—continued
Paragraphs 73 (2) (d) and (e)— :
(a) Insert *“or her” after “his” (whereve: occurring).

(b) Insert “or her” after “him”.

Paragraph 73 (2) (f)—

(a) Insert “or her” after “his”.
(b) Insert “or she” after “he”.

Subsection 73 (3)— : ‘
(a)  Omit “the last preceding subsecnon subsntute “subsection (2)”.
(b) Insert “or her” after “his”,

- (c¢) Insert “or she” after “he”. .
Subsection 74 (1)—
(a) Insert “or her” after “him”.
(b) Omit “Chairman of the Board”, substitute “Chairperson”.
(c) Omit “Chairman”, substitute “Chalrperson

Subsection 74 (2)— : »
(a) Omit “the last preccdmg subsectlon” ‘substitute “subsecuon (1)”.
(b) Omit “Chairman”, substxtute “Chairperson”.

Subsection 74 (3)— ' S
(a) Omit “him” (first occurring), substitute “the agent”.

(b) Omit “him” (last occurring), substitute “the Registrar”.

(c) Omit “Chairman of the Board”, substitute “Chairperson”.
Subsection 75 (1)— :

Omit “one”, substitute “1”.

~ Subsection 76 (1)—

(a) Insert “or her” after “his”. . -

(b) Omit “one”, substitute “1”.

Subsection 76 (2)— o
(a) Omit “the next succeeding subsection”, subsututc ‘subsection

(3)”
(b) Insert “or her” after “his” (first and second occurrmg)

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au




16  Statute Law Revision (Miscellaneous Provisions) (No.2) No. , 1992

SCHEDULE 1—continued
Paragraph 76 (2) (a)—
(a) Omit “the last preceding subsection”, substitute “subsecuon (1)”
(b) Omit “one”, substitute “1”.

(c) Omit “the last preceding Part”, substltute “secuon 74",
(d) Insert “or she” after “he”.

Paragraph 76 (2) (b)—
Omit the paragraph, substitute the following paragraph:

“(b) the Registrar has, before the date of the delivery by a registered
agent or licensed agent of a notice under subsection (1), given, or
gives, within the period of 1 month referred to in subsection (1),
notice under subsection 77 (2) to the registered agent or the
licensed agent calling on the registered agent or licensed agent to
show cause why the registration or licence, or both, should not be
revoked.”.

Paragraph 76 (3) (a)—

Omit “(a) of the last preceding subsection”, subsutute “2) (a)”.
Subparagraph 77 (1) (¢) (i)—
Omit “one”, substitute “1”.
Subsection 78 (1)—
(a) Omit “one”, substitute “1”,
(b) Insert “or she” after “he”.

Paragraph 78 (1) (a)—
(a) Omit “the next succeeding subsection”, substxtute ‘subsection

(2)”
(b) Omit “twenty-one”, substitute “21”.
Paragraph 78 (1) (b)—
Omit “of this section”.
Paragraph 78 (2) (a)—
Omit “three”, substitute “3”.

Paragraph 78 (2) (b)—
- Omit “two”, substitute “2”.

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au




Stdtute Law Revision (Miscellaneous Provisions) (No.2)  No. 1992 17

SCHEDULE 1-—continued
Subsection 78 (3)—
(a) Insert “or her” after “him”.

(b) Omit “the last preceding subsection™, substitute “subsection (2)”.
Subsection 78 (4)— N '
Omit “twenty-one”, substitute “21”.

Section 79—
Repeal the section, substitute the following section:

Agent may give notice of intention to show cause against
revocation

“79. The registered agent or licensed agent to whom a notice is given
under section 77 or 78 may, within 21 days after the date on which the
notice is served on him or her, lodge with the Registrar a notice in writing
stating that the agent intends to show cause why his or her registration or the
licence issued to him or her should not be revoked.”.

Section 80—

(a) Omit “twenty-one”, substitute “21”.

(b) Insert “or her” after “him”.

(¢) Insert “or her” after “his”.

(d) Insert “or she” after “he”.
Subsection 81 (1)—

(a) Insert “, she” after “he”.

(b) Insert “or her” after “his”.
Subsection 81 2)—

(a) Insert “or her” after “his”.

(b) Omit “or licence” (first occurring), substitute “or the licence”.

(c) Insert*, her” after “him”.
Subsection 81 (3)—

Omit “him or to it”, substitute “the agent”.
Subsection 84 (1)—

(a) Omit “him”, substitute “the agent”.

(b) Insert “or her” after “his”.

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legistation.act.gov.au




18 Statute Law Revision (Miscellaneous Provisions) (No.2) No. , 1992

SCHEDULE 1—continued
Subsection 89 (1)— Ea
(a) Omit “Chairman” (wherever occurring), substitute “Chairperson”.

(b) Omit “by writing undcr his hand”, substitute “in wntmg mgned by
himorher”. .

- (e¢) Omit “his” (last occurring), substitute “the person’s”.
~ (d) Insert “or she” after “he”.
Paragraph 89 (2) (b)—
(a) Insert “or her” after “his”.
(b) Omit “Chairman” (wherever occumng) subsutute “Chalrperson

Paragraph 89 (2) (¢)—
Omit “sixteen”, substitute “16”.

Section 90—
Repeal the section.

Subsection 91 (1)—
(a) Omit “his”, substitute “the person’s”.
(b) Insert “or she” after “he”.

Subsection 93 (1)—
Omiit “the next succeeding subsection”, substitute “subsection (2)”.

Subsection 93 (2)—
(a) Omit “the last preceding subsection”, substltute “subsecuon (l)”
(b) Omit “him”, substitute “the witness”. ‘
"~ (¢) Omit “Chairman”, substitute “Chairperson”.
Subsection 93 (3)— '
Omit “of this section”.
Subsection 93 (4)—
(a) Insert “or she” after “he”.
(b) Omit “of this section”.
Subsection 93 (5)— :
(a) Ormt “the last prcccdmg subsectlon subsututc “subsecuon 4)”.

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au




Statute Law Revision (Miscellaneous Provisions) (No.2) No. , 1992
SCHEDULE 1—continued

19

(b) Omit “by writing under his hand”, substitute *“in writing signed by

him or her”,

Subsection 93 (6)—
(a) Omit “of this section” (wherever occumng)

(b) Insert “or her” after “him”.

(¢) Omit “by writing under his hand”, substitute “in writing signed by

him or her”.
Subsection 93 (7)—
Omit “of this section”.
Subparagraph 93 (8) (b) (i)—
~ Omit “of this section”.
Paragraphs 93 (9) (a) and (b) and (10) (a) and (b)—
Omit “of this section™.
Subsection 93 (11)—
(a) Insert “or her” after “him”.
(b) Omit “of this section”.
Subsection 93 (13)—
(a) Omit “of this section”.
(b) Omit “Chairman”, substitute “Chairperson”.
(c¢) Insert “or she” after “he”.
Subsection 94 (1)—
(a) Omit “(1)”.
(b) Insert “or her” after “his”.

Subsection 96 (2)—
Omit “the last preceding subsection”, substitute “subsection (1)”.

Section 102—
(a) Insert‘“or her” after “his”.

(b) Insert “or herself” after “himself”.

Subsections 103 (2), 104 (2) and 105 (2)—

(a) Onmit “the last preceding subsection”, substitute “subsection (1)”.

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legistation.act.gov.au




20  Statute Law Revision (Miscellaneous Provisions) (No.2) ~ No. 1992

_ SCHEDULE 1—continued
- (b) Insert “or her” after “his” (last occurring).

(c) Omit “he”, substitute “the person™.

(d) Omit “(a)” and “(b)” (last occurrmg), substltutc “(c)” and “(d)” |
(respectively).

Section 111— :

(a) Insert “or her” after “his” (wherever occurrmg)

(b) Omit “fourteen”, substitute “14”,
Sectiom 112—

(a) Insert “or her” after “his”.

(b) Onmit “he” (first occurring), substitute “the licensed agent”.

- (¢) Insert “or she” after “he” (second and last occurring). '

Subsection 113 (2)— ' ‘ :

(a) Omit “the last preceding subsection”, substitute “subsection (1)”.

(b) Insert “or she™ after “he”. ’ S
Section 115— | |

Repeal the section, substitute the following section:

Notices to be displayed

“115. (1) A licensed agent shall exhibit and keep exhibited at the place
or each place specified in his or her licence as a place at which the licensed
agent is authorised to carry on business as a licensed agent, a notice
stating—

(a) his or her name;
(b) that he or she is licensed as an agent; and

(c) if the licensed agent carries on business in a name other than his or
her own name—the name or style under which the licensed agent
carries on business as an agent.

“(2) A notice under subsection (1) shall be exhibited—
(a) in a prominent place; and
(b) soas to be easily read from outside that place of business.”.

Subsection 118 (1)—
(a) Omit “his”, substitute “the agent’s”

(b) Insert “or she” after “he”.

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act gov.au




- Statute Law Revision (Miscellaneous Provisions) (No.2) No. ,1992 21

SCHEDULE l—contmucd
Further amendments—
1. The following provisions are amended by inserting “or her” after
“his” (wherever occurring):

Paragraph 3 (1) (c), subsection 9 (5), paragraphs 13 (a) 27 (1) (b), 31
A ®),35Q) (b) 48 (1) () and 51 (3) (d), subsection 54 (2), paragraph
64 (1) (d), section 65, paragraph 66 (2) (b), subsection 67 (5), paragraphs
72 (1) (e) and (h) and 73 (2) (b) and (h), subsection 76 (3), paragraph 84
(2) (a), subsection 101 (1), paragraphs 103 (2) (a) and (b), 104 (2) (a) and
(b) and 105 (2) (a) and (b), sections 106 and 109 and subsection 118 (2).

2 The following provisions are amended by msertmg ‘or she after
e” (wherever occurring):

Subsection 6 (2), paragraph 38 (3) (b), subparagraph 60 (2) (a) (i),
subsection 61 (1), paragraphs 68 (a) and 72 (1) (c), (j) and (m), subsections
103 (1), 104 (1), 105 (1) and 113 (1) and section 114.

3. The following provisions are amended by inserting “or her” after
“him” (wherever occurring):

Paragraphs 40 (c) and 51 (4) (c) and subsecuons 57 (1), (2) and (3), 92
(1) and 93 (12).

4. The following provisions are amended by omitting “Chairman”
(wherever occurring) and substituting “Chairperson’:

Subsections 5 (1) (definitions of “Chairman”, “Deputy Chairman” and
“member”), 10 (1), 16 (2) and (4), 88 (2) and 96 (1), paragraph 96 (2) (a)
and section 119.

Architgcts Act 1959

Section 4 (definitions of “thé Board”, “the Chairman” and “the
Register”)—
Omit the definitions.

Section 4—
Insert the following definitions:
“ ‘Board’ means the Architects Board constituted under this Act;
‘Chairperson’ means the Chairperson of the Board,;
‘Deputy Chairperson’ means a person elected under subsection 6 (5);

‘Register’ means the Register of Architects kept in accordance with
section 14;”.

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au

e




722 Statute Law Revision (Miscellaneous Provisions) (No.2)  No. , 1992

SCHEDULE 1—continued
Subsection 6 (1)—
Omit “five”, substitute “5”".
Subsection 6 (2)—
(a) Omit “one”, substitute “1”.
(b) Omit “Chairman”, substitute “Chairperson”.
Paragraph 6 (3) (b)— -
Omit “two”, substitute “2”.
Subsection 6 (5)— o
(a) Omit “one”, substitute “1”. )
(b) Omit “Chairman of the Board”, substitute “Chairperson”.

Subsection 12 (1)—
(a) Omit “the next succeeding subsection”, substitute “subsection

(2)’9.
(b) Omit “Chairman”, substitute “Chairperson”.
Subsection 13 (1)—
(a) Omit “Chairman of the Board”, substitute “Chairperson”.
(b) Insert “or she” after “he”.
Subsection 13 (3)— v
(a) Omit “Chairman” (wherever occurring), substitute “Chairpcrson”.
(b) Omit “two”, substitute “2”.
Subsection 15 (3)— .
(a) Omit “him”, substitute “the person”.

(b) Omit “Chairman or Deputy Chairman of the Board”, substitute
“Chairperson or Deputy Chairperson”.

Paragraph 16 (1) (a)—
Omit “1953”, substitute “1991”.

Subsection 16 (2)—
Insert “or she” after “he”.

Subsection 18 (2)—
(a) Omit “Chairman” (wherever occurring), substitute “Chairperson”.

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au




Statute Law Revision (Miscellaneous Provisions) (No.2). - No. ,1992 23

SCHEDULE 1—continued
(b) Omit “of the Board™.

(c) Onmit “the last precedmg subsection”, substitute “subsccnon .

Paragraph 18A (3) (a)— -
Omit “the first day of March”, substitute “1 March”. -

Subsection 18A (4)— .
Omit “the first day of March”, substitute “1 March”.

Section 19, penalty at foot—
Omit “Two hundred dollars”, substitute “$200”.

Subsections 20 (1) and (2)—
(a) Insert “or her” after “his”.
(b) Omit “seven”, substitute “7”.
(¢) Omit “Chairman”, substitute “Chairperson”.
Section 20, penalty at foot— ‘
Omit “One hundred dollars”, substitute “$100”.
Subsection 21 (2)— . '
(a) Omit “him”, substitute “the architect™.
(b) Insert “or her” after “his” (wherever occurring).
(¢) Omit “one”, substitute “1”.
Subsection 21 (3)— :
(a) Omit “the last preceding subsecnon substltute “subsection (2)”.
(b) Omit “six”, substitute “6”

Paragraph 22 (1) (c)—
Omit “him”, substitute “the person”.

Subsection 22 (2)—
Omit “six”, substitute “6”.

Subsection 23 (1)—
~ Omit “the last preceding section”, substitute “section 22”.

Subsection 24 (1)—
Omit “one”, substitute “1”,

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www legislation.act.gov.au




24  Siatute Law Revision (Miscellaneous Provisions) (No.2) No. , 1992

SCHEDULE 1—continued
Subsection 25 (4)—
(a) Omit “his” (first occurring), substitute “thc”

(b) Omit “him” (wherever occurring), substitute “the appellant" B
(c) Insert “or her” after “his” (last occurring). '
Section 29—
Omit “two”, substitute “2”.
Paragraph 31 (2) (¢)— .
(a) Omit “Chairman” (wherever occurring), substnutc “Chalrpcrson
(b) Omit “sixteen”, substitute “16”.

Section 33—
Repeal the section.

Subsection 34 (1)—
(a) Onmit “his”, substitute “the person’s”.
(b) Insert “or she” after “he”.

Subsection 34 (1), penalty at foot— v
Omit “One hundred dollars”, substitute “$100”.

Subsection 35 (1)—
Insert “or her” after “him”.

Subsection 35 (1), penalty at foot— v
Omit “One hundred dollars”, substitute “$100”.

Subsection 35 (2)—
Omit “him”, substitute “the w1tness”

Section 38, penalty at the foot—
Omit “one”, substitute “1”.

Paragraph 40 (b)—
Omit “Forty dollars”, substitute “$40”.

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au




Statute Law Revision (Miscellaneous Provisions) (No.2) - No. ,1992 25

SCHEDULE 1—continued
Further amendments—

The following provisions are amended by omitting “Chairman”, and
substituting “‘Chairperson” (wherever occurring):

Subsections 6 (6), 13 (2), 15 (2) and 31 (1), paragraph 31 (2) (b),
subsection 37 (1) and paragraph 37 (2) (a).

Artificial Conception Act 1985

Subsection 4 (3)—

Omit “sections 9, 33, 42 and 43 of the Adoption of Children Act 1965”,
substitute “sections 8, 43, 54 and 55 of the Adoption Act 1992”.

Associations Incorporation Act 1991
Section 32—
Omit “140”, substitute “141”.
Paragraph 32 (a)—
(a) Omit “the Schedule” (first occurring), substitute “Schedule 1.
(b) Omit “the Schedule” (last occurring), substitute “that Schedule”.

Auctioneers Act 1959

Subsection 3 (1) (definition of “the Commissioner of
Police”)—

Omit thc definition.

Subsection 4 (1)—
(a) Omit “the ncxt succeeding subsection”, subsntute ‘subsection

(2)”
( b) Omit “he”, substitute “the person”.

Subsection 4 (1), penalty at foot—
Omit “Four hundred dollars”, substitute “$400”.

Subsection 4 (2)—
Omit “the last preceding subsection”, subsututc “subsection (1)".

Paragraph 4 (2) (d)—
Omit “-1937”.

Subsection 5 (1)— :
Omit “eighteen”, substitute “18”,

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au




26  Statute Law Revision (Miscellaneous Provisions) (No.2) . No. 1992
SCHEDULE 1-—continued
Subsection 6 (1)— o :
Omit “the next succeeding section”, subsututc “secuon A
 Paragraph 6 (1) (a)—
- Omit “twenty-one”, substitute “21”.
Paragraph 6 (2) (a)—
(a) Omit “twenty-four”, substitute “24”. v
(b) Omit “(b) of the last preceding subsection”, subsututc “O ®)”.
Paragraph 6 (2) (b)—
(a) Omit “fourteen”, substitute “14”.
(b) Insert “or her” after “his”.
- Paragraph 7 (1) (¢)—
Omit the paragraph, substitute the following paragraph:

“(c) appoint a date for the hearing of the application by the Court, bemg
a date not earlier than 14 June, and not later than 30 June, of that
year; and”.

Paragraph 7 (2) (a)—
(a) Omit “twenty-four”, substitute “24”. |
(b) Omit “(d) of the last preceding subsection”, substitute “(1) (d)”.
Paragraph 7 (2) (b)— o
Omit the paragraph, substitute the following paragraph:

“(b) cause a copy of the application to be continuously displayed in a
prominent place at the applicant’s place of business from 1 June to
14 June (inclusive) of the year referred to in paragraph (D) (b).".

'Subsectlon 7 3)—
Omit “the seventh day of June”, substitute “7 Junc

. Subsection 8 (1)—
Omit “five”, substitute “5”.

_ Subsection 8 (2)— _ o :
Omit “the last preceding subsection”, substitute “subsection (1)”.

Subsection 9 (1)—
Omit “the next succeeding subsection”, substitute “subsection (2)”.

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au




Statute Law Revision (Miscellaneous Provisions) (No.2) No. ,1992 217

SCHEDULE 1—continued
Subsection 9 (2)—
(a) Omit “seven”, substitute “7”.

(b) Insert “, the person” after “the licence”.
Paragraph 9 (2) (a)— -
(a) Omit “he”.
(b) Insert “or her” after “his”.
Paragraph 9 (2) (b)—
Omit “he”. ’
Subsection 10 (1)—
(a) Omit “the next succeeding section”, substitute “section 11”.
(b) Insert “or she” after “he”.
(c) Omit “Four dollars”, substitute “$4”.

Subsection 10 (3)—
Omit “seven of this Act”, substitute “7”.

Paragraphs 11 (2) (a) and (b)—
Omit “he”, substitute “the person”.

Subsection 12 (1)— :
(a) Omit “to the next succeeding section”, substitute “section 13”.
(b) Omit “the thirtieth day of”, substitute “30”.

Subsection 12 (2)— : .
Omit the subsection, substitute the following subsection:

“(2) Sub]ect to section 13, a licence granted pursuant to an application
to which section 7 applies comes into force on 1 July next followmg the day
on which the application was lodged with the Registrar and continues in
force until 30 June next following that firstmentioned day.”.

Paragraph 13 (1) _ (a)—
- Omit “eleven of this Act”, substitute “11”.

Paragraph 13 (1) (b)—
Insert “or she” after “he”.

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au




28  Statwte Law Revision (Miscellaneous Provisions) (No.2)  No. ,1992

SCHEDULE 1—continued
Section 13, penalty at foot—
Onnit “Forty dollars”, substitute “$40”.

Section 14—
Ommit “him”, substitute “the auctioneer’.
Section 14, penalty at foot—
Omit “One hundred dollars”, substitute “$100”.
Subsection 15 (1)— v
(a) Insert “or her” after “him” (first occurring).
(b) Omit “him” (last occurring), substitute “the auctioneer”.
(c) Omit “twelve”, substitute “12”,

Subsection 15 (2)—
Omnit “the last preceding subsection”, substitute “subsection (1)”.

Section 15, penalty at foot—
Ornit “One hundred dollars”, substitute “$100”

Paragraph 16 (b)—
Insert “or her” after “his”.

Section 16, penalty at foot—
Ornit “One hundred dollars”, substitute “$100”.

Section 18—
Omit “One hundred dollars™, substitute “$100”.

Section 19—

Ormit “the next succeeding thirtieth day of June”, substitute “the next
following 30 June”.

Second Schedule, Form A—
Omit “five” (wherever occurring), substitute “5”.

Second Schedule, Forms B and D—
Ornit “seven” (wherever occurring), substitute “7”.

Second Schedule, Form E—
Onmnit “the thirtieth day of June”, substitute “30 June”.

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au




Statute Law Revision (Miscellaneous Provisions) (No.2) = No. , 1992 29

SCHEDULE 1—continued
Birth (Equality of Status) Act 1988

Subsection 4 (2)—

Omit “sections 9, 33, 42 and 43 of the Adoption of Chzldren Act 19657,
substitute “sections 8, 43 54 and 55 of the Adoption Act 1992°

Building Act 1972

Subsection 4 (5)—

(a) Omit “the last two preceding subsections”, substltutc “subsectlons
(3) and (4)”.

(b) Omit “-1970".

Subsection 5 (1) (definitions of “building inspector”, “stop
notice”, “the Building Controller” and “the commencing
date”)—

Omit “of this Act”. _ »
Subsection 5 (1) (definition of “the repealed laws”)—
Omit “(1) of section 4 of this Act”, substitute “4 (1)”.
Subsection 6 (6)— |
Omit “-1968”.
Subsection 9 (5A)—
Omit “-1970”.
Subsection 14 (1)— "
Omit “four”, substitute “4”,

Paragraph 14 (3) (a)—
Omit “three”, substitute “3”.

Paragraph 14 (3) (b)—
Omit “one”, substitute “1”.

Subsection 15 (1)—
(a) Omit “one of the four”, substitute “1 of the 4”. _
(b) Omit “the last preceding section”, substitute “section 14”.
Subsection 15 (3)—
(a) Omit “two”, substitute “2”.
(b) Omit “one”, substitute “1”.

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au




30  Statute Law Revision (Miscellaneous Provisions) (No.2)  No. -, 1992
SCHEDULE 1—continued
‘Paragraph 16 (2) (a)—
Omit “-1966”.
Paragraph 16 (2) (¢)—
Omit “of this subsection”.

Subparagraph 16 (3) (b) (i)—
Omit “the last preceding paragraphs”, substitute ‘paragmph (a)” '

Subsection 16 (5)—
Omit “(a) of the last preceding subsection”, substitute “(4) (a)”. -

| Subsection 16 (6)—
Omit “two”, substitute “2”,

et

Subsection 17 (2)— L
Omit “(b) of the last preceding subsection”, substltutc “(1) (b)”

Subsection 23 (1)—
Omit “seven”, substitute “7”.
Paragraph 32 (1) (a)—
Onnit “two”, substitute “2”.
 Subsection 32 (2)— IR
- Omit “the last preceding subsection”, substitute “subsection (1)”.
Paragraphs 32 (2) (a) and (b)—
Ormit “two”, substitute “2”. o

Subsection 33 (6)—
Ornit “one”, substitute “1”.

Subsection 36 (10)—
Omit “of this Act”.

Paragraph 40 (e)— |
Omit “the last preceding section”, substitute “section 39",

Paragraph 43 (3) (d)—
Omit “the next succeeding subsection”, substitute “subsectlon (4)”.

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au




-Statute Law Revision (Miscellaneous Provisions) (No. 2) No. 1992 31_

SCHEDULE l—contlnued
Paragraph 43 (3) (e)— .
Omit “the next succeeding secuon subsntutc “sectlon 44>,

Subsection 44 (1)—
Omit “seven’, substitute “7”.

Section 45—

Omit “either of the last two preceding sections”, substitute “section 43
or 44”.

Paragraph 45 (d)—
(a) Omit “two”, substitute “2”.

(b) Omlt “the preceding paragraphs of this sccnon substitute
“paragraph (a), (b) or (c)” ,

Paragraph 46 (1) (d)—

Omit “Australia”, substitute “the Commonwealth”.
Subsection 53 (5)— |

Omit “of this section”.
Paragraph 53 (8) (a)—

Omit “two”, substitute “2”.
Section 62—

Omit “of this Act”.

Business Franchise (Tobacco and Petroleum Products) Act

1984 :

Subsection 3 (1) (definition of “unleaded motor spirit”,
paragraph (b))— _

Omit “phosphorous”, substitute “phosphorus”.

Canberra Theatre Trust Act 1965

Subsection 6 (1)— '

Omit “nine”, substitute “9”,
Subsection 6 (2)—

(a) Omit “five”, substitute “5”.

(b) Insert “or her” after “his”.

Authorised by the ACT Parfiamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au




32 Statute Law Revision (Miscellaneous Provisions) (No.2) No. ,1992

SCHEDULE 1—continued
Subsections 7 (3) and (4)—
(a) Insert “or her” after “his”.

(b) Insert “or she” after “he™.

Subsections 10 (1) and 11 (1) and (2)—
Insert “or her” after “his” (wherever occurring).

Paragraph 12 (1) (a)—

Insert “or her” after *“his” (wherever occurring).
Paragraph 12 (1) (b)—

Omit “three”, substitute “3”,

Paragraph 12 (1) (¢)— :
Omit the paragraph, substitute the following paragraph:

“(c) fails to comply with hxs or her obligations under subsectlon (2), i

Subsection 12 (2)—
Insert “or her” after “his”.

Subsection 15 (1)—
Insert “or she” after “he”.

Subsection 15 (3)—
Ommit “one”, substitute “1”.

Subsection 19 (1)—
Insert “or her” after “his”.

Paragraph 23 (1) (a)—
Omit “1929-1965, substitute “1975.

Subsection 23 (2)—

Omit all words after “force of law”, substitute “and are disallowable
instruments for the purposes of section 10 of the Subordinate Laws Act

1989, ‘ _
Children’s Services Act 1986

Subsection 4 (1) (definition of “adopting parent”,
paragraph (a))—

Omit “Adoption of Children Act 1965, substitute “Adoption Act
1992”. ,

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au




-

 Statute Law Revision (Miscellaneous Provisions) (No.2)  No. ,1992 33
SCHEDULE 1—continued _
Subsection 4 (1) (definition of “Community Advocate”)—
. Omit the definition, substitute the following definition:

“ ‘Community Advocate’ means the person appointed under subsection
4 (1) of the Community Advocate Act 1991;”.

Subsection 78 (3)— , .
Omit “Youth”, substitute “Community”.

Common Boundaries Act 1981

'Schedule, Forms 1 to 8 (inclusive)—

Omit “Dividing Fences Act 1981” (wherever occurring), substitute
“Common Boundaries Act 1981, o :

Credit Act 1985

Paragraph 185 (1) (a)— ' o

Omit “duly qualified”.

Drugs of Dependence Act 1989

Subsection 3 (2)— -

Insert “as” after “read”.
Subparagraph 25 (1) (b) (i)—

Omit “licence”, substitute “licensee”.

Subsection 57 (2)—
Omit “a intern”, substitute “an intern”.

Subsection 93 (1)—
Omit “Crimes Act, 1900 of the State of New South Wales in its
application to the Territory,”, substitute “Crimes Act 1900”.

Subsection 93 (2)—

Omit “Crimes Act, 1900 of the State of New South Wales in its
application to the Territory”, substitute “Crimes Act 1900”.

Sections 103 and 113—
Omit “Part IV Division 27, substitute “Part IV, Division 2”.

Paragraph 120 (3) (a)—
- Omit “direction, of”, substitute “direction of,”.

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legisiation.act gov.au




34  Statute Law Revision (Miscellaneous Provisions) (No.2)  No. , 1992

SCHEDULE 1—continued
Paragraph 123 (6) (a)—

Omit “Crimes Act, 1900 of the State. of New South Wales in its
application to the Territory”, substitute “Crimes Act 1900”.

Subparagraph 130 (2) (b) (ii)—
Omit “person”, substitute “persons”.

Section 147—
(a) Omit “treatment” (first occurring).
(b) Omit “to treatment”, substitute “to a trcatmcnt”

Su)b)sectlon 160 (1) (definition of “exempt person”, paragraph
(b))—

Omit “by a reason”, substitute “by reason”.

Subsection 160 (1) (definition of “exempt person”, paragraph
(h))— .
Omit “or”. .
Schedule 4, Form 2, note 3—
Omit “Class 17, substitute “Class I”.
Gaming Machine (Amendment) Act (No. 3) 1990
Paragraphs 22 (g) and (h)—
Omit “relevant”, substitute “required”.
Health Services Act 1990
~ Paragraph 52 (2) (b)—
Omit “25" (wherever occurring), subsututc “26”.
Interpretation Act 1967

Subsection 14 (1) (definition of “Territory” (first
occurring))—

Omit the definition.

Subsection 14 (1)— _
Insert the following definition:

* ‘the Territory’ means—

(@) when used in a geographical sense—the Australian Capital
Territory; or

Authorised by the ACT Pariiamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au




Statute Law Revision (Miscellaneous Provisions) (No.2)  No. 1992 35

SCHEDULE 1—continued

~ (b) in any other case—the body politic established by section 7
of the Australian Capital Territory (Self-Government) Act
1988 of the Commonwealth;”. _

Legal Practitioners (Amendment) Apt (No. 3) 1991
Section 31— S B A
Omit “(1)”, substitute “(2)”.
| Limitation Act 1985
Section 54— o
Repeal the section.
Liguor Act 1975
Section 104—
Repeal the section, substitute the following section:

Review by Tribunal

“104. Application may be made to the Australian Capital Territory
Administrative Appeals Tribunal for review of a decision by the relevant
decision-maker—

(a) refusing to issue a licence under paragraph 30 (3) (b) or (4) (b);

(b) issuing a licence under section 33 of a class different from that
applied for;

(c) issuing a Special Licence under subsection 34A (1) subject to
conditions;

(d) refusing to authorise the transfer of a licence under paragraph 41

(1B) (b) or (1C) (b); __
(e) refusing to cancel a licence under subsection 42C (1);

(f) refusing to grant approval for the purpose of subsection 42E (1) or
3 ,

(g) giving directions to a licensee under subsection 46 (1);
(h) suspending a licence under section 47 or paragraph 49 (2) (b);
(i) issuing a reprimand to a licensee under section 47 or paragraph 49

) @;
(G) cancelling a licence under paragraph 55 (2) (a);
(k) refusing to approve an alteration under paragraph 57 (b) or STA

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au




36  Statute Law Revision (Miscellaneous Provisions) (No.2)  No. , 1992

)

(m)
(n)

(o)

()

SCHEDULE 1—continued

refusing to declare that an alteration is complete for the purposes: of
subsection 58 (2);

refusing to approve a closure under paragraph 60 (b) or 60AA (b);

refusing to issue a jpermit under paragraph 63 (2) (b) or authonse
the issue of a permit under paragraph 64 (b); ,

ggre;mg to issue a permit subject to conditions under subsection
(2); or

cancelling a permit under paragraph 66D (2) (a).”.
Long Service Leave Act 1976

Section 17—
Repeal the section.

Maintenance Act 1968

The Schedule—
Omit the Schedule.

Milk Authority Act 1971

Subsection 2 (1)—
‘Omit “the next succeeding subsccuon” substitute “subsection (2)”.

Subsection 2 (2)—
Omit “the last preceding subsection”, substitute “subsection (1)”.

Paragraph 2 (2) (b)—
Omit “(1) of section 41, of this Act”, subsntutc “41 (l)”

Subsection 4 (1) (definition of “inspector”)—
Omit “of this Act”. o

Subsection 4 (1) (definition of “licence’)—
Omit all the words after “this Act” (first occurring).

Subsection 4 (1) (definition of “member of the authority”)—
Omit “‘authority”, substitute ‘““Authority”.

Subsection 4 (1) (definition of “milk”, paragraph (c))— |
Omn “one”, substitute “1”.

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au




Statute Law Revision (Miscellaneous Provisions) (No.2) No. ,1992 37

SCHEDULE 1—continued

Subsection 4 (1) (definition of “the Secretary to the
Authority”’)— : o

Omit “of this Act’;.
Subsection 5§ (1)—
Omit “he”, substitutc “it”.
Subsection 5 (4)—
Omit “him”, substitute “the inspector”.
Subsection 5 (5)— / ' v
Omit “the last preceding subsection”, substitute “subsection 4)”.
Subsection 5 (6)— R
Omit “him”, substitute “the inspector”.
Subsection 7 (3)—
Insert “he or she” after “if”’.
Paragraphs 7 (3) (a), (b) and (¢)—
Omit “he”.
Subsection 7 (4)—
(a) Omit “three”, substitute “3”
~ (b) Insert “or her” after “his”.
Paragraph 11 (2) (a)—
Insert “or her” after “his”.

Paragraph 11 (2) (¢)—
Omit “one”, substitute “1”",

Paragraph 11 (2) (e)— _
Omit “(3) of section 7 of thlS Act" subsntutc “7 (3)” |

Section 12— - | . o
Repeal the section, substitute the following section:
Resignation of member . |

“12. A member of the Authority may resign office i in wntmg sxgncd by
the member addressed to the Minister.”. ,

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au




38 Statute Law Revision (Miscellaneous Provisions) (No.2) No. , 1992

SCHEDULE l—-continued
Subsection 14 (1)— .

. (a) Omit “three”, substitute “3”,
(b) Omit “two”, substitute “2”,
Subsection 14 (2)—
Insert “or her” after “his”.

Subsection 14 (3)—
Insert “or she” after “he”.

Subsection 14 (5)—
(a) Omit “two” (wherever occurring), substitute “2”.

(b) Omit “three”, substitute “3”.

. Subsection 16B (1)—

(a) Omit “by writing signed by him”, substitute “in writing signed by
him or her”.

(b) Omit “him” (last occurring), substitute “the Minister”.

Subsection 16B (3)—
Insert “or she” after “he”.

Paragraph 16B (4) (b)—
_ Omit “(whether by virtue of this Act, the Prices Regulation Ordinance
1949 of the Australian Capital Territory as amended or section 75 of the
Commonwealth Functions (Statutes Review) Act 1981 of the
Commonwealth)”.
Subsection 16B (5)—
(a) Omit “he”, substitute “the Minister”.

(b) Insert “or her” after “him”.
Subsection 18 (6)—
Omit the subsection, substitute the following subsection:

“(6) At an inquiry, a person appearing before the Authority may be
represented by another person who may examine witnesses and address the
Authority on behalf of the firstmentioned person.”.

Subsection 19 (1)—

(a) Omit “by writing under his hand”, substitute “in writing 51gned by
~ him or her”.

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au




Statute Law Revision (Miscellaneous Provisions) (No.2) ~ No. ,1992 39
SCHEDULE 1—continued
(b) Omit “his” (last occurring), substitute “the person’s”.
(¢) Omit“he”, substitute “the person™.

Subsection 19 (2)—
Omit “under the last preceding subsection”.

Paragraph 19 (2) (b)—
Insert “or her” after “his”.
- Paragraph 19 (2) (¢)—
Omit “sixteen”, substitute “16”.

Subsection 19 (§)—
Omit “Chairman”, substitute “Chaxrperson

Subsection 20 (1)—
Omit “the next succeeding subsection”, substltute “subsection 2)”.

Subsection 20 (2)—
Omit “him”, substitute “the witness”.

Subsection 20 (4)—
Insert “or she” after “he”.

Subsection 20 (5)—

Ormt “by writing under his hand”, substltute in writing signed by him
or her”

Subsection 20 (10)—
Omit “the next succeedmg subsectxon” substitute “subsecuon (10A)”.

Paragraph 20 (10) (b)—
Insert “or she” after “he”.

Subsection 20 (10A)—

(a) Omit “in pursuance of the last preceding subsectlon”, substitute
“under subsection (10)”.

(b) Insert “or her” after “him”.

Subsection 20 (11)—
Omit the subsection, substitute the following subsection:
“(11) Where—

&

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au




40  Statute Law Revision (Miscellaneous Provisions) (No.2) -~ No. 1992

SCHEDULE 1—continued
(a) a person applies under this section for a copy of any transcnpt ‘and

(b) a copy of the transcript is not available;

the Secretary to the Authority may, before causing a copy of the transcript:to
be prepared, require the applicant to deposit with the Secretary to the
Authority on account of the fee payable on the application, such amount as
the Secretary to the Authority determines, being an amount that does not, in
his or her opinion, exceed the amount of the fee so payable.”.

Subsection 21 (1)—
(a) Omit “his”, substitute “the person’s”.
(b) Insert “or she” after “he”.

Subsection 21 (3)—
Omit “him”, substitute “the person™.

Subsection 21 (4)—
Omit “him”, substitute “the witness”. _
‘Subsection 21C (3)— Gy
Omit “subsection” (last occurring). o

Subsections 22 (1) and (2)—
Omit “he”, substitute “the person”.

Paragraph 22 (9) (b)—
Insert “or she” after “he”.

Paragraph 22 (9) (d)—
Insert “or her” after “his”.

Paragraph 22 (9) (e)—
(a) Insert “or herself” after “himself”.
(b) Insert‘“or her” after “his”.

Paragraph 22 (9) (g)—
Insert “or her” after “him”.

Subsection 23 (3)—
(a) Omit “him”, substitute “the applicant”.

(b) Omit “in connexion with his”, substitute “in connection with his or
her”. .

Authorised by the ACT Parfiamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au




Statute Law Revision (Miscellaneous Provisions) (No.2)  No. ,1992 41

SCHEDULE 1—continued
Subsections 24 (1) and (2)—
Omit “one” (wherever occurring), substitute “1”.
Subsection 25 (3)—
(a) Omit “him”, substitute “the applicant”.
~(b) Omit “in connexion with his”, substitute “in connection with his or
her”. : ' ‘
Paragraphs 27 (1) (a) and (b)—
Insert “or she” after “he” (wherever occurring).
Paragraph 27 (1) (¢)— -
(a) Insert “or she” after “he”.
(b) Insert “or her” after “his”.
Paragraph 27 (1) (d)—
Insert “or her” after “his” (wherever occurring).

Paragraph 27 (1) (e)—
Insert “or she” after “he”.

Paragraph 27 (1) (f)—

(a) Insert “or she” after “he”.

(b) Insert “or her” after “him”.
Subsection 27 (2)—

Insert “or she” after “he”.
Paragraph 27 (3) (b)—

Insert “or her” after “his”.
Subsection 27 (4)—

Omit “him in connexion”, substitute “him or her in connection”.

Subsection 28 (1)—
Omit “one”, substitute “1”.

Paragraphs 28 (1) (e), (f) and (g)—
Insert “or her” after “his” (wherever occurring).

Subsection 28 (2)—
(a) Insert “or her” after “him”.

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au




42 Statute Law Revision (Miscellaneous Provisions) (No.2)  No.  , 1992
' SCHEDULE l—contmued
(b) Insert “or her” after “his™.
Subsections 28 (3) and 29 (1)—
(a) Insert “or she” after “he”.
(b) Insert “or her” after “his”.
Subsection 29 (2)—
Insert “or her” after “him”.

Subsection 29 (3)—
(a) Omit “him”, substitute “the person”.
(b) Insert “or her” after “his” (wherever occurring).
(c) Omit “he”, substitute “the person”.

Subsection 29 (4)—
Insert “or her” after “his”.

Subsection 30 (1)—
Omit “27” (last occurring).

Subsection 30 (3)—
' Omit “one”, substitute “1”.

Section 36—
Insert “or her” after “his” (ﬁrst occurrmg)

Paragraph 36 (b)—
(a) Onmit “he”, substitute “the person”.
(b) Insert “or her” after “his”.
Subsection 37 (1)—
(a) Insert “or her” after “his”.
(b) Insert “or herself” after “himself”.

Section 38—
Insert “or her’” after “his”.

Subsection 41 (1)—
(a) Insert “or her” after “his”.
(b) Insert “or she” after “he”.

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au




————;

Statute Law Revision (Miscellaneous Provisions) (No. 2) No. ,1992 43
SCHEDULE 1—continued

Subsection 41 (2)—
Insert “or her” after “his”.
Section 42— |
Insert “or her” after “his”.
Subsection 46 (3)—
Omit “him”, substitute “the holder”. -
Paragraph 46 (3) (a)— ’
(a) Omit “he”, substitute “the holder”.
(b) Insert “or her” after “his”.
(¢) Omit “two”, substitute “2”,
Subsection 47 (2)— - .
(a) Omit “twenty-eight”, substitute “28”. ‘ '
(b) Omit “the last preceding subsection”, substitute “subsection (1)”.

Section 49—
Repeal the section.

Subsection 51 (1)—
(a) Omit “(1)".

(b) Omit “him in his”, substitute “the member or Secretary in his or
her”. :

Paragraph 54 (1) (g)—
Omit “One hundred dollars”, substitute “$100”.
Parole Act 1976

Subsection § (1) (definition of “non-parole period”,
paragraph (c))—

Omit “(Australian Capital Territory)”.
Pesticides Act 1989

Subsection 77 (3)—
Omit “order”, substitute “orders”.

Paragraph 77 (6) (a)—
Omit “days”, substitute “days’ .

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act gov.au




44 Statute Law Revision (Miscellaneous Provisions) (No.2)  No. , 1992

SCHEDULE 1—continued
Plumbers, Drainers and Gasfitters Board Act 1982

Section 6— ’
(a) Omit “his”.
~ (b) Omit “him”, substitute “the member”.
Subsection 7 (1)~
(a) Omit “one”, substitute “1”.
(b) Omit “Chairman”, substitute “Chairperson”.
Subsection 7 (2)—
(a) Omit “Chairman”, substitute “Chairperson”.
(b) Insert “or her” after “his”.
(c) Insert “or she” after “he”™.
Subsection 7 (3)—
(a) Omit “Chairman” (wherever occurring), substitute “Chairperson”.
(b) Insert “or her” after “his”.
Subsection 7 (4)—
(a) Omit “Chairman” (wherever occurring), substitute “Chairperson”.‘
(b) Omit “his”, substitute “the”.
(¢) Insert “or her” after “him”.
Subsection 8 (1)—
(a) Omit “one”, substitute “1”.
(b) Omit “Chairman”, substitute “Chairperson”.
Subsection 8 (2)— _
(a) Omit “Chairman”, substitute “Chairperson”.
(b) Insert “or her” after “his”.
(c¢) Insert “or she” after “he”.
Subsection 8 (3)— o
(a) Omit “Chairman” (wherever occurring), substitute “Chairperson”.
(b) Omit “his”, substitute “the”. ‘ ‘
(c) Insert “or her” after “him”.

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au




-

Statute Law Revision (Miscellaneous Provisions) (No. 2) No. ,1992 45

SCHEDULE l—continued
Subsection 9 (3)— o
Insert “or she” after “he”.

Paragraph 10 (2) (b)—
Omit “one”, substitute “1”.

Subsection 11 (2)—
(a) Omit “Chairman” (wherever occurring), substitute “Chairperson”.
(b) Omit “one”, substitute “1”. ' ’
Subsection 18 (1)—
(a) Omit “Chairman”, substitute “Chairperson”.
(b) Insert “or she” after “he”.
Subsection 18 (3)— |
(a) Omit “Chairman” (wherever occurring), substitute “Chairperson”.
(b) Omit “one”, substitute “1”.
Subsection 21 (2)—
(a) Omit “Chairman”, substitute “Chairperson”.
'(b) Insert “or her” after “him”.

Subsection 24 (1)—
Insert “or she” after “he”.

Subsections 24 (3) and 25 (3)—
(a) Omit “Chairman” (wherever occurring), substitute “‘Chairperson”.
(b) Insert “or her” after “his”. '
Subsection 25 (4)—
(a) Omit “his”, substitute “the applicant’s”.
(b) Omit “he”, substitute “the applicant”.
Paragraphs 26 (1) (a), (b), (¢) and (d)— .
Omit “he” (wherever occurring), substitute “the applicant”.
Subsection 34 (1)—
(a) Insert “or her” after “his” (wherever occurring).
(b) Omit “him”, substitute “the person”. '

!
]
]
i
-
i

| Authorised by the ACT Parfiamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au
i

[




46  Statute Law Revision (Miscellaneous Provisions) (No.2) No. 1992
SCHEDULE 1—continued
(c) Omit “one”, substitute “1”.

Subsection 35 (1)—
Omit “him”, substitute “the person”.

Subsection 36 (7)—
Insert “or she” after “he”.

Subsection 38 (1)—
(a) Omit “Chairman”, substitute “Chairperson”.
(b) Insert “or her” after “him”.
(¢) Omit “his”, substitute “the person’s”.
Paragraph 38 (2) (b)— '
(a) Insert “or her” after “his”.
(b) Omit “Chairman”, substitute “Chairperson”.

Subsection 40 (1)—
Omit “him”, substitute “the person”.

Subsection 40 (2)—
Omit “him”, substitute “the witness”.

Further amendments—

1. The following provisions are amended by inserting “or her” after
“his” (wherever occurring):

Paragraphs 5 (2) (b) and 10 (2) (a), section 14, subsections 16 (1) and
28 (1), paragraph 30 (1) (b), subsections 33 (1) and 36 (2) and paragraph
36 (3) (d).

2. The following provisions are amended by omitting “Chairman”
(wherever occurring), and substituting “Chairperson””:

Section 3 (definitions of “Chairman”, “Deputy Chairman” and
“member”), subsections 8 (4) and 11 (1), section 15 and subsections 17 (2)
and (4), 18 (2) and 21 (1).

Poisons and Drugs Act 1978

Subsection 27E (1)—
Omit “(1)”, substitute “27D (1)”.

Authorised by the ACT Paﬂiamntaw Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au




Statute Law Revision (Miscellaneous Provisions) (No.2) ~ No. ,1992 47

SCHEDULE 1—continued
Subsection 30 (1) (definition of “internal use”, paragraph

(b))—
Omit the paragraph, substitute the following:

“(b) a douche for rectal, vaginal or urethral use;
means administration orally, parenterally or by way of a body orifice;”.
Section 45— B N

Omit “schedule”, substitute “scheduled”.
Police Offences A‘ct 1930
" Paragraph 23 (1) (§)—
Add at the end “or”.
Publications Control Act 1989
Subsection 17H (1)—
Omit “section”, substitute “subsection”. :
Rates and Land Tax Act 1926
Section 3—
Repeal the section.

Heading to The Schedules—
Omit the heading.

The First Schedule—
- Repeal the Schedule.

Schools Authority Act 1976

Section 4 (definition of “Australian Capltal Territory Teachers’
Federation”)—

Omit the definition. L
Sewerage Rates Act 1968
Subsection 4 (1A)—
Omit “Minister”.
Standard Time and Summer Time Act 1972

Section 3 (definition of “the Territory”)—
Omiit the definition. '

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legisiation.act.gov.au




48  Statuse Law Revision (Miscellaneous Provisions) (No.2)  No. , 1992
SCHEDULE 1—continued
Territory Owned Corporations Act 1990
Subsection 3 (1) (definition of “group”)—
Omit “Corporation”, substitute “corporation”.
Subsection 14 (2) (definition of “specified transactions”)—
Omit “transactions”, substitute “transaction”.
Subsection 14 (2) (definition of “specified transactions”,

paragraph (c))— ‘
Omit “and”, substitute “or”. :

Paragraph 22 (2) ()—
Omit “16”, substitute “17”.
Subsection 32 (1)—
Omit “moneys”, substitute “profits”.
Tcstamentary." Guardianship Act 1984

Subsection 3 (2)—

- Omit “sections 9, 33, 42 and 43 of the Adoprtion of Children Act 1965,
substitute “sections 8, 43, 54 and 55 of the Adoption Act 1992”.

SCHEDULE 2 A Section 3
REPEAL OF ACTS | |

Church of England Lands Act 1926
Community and Health Service (Amendment) Act 1988
Community and Health Service (Consequential Provisions) Act 1988 | o
 Enquiry Act (No.2) 1938
Enquiry Act 1967
Enquiry Act 1970
Enquiry Act (No. 2) 1970
Health Authority (Amendment) Act 1986
Health Authority (Amendment) Act 1987
Health Authority (Amendment) Act (No. 2) 1987

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au




Statute Law Revision (Miscellaneous Provisions) (No.2) No. ,1992 49

SCHEDULE 2—continued
Health Authority (Amendment) Act (No. 3) 1987

Interim Planning (Amendment) Act 1991
Interim Planning (Amendment) Act (No. 2) 1991
Interim Planning (Consequential Amendments) Act 1990
Stock Act 1936
 Stock Act 1940
Stock Act 1941
Stock Act 1948
Stock Act 1957
Stock Act 1962
Stock (Amendment) Act 1982
Stock (Amendment) Act 1986

NOTES ABOUT SECTION HEADINGS

On the day on which the Agents Act 1968 is amended by this Act, the following heading
to that Act is amended as follows:

Section  Alteration

10

Omit the heading, substitute the following heading:
Chairperson and Deputy Chairperson

On the day on which the Plumbers, Drainers and Gasfitters Board Act 1982 is amended by
this Act, the following headings to that Act are amended as follows:

Section Alteration

7

Omit the heading, substitute the following heading:
Chairperson

Omit the heading, substitute the following heading:
Deputy Chairperson

Printed by R, M. LANSDOWNE, Government Printer by Authority of the ACT Executive

© Copyright Australian Capital Territory

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation. act.gov.au




		(02)+61 2 6205 3700
	2013-12-23T17:13:16+1100
	Canberra
	ACT Parliamentary Counsel
	Document is authorised




