
Remuneration (Amendment) Ordinance 1982 

No. 14 of 1982 

I, THE GOVERNOR-GENERAL of the Commonwealth of Australia, acting 
with the advice of the Federal Executive Council, hereby make the following 
Ordinance under the Seat of Government (Administration) Act 1910. 

Dated 29 April 1982. 

ZELMAN COWEN 
Governor-General 

By His Excellency's Command, 

MICHAEL HODGMAN 
Minister of State for the Capital Territory 

An Ordinance to amend the Remuneration Ordinance 1976 

Short title 
1. This Ordinance may be cited as the Remuneration (Amendment) 

Ordinance 1982.1 

Commencement 
2. This Ordinance shall be deemed to have come into operation on 1 July 

1981. 

Principal Ordinance 
3. In this Ordinance, "Principal Ordinance" means the Remuneration 

Ordinance 1976.2 

Fees and allowances payable to members of a prescribed authority 
4. (1) Section 3 of the Principal Ordinance is amended by omitting 

sub-section (8) and substituting the following sub-section: 

"(8) Where a member of a prescribed authority necessarily stays overnight 
at a place other than his place of residence in order to attend a meeting of the 
authority or to engage, with the approval of the authority, on business of the 
authority, travelling allowance in respect of the period of absence is payable to 
him— 

(a) if the first-mentioned place is Canberra, Darwin or the capital city of a 
State—at the rate of $70 per day; or 

(b) in any other case—at the rate of $56 per day.". 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



(2) The Principal Ordinance is amended as set out in the following table: 

Provision Amendment 

Paragraph 3 (3) (a) Omit "$100", substitute "$120". 
Paragraph 3 (3) (b) Omit "$50", substitute "$60". 
Paragraph 3 (4) (a) Omit "$80", substitute "$95". 
Paragraph 3 (4) (b) Omit "$40", substitute "$47.50". 
Paragraph 3 (5) (a) Omit "$100", substitute "$120". 
Paragraph 3 (5) (b) Omit "$50", substitute "$60". 
Paragraph 3 (6) (a) Omit "$80", substitute "$95". 
Paragraph 3 (6) (b) Omit "$40", substitute "$47.50". 

NOTES 
1. Notified in the Commonwealth of Australia Gazette on 7 May 1982. 

2. No. 62, 1976 as amended by Nos. 21 and 48,1978; Nos. 12 and 54, 1980. 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au


		(02)+61 2 6205 3700
	2009-08-10T11:13:47+1000
	Canberra
	ACT Parliamentary Counsel
	Document is authorised




