
Regulation 1 9 8 1 No. 1 8 l 

Canberra Sewerage and Water Supply 
Regulations 2 (Amendment) 

I, WILLIAM MICHAEL HODGMAN, the Minister of State for the Capital 
Territory, hereby make the following Regulation under the Building and 
Services Ordinance 1924. 

Dated 2 September 1981. 

MICHAEL HODGMAN 
Minister of State for the Capital Territory 

Amendments relating to fees 
The Canberra Sewerage and Water Supply Regulations are amended as 

set out in the following table: 

Provision Amendment 

Sub-regulation 15 (3) . . Omit "$35", substitute "$45". 
Omit "S3" , substitute "$4" . 

Sub-regulation 15 (4) . . . Omit "$25", substitute "$30". 
Sub-regulation 15 (5) . . . Omit "$100", substitute "$125". 
Sub-regulation 18 (2) . . . Omit "$15", substitute "$20". 

Omit "$3" , substitute "$4". 
Sub-regulation 18(3) . . . Omit "$5", substitute "$6". 
Paragraph 20 (a) . . . . Omit "$35", substitute "$45". 
Paragraph 20 (b) . . . . Omit "$35", substitute "$45". 

Omit "$4" , substitute "$5" . 
Paragraph 20 (c) . . . . Omit "$10", substitute "$15". 
Paragraph 20 (d) . . . . Omit " $ 1 " , substitute " $ 2 " . 
Sub-regulation 24 (8) . . . Omit "$10", substitute "$15". 

N O T E S 

1. N o t i f i e d in the Commonwealth of Australia Gazette o n 10 S e p t e m b e r 1 9 8 1 . 

2. R e g u l a t i o n s notif ied in the Gazette o n 2 N o v e m b e r 1933 as a m e n d e d by R e g u l a t i o n s 
not i f ied in the Gazette o n 30 July 1936, 3 J u n e 1937 a n d 18 A u g u s t 1938 a n d by R e g u l a ­
t i ons 1941 N o . 1; 1942 N o s . 2, 9 a n d 1 1 ; 1959 N o . 16 ; 1962 N o . 8 ; 1975 N o . 14; 1977 
N o . 8; 1 9 7 8 N o . 14; 1 9 7 9 N o . 2 6 ; 1 9 8 0 N o . 1 1 . 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au


		(02)+61 2 6205 3700
	2012-04-30T14:24:15+1000
	Canberra
	ACT Parliamentary Counsel
	Document is authorised




