544 AUSTRALIAN CAPITAL TERRITORY

Regulations 1982 No. 41!

Health Commission (Charges) Regulatlons
(Amendment)

I, JAMES JOSEPH CARLTON, the Minister of State for Health, hereby
make the following Regulations under the Health Commission Ordinance
1975.

Dated 25 August 1982.

J.J.CARLTON
Minister of State for Health

Commencement
1. These Regulations shall come into operation on.l September 1982.

Amendments relating to fees

2. The Health Commission (Charges) Regulations are amended as set out
in the following table:

Provision Amendment
Paragraph3 (1) (a) . . . . . . . . . . Omit"$96", substitute “$120".
Paragraph3 (1) (Y . . . . . . . . . . Omit"$96", substitute “$120".
Paragraph3 (1) (¢} . . . . . . . . . . Omit"$132", substitute "$165".
Sub-regulation3(2) . . . . . . . . . . Omit"$1757, substitute “$200".
Sub-regulation3(3A) . . . . . . . . . Omit"8$175", substitute *$200"
Sub-regulation3{(6) . . . . . . . . . . Omit"$48", substitute “$60".
Sub-regutation3(64) . . . . . . . . . Omit"$96", substitute “$120".
Sub-regulation3 (68) . . . . . . . . .  Omit“$96" substitute “$120".
Sub-regulation 3 (10) .o o .o o . Omitt$547, substitute “$60".
Sub-regulation3A (1Y . . . . . . . . .  Omit*"$24", substitute “$30".
Sub-regulation 3a (2} . . . . . . . . . Omit"8$24", substitute "$30",
Sub-regulation3a{(3) . . . . . . . . . Omit"§$18", substitute “$20",
Sub-regulation3a (4} . . . . . . . . .  Omit“$18", substitute “$20".
Sub-regulation3a(5) . . . . . . . . . Omit“$18", substitute “$20",
NOTES

1. Notified in the Commonwealth of Australia Gazette on 31 August 1982,

2. Regulations 1975 No. 13 as amended to date. For previous amendments see Note 2 to
Regulations 1982 No. 4 and see also Regulations 1982 Nos. 4, 5, 7and 9.

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel-also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



		(02)+61 2 6205 3700
	2012-04-12T12:30:33+1000
	Canberra
	ACT Parliamentary Counsel
	Document is authorised




