
Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au 

 
Australian Capital Territory 

Regulations 1990   No. 141 

 

Electricity Regulations2 (Amendment) 

The Australian Capital Territory Executive hereby makes the following 
Regulations under the Electricity Act 1971.  

Dated 24 August 1990. 

 GARY HUMPHRIES 

 Minister 

 CRAIG DUBY 

 Minister 

 



2 Electricity    1990 No. 14 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au 

Licence fees—electrical contractors 

1.  Regulation 2 of the Electricity Regulations is amended by omitting 
“$5” and substituting “$50”. 

Licence fees—electricians 

2.  Regulation 3 of the Electricity Regulations is amended by omitting 
“$2” and substituting “$25”. 
 

NOTES 

1. Notified in the ACT Gazette on 31 August 1990. 
2. Regulations 1971 No. 10 as amended by 1980 No. 3; 1985 No. 23 and 1988 No. 9; 

Ordinance No. 21, 1989. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

©  Australian Capital Territory 1990 


		(02)+61 2 6205 3700
	2013-07-23T09:05:42+1000
	Canberra
	ACT Parliamentary Counsel
	Document is authorised




