
Regulations 1979 No . 26 

Regulations to revise the Regulations in force under the Ordinances of 
the Australian Capital Territory1 

I, PETER D R E W DURACK, the Attorney-General of the Common
wealth of Australia, as Attorney-General and acting for and on behalf of 
the Minister of State for the Capital Territory, the Minister of State for 
Health and the Minister of State for Business and Consumer Affairs, 
hereby make, under each Ordinance specified in the Schedule, the Regu
lation or the Regulations set out in that Schedule immediately following 
the short title of that Ordinance. 

Dated this twenty-sixth day of November 1979. 

P. DURACK 
Attorney-General 

SCHEDULE 

B U I L D I N G O R D I N A N C E 1972 

The Building Regulations are amended as set out in the following table: 

Provision Amendment 

Regulation 3 Repeal 
Regula t ion5 Omit "One dollar", substitute " $ 1 " 

B U I L D I N G A N D SERVICES O R D I N A N C E 1924 

The Canberra Sewerage and Water Supply Regulations are amended as set out in the follow
ing table: 

Provision Amendment 

Sub-regulation 93 ( 1 9 ) . . . Omit "fo l low", substitute " fo l l ows" 
Paragraph 96 ( q ) O m i t " , V I Z . " 

B U S I N E S S N A M E S O R D I N A N C E 1963 

The Business N a m e s Regulations are amended by omitting from Form 6 in the Second 
Schedule "twenty-one " a n d substituting" 18". 

C O U R T O F PETTY SESSIONS O R D I N A N C E 1930 

The Court o f Petty Sessions Rules are amended as set out in the following table: 

Provision Amendment 

Rule 2 Repeal 
Rule 3 Omit the definition of "the Ordinance", substitute: 

" 'the Ordinance' means the Court of Petty Sessions 
Ordinance 1 9 3 0 " 

Paragraph 6 ( e ) Omit "five", subs t i tu te"5" 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



SCHEDULE-continued 

Provision Amendment 
Rule 8 Omit " t w o " and "three", substitute " 2 " and " 3 " re

spectively 
Rule 9 Omit "seven "(wherever occurring), substitute " 7 " 
Rule 11 Omit "twenty-four", substitute " 2 4 " 
Paragraph 17 ( e ) Omit "three", substitute "3 " 
Paragraph 1 8 ( c ) Omit " s i x " (wherever occurring), substitute " 6 " 
R u l e 2 5 Omit "twelve " (wherever occurring), substitute " 1 2 " 
Rule 26 Omi t" twe lve" , subs t i tu te" 1 2 " 
Rule 27 Omit "three", substitute " 3 " 
Sub-rule 29 ( 1 ) Omit"Fi f ty" , subs t i tu te"50" 

O m i t " t w e l v e " , substitute" 1 2 " 
Rule31 O m i t " - 1 9 3 1 " 
R u l e 3 2 O m i t " t h r e e " , s u b s t i t u t e " 3 " 

Omit "plaint", substitute "compla int" 
Rule 37 Omit"f ive" , subs t i tu te"5" 
Rule 39 Omit "five", substitute " 5 " 
Rule 41 Omi t"s ix" , s u b s t i t u t e ' ^ " 

Omit "three", substitute "3 " 
Sub-rule42 ( 3 ) Omit "five", substitute " 5 " 
Sub-rule 43 ( 1 ) Omit "five", substitute " 5 " 
R u l e 5 5 Omit "five ".substitute " 5 " 
Rule 58 Omit "section 63 of the Bankruptcy Act 1924-1932". 

substitute "section 60 of the Bankruptcy Act 1966" 
Rule 70 Omit "twenty-four", substitute " 2 4 " 
Rule 82 O m i t " t w e l v e " , substitute" 1 2 " 
Rule 87 Omit "four", substitute " 4 " 
Rule 88 Omit"four" , substitute " 4 " 
Rule 89 Omit "twenty-four", substitute " 2 4 " 
The First Schedule Omit the " T h e First Schedule" , substitute "First 

S c h e d u l e " 
Omit from Form 1 " ( N o . 2 ) " 
Omit from Form 2 " ( N o . 2 ) " 
Omit from Form 3 " ( N o . 2 ) " 
Omit from Form 4 " ( N o . 2 ) " 
Omit from Form 5 " ( N o . 2 ) " 
Omit from Form 6 " ( N o . 2 ) " 
Omit from Form 7 " ( N o . 2 ) " 
Omit from Form 8 " ( N o . 2 ) " 
Omit from Form 9 " ( N o . 2 ) " 
Omit from Form 1 0 " ( N o . 2 ) " 
Omit from Form 11 " ( N o . 2 ) " 
Omit from Form 12 " ( N o . 2 ) " 
Omit from Form 13 " ( N o . 2 ) " 
Omit from Form 1 4 " ( N o . 2 ) " 
Omit from Form 15 " ( N o . 2 ) " 
Omit from Form ! 6 " ( N o . 2 ) " 
Omit from Form 17 " ( N o . 2 ) " 
Omit from Form 18 " ( N o . 2 ) " 
Omit from Form 1 9 " ( N o . 2 ) " 
Omit from Form 2 0 " 1 9 3 2 " 

The Court o f Petty Sessions (Solicitors' Costs) Rules are amended by omitting from Rule 3 
"two hundred and forty six in the Ordinance", and substituting "246 of the Court of Petty 
Sessions Ordinance 1930". 

FIRE B R I G A D E O R D I N A N C E 1957 

The Fire Brigade Regulations are amended by omitting from sub-regulation 3 ( 5 ) "Twenty 
dollars", and subst i tut ing"$20". 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



SCHEDULE-continued 

HOUSE O F A S S E M B L Y O R D I N A N C E 1936 

The House of Assembly (Election) Regulations are amended as set out in the following table: 

Provision Amendment 
Sub-regulation 3 ( 1) . . . . Omit the definition of "Commonweal th Electoral Act", 

substitute: 
" 'Commonweal th Electoral Act' means the Common
wealth Electoral Act 1918 ," 

Paragraph 4 A (1) (c) . . . . Omit "ten", substitute" 10" 
Paragraph 4 A (1 ) (d) . . . . Omit "ten", substitute " 10" 
Sub-regulation 27 ( I ) . . . . Omit " f i v e " and " ten" , substitute " 5 " and " 1 0 " 

respectively 
Sub-regulation 27 (2 ) . . . . Omit "Twelve", substitute " 12" 
Regulation 28 Omit "seven" and "twenty-one", substitute " 7 " and " 2 1 " 

respectively 
Sub-regulation 36 (5 ) . . . . Omit" 1918- 1973" 
Sub-regulation 38 (4 ) . . . . Omit "Commonwealth", substitute "Australian" 
Sub-regulation 41 (1 ) . . . . Omit "Ten dollars", substitute "$ 10" 
Regulation 58 Omit "Twenty dollars", substitute " $ 2 0 " 
Regulation 61 O m i t " ( l ) " 
Sub-regulation 6 6 A (2 ) . . . . Omit "Two dollars", substitute " $ 2 " 
Sub-regulation 6 6 A (4) . . . . Omit "Two dollars" and "Ten dollars", substitute "$2 " 

and " $ 1 0 " respectively 
Paragraph 6 6 B (a) Omit "Two dollars", substitute"$2 " 
Paragraph 71 (b) Omit"six", substitute"6" 
Paragraph 71 (c) Omit " A u s t r a l i a " , substitute " C o m m o n w e a l t h of 

Australia" 
Paragraph 71 (e) Omit "Government", substitute "Commonwealth" 

LEASES O R D I N A N C E 1918 

The Leases Regulations are amended as set out in the following table: 

Provision A mendment 
Regulation 1 O m i t " 1 9 2 9 " 
Regulation 3 Omit "Seat of Government Acceptance Act" from the 

. definition of "Land", substitute "Seat of Government Ac
ceptance Act 1922" 
Omit definition of "the Regulations" 

Sub-regulation 5 A (1 ) . . . . Omit"fifty",substitute"50" 
Sub-regulation 5 A (2 ) . . . . Omit "ninety-nine", substitute " 9 9 " 
Regulation 10 Omit "the Regulations", substitute "these Regulations" 
Regulation 15 Omit "the Regulations", substitute "these Regulations" 
Regulation 22 Omit "the Regulations", substitute "these Regulations" 
Regulation 23 Omit "thirty", substitute " 3 0 " 
Sub-regulation 24 ( 1) . . . . Omit "five", substitute " 5 " 
Sub-regulation 25 (2) . . . . Omit "ninety-nine", substitute " 9 9 " 

MOTOR TRAFFIC O R D I N A N C E 1936 

The Motor Omnibus Regulations are amended as set out in the following table: 

Provision Amendment 
Regulation 4 Repeal 
Sub-regulation 15 (2) . . . . Omit "two", substitute"2" 
Paragraph 33 (a) Omit "sixteen ". substitute " 16 " 
Sub-regulation 36 ( 1) . . . . Omit "twelve", substitute " 12 " 
Sub-regulation 38 ( 1) . . . . Omit "three", substitute "3 " 
Sub-regulation 40 (3 ) . . . . Omit"three". substitute"3" 
Sub-regulation 40 (4) . . . . Omit "fifty", substitute " 5 0 " 
Sub-regulation 40 (5 ) . . . . Omit "fifty", substitute " 5 0 " 
Sub-regulation 48 (2 ) . . . . Omit "Dogs Registration Ordinance 1926-1967". substitute 

"Dog Control Ordinance 1975 or deemed to be registered 
under that Ordinance" 

Sub-regulation 58 (3 ) . . . . Omit "five", substitute " 5 " 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



SCHEDULE-continued 

Provision Amendment 
Sub-regulation 78 (2) . . . . Omit "Dogs Registration Ordinance 1926-1967", substitute 

"Dog Control Ordinance 1975 or deemed to be registered 
under that Ordinance" 

Regulation83 Omit"seven", substitute " 7 " 
Paragraph 87 (b) Omit "three", substitute " 3 " 
Sub-regulation 93 (2) . . . . Omit "six inches", substitute " 15 centimetres" 
Regulation 97 Omit "Twenty dollars", substitute " $ 2 0 " 
The First Schedule Omit the heading "The First Schedule", substitute "First 

Schedule" 
Omit "Motor Traffic Ordinance 1932-1933" (wherever 
occurring), substitute "Motor Traffic Ordinance 1936" 

The Motor Traffic Regulations are amended as set out in the following table: 
Provision Amendment 
Regulation 23 Omit "three", substitute " 3 " 
Regulation 30 Omit "Twenty dollars", substitute " $ 2 0 " 

MOTOR OMNIBUS SERVICES ORDINANCE 1955 
The Motor Omnibus Fares Regulations are amended as set out in the following table: 
Provision Amendment 
Regulation3 From the definition o f ' t h e full fare"omit "or 5" 
Sub-regulation 10 (1) . . . . O m i t " 5 . " 

NURSES REGISTRATION ORDINANCE 1933 

The Nursing Regulations are amended as set out in the following table: 

Provision Amendment 
Sub-regulation 3 (3) Omit "seven", substitute"?" 
Regulation4 Omit"follow". substitute"follows" 
Sub-regulation 5 (1 ) Omit "one dollar", substitute "$ 1" 
Paragraph 7 (b) Omit "three", substitute " 3 " 
Paragraph 7 (d) Omif'forty", substitute " 4 0 " 
Sub-paragraph 8 (b) (i) . . . Omit "nine", substitute " 9 " 
Sub-paragraph 8 (b) (ii) . . . Omit "eighteen", substitute" 18" 
Paragraph 8 (c) Omit "ten", "five" and "one hundred", substitute "10" . 

" 5 " a n d " 100" respectively 
Paragraph 8 (g) Omit "two", substitute " 2 " 
Paragraph 8 ( h ) Omit "twenty " (thrice occurring), substitute " 2 0 " 

Omit "ten", substitute " 1 0 " 
Sub-paragraph 9 (b) (i) . . . Omif ' s ix" . substitute'^" 
Sub-paragraph 9 (b) (ii) . . . Omit"two". substitute'^" 
Paragraph 9 (c ) Omit "twenty", substitute " 2 0 " 
Paragraph 9 ( e ) Omit "three", substitute "3 " 
Paragraph 10 ( b ) Omit "one hundred", substitute " 100" 
Paragraph 10 ( d ) O m i t " t w o " , subs t i tu te"2" 
Paragraph l l A ( a ) Omit " t w o " and "four", substitute " 2 " and " 4 " respect

ively 
Paragraph l l A ( b ) Omit " t w o " and "four", substitute " 2 " and " 4 " respect

ively 
Sub-paragraph 12 ( 1) (a) . . . Omit "seventeen", substitute " 17" 
Sub-paragraph 12 ( 1) (b) . . . Omit "twenty". substitutc"20" 
Sub-paragraph 12 ( 1) (d) . . . Omit "two", substitute "2 " 
Regulation 13 . . . . . . . . Omif ' three". substitute"3" 
Regulation 15 Omit "two", substitute " 2 " 
Regulation 20 Omit "twelve", substitute " 1 2 " 
Sub-regulation 22 ( a) . . . . Omit "seven ". substitute "7 " 
Regulation 23 Omit "one dollar", substitute "$ 1" 

Omit "fifty", substitute " 5 0 " 
Regulation 25 Omit "two", substitute " 2 " 
Sub-regulation 27 (2 ) . . . . Omit "one dollar", substitute " $ 1 " 
Regulation 29 Omit " T w o " and "six", substitute "2 "and " 6 " respectively 
Paragraph 33 (o) Omit "three", substitute " 3 " 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



SCHEDULE-continued 
Provision Amendment 
Regulation 34 Omit "ten", substitute" 10" 
Sub-paragraph 39 (b ) (i) . . . Omit "two", substitute " 2 " 
Sub-paragraph 39 (c) (ii) . . . Omit "twenty-four", substitute " 2 4 " 
Regulation40 Omit "ten", substitute" 10" 
Regulation41 Omit"clause", substitute "regulation" 
Regulation49 Omit "ten", substitute " 10" 
Regulation 52 Omit "fifteen", substitute" 15" 
Regulation 54 Omit "seven", substitute " 7 " 

PLANT DISEASES O R D I N A N C E 1934 

The Plant Diseases Regulations are amended as set out in the following table: 

Provision Amendment 

Sub-regulation 9 (7) Omit"ninety-five", substitute"95" 
Sub-regulation 17 (2 ) . . . . Omit"ten"(whereveroccurring), substitute" 10" 
Sub-regulation 17 (3 ) . . . . Omit "ten", substitute " 10" 

Omit" Ii fty ", substitute " 50 " 
Omit "thirty", substitute " 3 0 " 

Sub-regulation 17 (4 ) . . . . Omit "fifty", substitute " 5 0 " 
Sub-regulation 17 (7 ) . . . . Omit"ten", substitute" 10" 

Omit"fifteen", substitute" 15" 
Sub-regulation 17 (8 ) . . . . Omit "thirty", substitute " 3 0 " 
Paragraph 36 (2 ) ( a ) . . . . Omit "ten", substitute" 10" 
Paragraph 36 (2 ) (c) . . . . Omit "thirty-six square inches" and "two feet", substitute 

" 1.25 sq. metres" and "60 cms" respectively 
Sub-paragraph 37 (1 ) ( a ) ( i ) . . Omit "seven", substitute " 7 " 
Sub-paragraph 37 (1 ) ( a ) (ii) Omit "three", substitute " 3 " 
Sub-paragraph 37 (1 ) ( a ) (iii) Omit "three", substitute " 3 " 
Paragraph 37 ( 3 A ) ( a ) . . . . Omit"ten".substitute" 10" 
Sub-paragraph 37 ( 3 A ) (c) ( i ) Omit "thirty-six square inches" and "two feet", substitute 

" 1.25 sq. metres" and "60 cms" respectively 

POISONS A N D D A N G E R O U S D R U G S ORDINANCE 1933 

The Poisons Regulations are amended as set out in the following table: 

Provision Amendment 

Part II Omit the heading "PART I I - S A L E O F POISONS A N D 

P O I S O N O U S S U B S T A N C E S " 

Part III Omit the heading "PART I I I - T H E S A L E O F M E T H Y L A T E D 

S P I R I T " 

Part I V Omit the heading "PART I V - T H E S A L E S OF N A R C O T I C 

D R U G S , B I O L O G I C A L P R E P A R A T I O N S A N D R E S T R I C T E D 

S U B S T A N C E S " 

Paragraph 13 (2) (b) . . . . Omit "three", substitute " 3 " 
Paragraph 13 (2 ) (e ) . . . . Omit"three", substitute " 3 " 
Paragraph 13 (3 ) (e ) . . . . Omit "six", substitute " 6 " 
Paragraph 16B (1) (c) . . . . Omit"five", substitute " 5 " 
Paragraph 22 ( a ) Omit"twelve", substitute" 12" 
Regulation23 Omit "two "(wherever occurring), substitute"2" 

PUBLIC HEALTH ORDINANCE 1928 

The Public Health (General Sanitation) Regulations are amended as set out in the following table: 

Provision Amendment 

Regulation4 Omit the definition of "the City Area ". substitute: 
" 'the City Area' means the City Area as defined in the City 
Area Leases Ordinance 1936:" 

Sub-regulation 7 (3 ) Omit " t en" and "five", substitute " 1 0 " and " 5 " respect
ively 

Regulation23 Omit "seven", substitute " 7 " 
Paragraph 25 ( 2 ) ( b) . . . . Omit"ten"(whereveroccurring), substitute" 10" 
Sub-regulation 25 (8 ) . . . . Omit "Canberra Building Regulations", substitute "Build

ing Ordinance 1972" 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



SCHEDULE-continued 

Provision A mendment 
Paragraph 34 (b) Omit "sixteen", substitute " 16" 
Regulation 35 Omit "one hundred dollars" and "two dollars", substitute 

"$ 100 " and "$2 " respectively 

RABBIT DESTRUCTION ORDINANCE 1919 

The Rabbit Destruction Regulations are amended as set out in the following table: 

Provision Amendment 

Regulation 3 Repeal 
Sub-regulation 5 ( 1) Omit "One pound", substitute " $ 2 " 
Regulation 7 Omit "Ten shillings", substitute " $ l " 
Regulation 13 Omit"seven", substitute " 7 " 
Regulation24 O m i f ' T e n pounds", substitute " $ 2 0 " 
Regulation25 Omit"Ten shillings", substitute "$ I " 

STOCK O R D I N A N C E 1934 

The Stock Regulations are amended as set out in the following table: 

Provision Amendment 

Regulation 2 Repeal 
Sub-regulation 4 (2 ) Omit "Twenty pounds". substitute"$40" 
Regulation6 O m i f F o r m 3 " . substitute "Schedule 1" 
Regulation 8 Omit "Two shillings and sixpence", substitute "25 cents" 
Sub-regulation 9 (1) Omit "Five pounds" and "twenty-one", substitute " $ 1 0 " 

and "21 "respectively 
Omif 'Form 4", substitute "Schedule 2 " 

Sub-regulation 9 (3) Omit "seven", substitute " 7 " 
Sub-regulation 14 ( 1) . . . . Omit "First Schedule", substitute "Schedule 3 " 
Paragraph 22 (b) Omit "three-eighth of an inch" and "a quarter of an inch", 

substitute " 10 m m " and "7 m m " respectively 
Regulation26 Omit "Ten pounds", substitute " $ 2 0 " 
The Schedules Omit the First and Second Schedules and substitute the fol

lowing Schedules: 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



S C H E D U L E - c o n t i n u e d 
o 
c 
o O> s 3 
6 0 

0 0 
c 

•3 c 
U 
L-
CS 
> , 

<S 
c 
E 8 -j 

< 

— o 
u 7 ^ 
j K o 
3 B , 
H ^ Ui 

5 * S 

c 
" C 
ha 

H 
u 
c 
i— 
v. 
3 < 

Pa
rt

ic
ul

at
s 

of
 M

on
ey

s c
ha

rg
ed

 o
n 

th
e 

H
ol

di
ng

, e
xc

lu
si

ve
 o

f 
R

at
es

 

s s j R y jo -uisnpxa 'predun 
ims »2iBq3 jo junoiuy 

Pa
rt

ic
ul

at
s 

of
 M

on
ey

s c
ha

rg
ed

 o
n 

th
e 

H
ol

di
ng

, e
xc

lu
si

ve
 o

f 
R

at
es

 

Pa
ym

en
ts

 m
ad

e 
in

 r
es

pe
ct

 o
f 

C
ha

rg
e 

ptBj junoiuy IA 

Pa
rt

ic
ul

at
s 

of
 M

on
ey

s c
ha

rg
ed

 o
n 

th
e 

H
ol

di
ng

, e
xc

lu
si

ve
 o

f 
R

at
es

 

Pa
ym

en
ts

 m
ad

e 
in

 r
es

pe
ct

 o
f 

C
ha

rg
e 

lU?UtXBjJO 3JBQ 

Pa
rt

ic
ul

at
s 

of
 M

on
ey

s c
ha

rg
ed

 o
n 

th
e 

H
ol

di
ng

, e
xc

lu
si

ve
 o

f 
R

at
es

 

Pa
ym

en
ts

 m
ad

e 
in

 r
es

pe
ct

 o
f 

C
ha

rg
e 

JJOOQ qsB^ ' O I J O J 

Pa
rt

ic
ul

at
s 

of
 M

on
ey

s c
ha

rg
ed

 o
n 

th
e 

H
ol

di
ng

, e
xc

lu
si

ve
 o

f 
R

at
es

 

a 8 j B q 3 j o i u n o t u v 

Pa
rt

ic
ul

at
s 

of
 M

on
ey

s c
ha

rg
ed

 o
n 

th
e 

H
ol

di
ng

, e
xc

lu
si

ve
 o

f 
R

at
es

 

3[qB^Bd junoiuy woq^v 
oi pus ujoq^ \q pus 'aieQ 

pus p3iB3J3 a&ieqj M O H 

ana IPS S 3 i B >! J° lunotuv 

idi.i.i.iy j o joquiiijs, 

Pa
ym

en
ts

 o
f 

R
at

es
 m

ad
e 

j(oog q s B 3 'oqoj 

Pa
ym

en
ts

 o
f 

R
at

es
 m

ad
e 

junoiuy IA 

Pa
ym

en
ts

 o
f 

R
at

es
 m

ad
e 

3JBQ 

aiqcXBj SSIB^I j o junoiuy l^iox 

rtdddy 
uo luauisssssv j o junomy |*1<>X 

*"q juauissassy jo lunoiuy I^)oj_ M 

dnojQ B utqjiM J O aouaj j o o i d 
- l i q q s j B \u pasopus E3jy j o n.xK.ij 

ui saiey j o uopjnpaQ j o junoiuy 
IA 

St
oc

k 
an

d 
C

ur
re

nt
 R

at
e 

L
ar

ge
 S

to
ck

 
an

d 
Sh

ee
p 

W B y j o junoiuy 

St
oc

k 
an

d 
C

ur
re

nt
 R

at
e 

L
ar

ge
 S

to
ck

 
an

d 
Sh

ee
p 

pB3H J-Xl 
JB daaqs 

St
oc

k 
an

d 
C

ur
re

nt
 R

at
e 

L
ar

ge
 S

to
ck

 
an

d 
Sh

ee
p 

pB»HJ»d 
JB i p o i s ^ j e q 

puBq iBjni|n3u3v ueqi wqio puBT 
jo XipedB3 3UIXJJB3 passsssy 

A
re

a 
of

 
H

ol
di

ng
 ptiBi j sq io 

he
c

ta
re

s 

A
re

a 
of

 
H

ol
di

ng
 

pUBT iBJminDu^v 

he
c

ta
re

s 

S3JByjOSJB3JJV 

O
cc

up
ie

r o
f 

H
ol

di
ng

 H
ol

di
ng

 
an

d 
A

dd
re

ss
 

O
cc

up
ie

r o
f 

H
ol

di
ng

 

N
am

e 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



SCHEDULE-continued 

S C H E D U L E 2 Regulation 9 

Slock Ordinance 1934 

NOTICE OF A P P E A L A G A I N S T A S S E S S M E N T 

To the Minister of State for the Capital Territory 
I, the undersigned , of , being 

aggrieved by the amount determined by the Controller of Stock 
as payable by me under the rate levied in pursuance of the provisions of the Stock Ordinance 
1934 in respect o f the holding mentioned hereunder, do hereby appeal against such assess
ment, on the ground that 
and do hereby lodge the prescribed deposit of $ 10. 

S i g n a t u r e -

occupier of Holding 

Postal A d d r e s s -

Dated at this day of 
19 

(Holding referred to) 
Note. A copy of this Notice of Appeal must be forwarded by the appellant to the Controller of Stock on the day this appeal is made. 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



S C H E D U L E - c o n t i n u e d 

S C H E D U L E 3 Regulation 14 

N A M E , SHAPE, A N D SIZE O F SHEEP E A R - M A R K S 

Length Width Length Width 
Shape of not ex- not ex- Shape of not ex- not ex-

Name of mark mark ceeding— ceeding- Name of mark mark ceeding- ceeding-

The bayonet | 25mm 13mm The oblong . . j"™ j ^ ^ ^ , 1 9 m m 13mm 

club . . | 2 2 " 1 6 " ° V a l ' ' | " " j ^ ^ V ^ 1 3 " 1 9 " 

fork . . . f - \ 19 „ 13 „ bolt . . . r 7 „ 19 „ 

halfhaif- , 19 „ 10 „ triangle , 19 „ 16 „ 
penny I and 

I swallow y 

hole . . | " " " " ' ° ° 8 | 44 „ 3 „ 

note . . [ 25 „ 13 „ „ L . . . 1 19 „ 3 „ 

shears . . | ^ 1 9 •• 1 6 " „ T . . . [ 19 „ 3 „ 

slash . . | ^ " ' ^ ^ 32 „ 2 „ „ F . . . [ 19 „ 3 „ 

" ' ' ' [ " " 2 " .. H . . . C3>22 •• 3 •• 
swallow- j 16 „ 19 „ „ M . . . | 1 9 •• 1 3 •• 

tail ' — 

thistle . . [ ^ - - ^ 19 „ 13 „ „ N . . . \ ^ ^ ^ > 22 „ 3 „ 

mangle } 16 ., 16 „ „ P . . . [ 3 ^ > 9 •• '3 .. 

W . . . I 19 „ 19 „ „ S . . . . [ ' ^ ^ y > 1 9 •• 3 •• 

diamond | j ^ * * 16 „ 16 „ inverted 19 „ 13 „ 

M 

cross . . [ 1 9 ••
 3 •• n o l c n L « ^ ^ ^ 1 9 •• 3 8 " 

heart . . | 19 „ 19 „ pick . . . [ > ^ ^ > 1 9 •• 3 

half r ^ ^ ^ > 19 „ 3 „ „ stamp . . [ 1 9 •• 1 3 •• 

diamond 

double L | | * ^ ^ > | 1 9 •• 3 " C a S I ' e ' [ 1 9 •• 1 3 •• 

„ primrose [ >9 - I 9 •• noteand \ 22 „ 13 „ 

slit 

half cleaver I [^^^--"'> |19 . j 13 „ [ j star . ,| [ 1 19 . | 19 ., 
Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



S C H E D U L E - c o n t i n u e d 

Length Width Length Width 
Shape of not ex- not ex- Shape of not ex- not ex-

Name of mark mark ceeding- ceeding- Name of mark mark ceeding- ceeding-

The crunk . I" ^ ^ . ^ 19mm 3 mm The spur r* ~ •—^_ 14 mm 13 mm 

VS> I > 
diamond «- 19 ., lh .. .. swallow 19 .. 13 .. 

and slash • • S tail and f ^ " * * v . 

' ^ * I > 
Y | II .. 3 .. swallow 19 .. 13 .. 

I punch * ^ 
hole ' 

spanner I 19 .. 3 .. letter U . w 1° .. 13 .. 

saw frame | 19 In parallelo- r q ^ , . 13 19 

notes con- f 22 .. 13 .. ., rowlock , 19 3 

joined fl^> 

crucible | 1 9 •• -1 •• fork and ( 19 .. 3 .. 

I ^ n°" I ^ 

crook . | 1 9 " 3 " g " " r d C^^^^ " ^ 

haltcircle j 13 ,. 3 .. hall- I 19 ., 13 .. 

i — ^ Z"y
 I > ^ 

roundslash j^^^^^> 22 .. 3 .. oval and j ^ ^ * * ^ " " 
w ^ 1 9 " 3 " B R O L D | ~ \ J ^ > 1 6 3 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au



SCHEDULE-continued 

WORKMEN'S COMPENSATION ORDINANCE 1951 
The Workmen's Compensation Regulations are amended as set out in the following table: 
Provision Amendment 
Regulation 2 Repeal, substitute: 

" 2 . In these Regulations, 'the Ordinance' means the 
Workmen's Compensation Ordinance 1951." 

Regulation3 Omit "Form A", substitute "Form 1 in the Schedule" 
Regulation 4 Omit "Form B", substitute "Form 2 in the Schedule" 
Regulation6 Omit "Form C", substitute "Form 3 in the Schedule" 
Regulation 7 Omit"clause 9" , substitute "paragraph 10" 

Omi t" two" , subst i tute"2" 
Regulation8 Omit "Fifty pounds", substitute " $ 1 0 0 " 
Regulation9 Omit "Fifty pounds", substitute " $ 1 0 0 " 
Regulation 12 Omit "Declarations under these Regulations may be 

made before any", substitute "The truth of the state
ments made in a claim referred to in regulation 3 or 4 
shall be declared before o n e " 

The Schedule Omit head ing " T H E S C H E D U L E " , substi tute 
" S C H E D U L E " 
Omit from Form A "FORM A", substitute " FORM 1" 
Omit from Form A " 1946" (wherever occurring), sub
stitute " 1 9 5 1 " 
Omit from Form B"FORM B", substitute "FORM 2 " 
Omit from Form B " 1946" (wherever occurring), substi
tu te" 1951" 

Omit Form C, substitute the following form: 

FORM 3 

AUSTRALIAN CAPITAL TERRITORY 
Workmen's Compensation Ordinance 1951 

REPORT OF MEDICAL REFEREE OR MEDICAL PRACTITIONER 
I, , *a Medical Referee appointed under the Workmen's Compen
sation Ordinance 1951 or *a duly qualified medical practitioner, have this day examined 

of , a claimant for compensation. 
On examination— 

I find that the claimant is suffering from 
The above-mentioned condition is the result of 

The claimant is thereby incapacitated at present to the extent of per cent of total in
capacity at his usual occupation and per cent of total incapacity in the general labour mar
ket. The claimant is fit to undertake employment in such occupations as— 
In my opinion the claimant *has/*has not previously suffered from the above-mentioned 
disease. 

The disease *is/is not of such a nature as is contracted by a gradual process. 

General remarks— 
*Medical Referee. 
'Medical Practitioner. 

Date / /19 
* Strike out whichever is inapplicable 

Fully describe claimant's condition 
State whether accident or disease 

N O T E 
1. Notified in the Commonwealth of Australia Gazette on 29 November 1979. 

Authorised by the ACT Parliamentary Counsel—also accessible at www.legislation.act.gov.au


		(02)+61 2 6205 3700
	2012-05-09T11:40:03+1000
	Canberra
	ACT Parliamentary Counsel
	Document is authorised




